
AGENDA
TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF TARBORO, NC

REGULAR MEETING HELD AT 7:00 PM, MONDAY, FEBRUARY 8,
2021

IN THE COUNCIL ROOM, TOWN HALL, TARBORO, NC

1. MEETING CALLED TO ORDER BY THE MAYOR

PLEASE TURN CELL PHONES OFF

2. INVOCATION

3. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

4. APPROVAL OF AGENDA BY COUNCIL

5. PRESENTATION BY COUNCIL

(1) National FFA Week Proclamation

6. REQUESTS AND PETITIONS OF CITIZENS

(Five minute time limit per person)

7. MATTERS SCHEDULED FOR PUBLIC HEARING

Conditional Use Permit - 20-01 - Residential Subdivision - to consider an application from
Charles Ainsley for the construction of a residential subdivision to be located on the south
side of W. Northern Boulevard between Main Street and Western Boulevard.

8. TOWN MANAGERS RECOMMENDATIONS

Consent Items

(1) Approve minutes of the January 11, 2021 regular meeting.
(2) 2020 Tax Levy Memo
(3) Tax Collector's Report

Action Items

(4) Disposition of Town-owned Property - Confederate Monument
(5) Piedmont Natural Gas Rectifier Project Compensation and Easement
(6) Amend Contract - Auditing Services
(7) CDBG-NR Bid Award
(8) Budget Amendment - Insurance Claim
(9) Appointment for February - Tarboro-Edgecombe Airport Authority
(10) Appointment for February - Tarboro-Edgecombe Arts Commission

9. OTHER REPORTS

A. Town Manager



B. Town Attorney

C. Council Members

10. ADJOURNMENT





Application No.    CU-20-01 
 

TOWN OF TARBORO 
 

CONDITIONAL OR SPECIAL USE PERMIT 
BOARD CONSIDERATION WORKSHEET 

 
 
Applicant:  Charles Ainsley 

Property Location:  South side of W. Northern Blvd. between Main Street and Western 

Boulevard.  The acreage is 3.1.  

 

Proposed Use of Property:  Residential Subdivision  

I. COMPLETENESS OF APPLICATION 
 
 [  ] The application is complete. 
 [  ] The application is incomplete in the following ways: 
 ___________________________________________________________________ 
 ___________________________________________________________________ 
 ___________________________________________________________________ 
 
II. COMPLIANCE WITH ORDINANCE REQUIREMENTS 
 
 [  ] The application complies with all applicable requirements of the land-use ordinance. 
 [  ] The application is not in compliance with the following requirements of the land-use 

ordinance: 
 _____________________________________________________________________  
 _____________________________________________________________________  
 _____________________________________________________________________  
 
III. GRANTING THE APPLICATION 
 
 [  ] The application is granted, subject to the following conditions: 

(1) The applicant shall complete the development strictly in accordance with the plans 
submitted to and approved by this Board, a copy of which is filed in the office of the 
Building Inspector. 

  (2) If any of the conditions affixed hereto or any part thereof is held invalid or void, then 
this permit shall be void and of no effect. 

 ________________________________________________________________________  
 ________________________________________________________________________  
 ________________________________________________________________________  
  
IV. DENYING THE APPLICATION 
 
 [  ] The application is denied because it is incomplete for the reasons set forth above in 

Section I. 
 [  ] The application is denied because it does not comply with the ordinance requirements 

set forth above in Section II. 
 [  ] The application is denied because, if completed as proposed, the development probably: 
 
  [  ] Will materially endanger the public health or safety for the following reasons: 
 _______________________________________________________________________  
 _______________________________________________________________________  
 _______________________________________________________________________  
 
  [  ] Will substantially injure the value of adjoining or abutting property for the following 

reasons: __________________________________________________________   
 _______________________________________________________________________ 
 _______________________________________________________________________ 
 
  [  ] Will not be in harmony with the area in which it is to be located for the following 

reasons: ___________________________________________________________  
 ________________________________________________________________________  
 ________________________________________________________________________ 
 
  [  ] Will not be in general conformity with the Land Use Plan, Thoroughfare Plan, or other 

plans officially adopted by the Town Council for the following reasons: ___________  
 _________________________________________________________________________  





I, Catherine Grimm, Secretary of the Town of Tarboro’s Planning Board and Zoning 

Commission, in accordance with North Carolina G.S. 160-A-384, hereby certify that the attached 

list of property owners were mailed notices by first class mail of this public hearing scheduled 

for February 8, 2021 at 7:00 PM in the Council Chambers of the Town Hall regarding the request 

for a conditional use permit for 3.1 acres located on the south side of W. Northern Boulevard 

between Main Street and Western Boulevard to be a residential subdivision. 

 

       ______________________________________ 

       Catherine Grimm 

       Secretary 

  



 

 

 

Parcel ID# Name Address 

4729923262 Newness of Life Christian 

Church Trustee 

215 Barrington Drive 

Tarboro, NC 27886 

4729918897 S & J Auto Sales, Inc. 213-B E. Hope Lodge St 

Tarboro, NC 27886 

4729919555 PRA Ventures, LLC 101 N. Main Street 

Tarboro, NC 27886 

4729917533 Emma Jean Darden  200 Hasting Street 

Tarboro, NC 27886 

4729916530 Pearl Driver Dixon 202 Hasting Street 

Tarboro, NC 27886 

4729915550 Deborah Suggs Bellamy 204 Hasting Street 

Tarboro, NC 27886 

4729914479 Brenda Harris 206 Hasting Street 

Tarboro, NC 27886 

4729913498 Melvin Ray Kearney, Sr. 208 Hasting Street 

Tarboro, NC 27886 

4729913407 Toney Curtis Cofield 210 Hasting Street 

Tarboro, NC 27886 

 



NORTH CAROLINA 
 

EDGECOMBE COUNTY 
 

 

TOWN OF TARBORO 
 

CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT GRANTED 
 

 

 On the date(s) listed below, the TOWN COUNCIL of the TOWN OF TARBORO met and held a 

public hearing to consider the following application: 

 
APPLICANT: 

CHARLES AINSLEY 
OWNER: 

CHARLES AINSLEY 
PROPERTY LOCATION (Street Address): 

W. NORTHERN BOULEVARD 
TAX MAP, BLOCK, LOT(S): 

PARCEL # 4729-91-5742 
PROPOSED USE OF PROPERTY: 

RESIDENTIAL SUBDIVISION 

 
TARBORO LAND USE ORDINANCE USE CATEGORY: 

GENERAL RESIDENTIAL (GR-5) 
MEETING DATE(S): 

FEBRUARY 8, 2021 

 

Having heard all the evidence and arguments presented at the hearing, the Council finds that the 

application is complete, that the application complies with all of the applicable requirements of the 

Tarboro Unified Development Ordinance (UDO) for the development proposed, and that therefore 

the application to make use of the above described property for the purpose indicated is hereby 

approved, subject to all applicable provisions of the UDO and the following conditions: 

 

 1) The applicant shall complete the development strictly in accordance with the plans 

submitted to and approved by this Council, a copy of which is filed in the Tarboro Town Hall.  Any 

deviations from or changes in these plans must be pointed out specifically to the administrator in 

writing and specific written approval obtained as provided in Section 65 of the UDO. 

 

 2) If any of the conditions affixed hereto or any part thereof shall be held invalid or 

void, then this permit shall be void and of no effect. 

 

[PLEASE NOTE: INSERT ADDITIONAL CONDITIONS HERE.] 

 

 This permit shall automatically expire within two years of the date of issuance if the use has 

not commenced or less than 10 percent (10%) of total cost of construction has been completed or 

there has been non-compliance with any other requirements of the Tarboro UDO. 

 

 All street construction on those streets proposed for acceptance by the Town of Tarboro 

shall be certified by an engineer.  Engineering certification is the inspection by the developer's 

engineer of the street's subgrade, base material, asphalt paving, sidewalks and curb and gutter, when 

used.  The developer's engineer shall be responsible for reviewing all compaction tests that are 

required for streets to be dedicated to the town.  The developer's engineer shall certify that all work 

has been constructed to the town's construction specifications. 

 

 If this permit authorizes development on a tract of land in excess of one acre, nothing 

authorized by the permit may be done until the property owner properly executes and returns to the 

Town of Tarboro the attached acknowledgment of the issuance of this permit so that the town may 

have it recorded in the Edgecombe County Registry. 



TOWN OF TARBORO 

CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT (con’t) 
Page #2 

 

 

NORTH CAROLINA 

 

EDGECOMBE COUNTY 

 

 IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Town of Tarboro has caused this permit to be issued in its 

name, and the undersigned being all of the property above described, do hereby accept this 

Conditional Use Permit, together with all its conditions, as binding upon them and their successors 

in interest. 

 

 

THE TOWN OF TARBORO 

 

ATTEST: 

 

___________________________(SEAL) BY____________________________ 

Town Clerk Town Manager 

 

 I, _________________, a Notary Public in and for said County and State, do hereby certify 

that Leslie M. Lunsford, Town Clerk for the Town of Tarboro, personally came before me this day 

and being by me duly sworn says each for himself that she knows the corporate seal of the Town of 

Tarboro and that the seal affixed to the foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of the Town of 

Tarboro, that Troy R. Lewis, Town Manager of said Town of Tarboro and Leslie M. Lunsford, 

Town Clerk for the Town of Tarboro subscribed their names thereto; that the corporate seal of the 

Town of Tarboro was affixed thereto, all by virtue of a resolution of the Town Council, and that 

said instrument is the act and deed of the Town of Tarboro. 

 

 IN WITNESS THEREOF, I have hereunto set by hand and notarial seal this the ____ day of 

__________, 20___. 

 

 

______________________________(SEAL) 

Notary Public 

My Commission Expires:___________________ 

 

I (We)___________________________________________, owner(s), do hereby acknowledge 

receipt of this Conditional Use Permit.  The undersigned owner(s) do further acknowledge that no 

work may be done pursuant to this permit except in accordance with all of its conditions and 

requirements and that this restriction shall be binding upon them and their successors in interest. 

 

 

Attest: _______________________________ 

 (Corporate Name) 

 

_____________________________(SEAL) BY_______________________________ 

Secretary President 

 

 

NORTH CAROLINA 
EDGECOMBE COUNTY  
 

 I,__________________________,a Notary Public of ___________County, N.C. do hereby 

certify that ______________________________appeared before me this day and being duly sworn 

says that he knows the common seal of _______________________________, and is acquainted 

with _____________________, who is president of said corporation and he 

________________________, who is secretary of said corporation, saw the said president sign the 

foregoing instrument and that he, _________________, secretary as aforesaid, affixed said seal of  



TOWN OF TARBORO 

CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT (con’t) 
Page #3 

 

 

said instrument and he, the said secretary, signed his name in attestation of execution of said 

instrument in the presence of said president of said corporation. 

 

 Witness my hand and notarial seal, this the ___ day of _________, 20___. 

 

______________________________ 

Notary Public 

 

My Commission Expires:______________ 

 

 

(Not valid until fully executed and recorded) 

 

 
STATE OF NORTH CAROLINA 
COUNTY OF EDGECOMBE 

 

The foregoing certificate(s) of__________________________________________Notary/Notaries 

Public of the designated governmental units (is) (are) certified to be correct. 

 

This the ___ day of _________________, A.D. 20___. 

 

 

__________________________________ By:__________________________________ 

Register of Deeds Assistant/Deputy Register of Deeds 

 

 

 

 

PREPARED BY: 
TOWN OF TARBORO 

500 MAIN STREET 

TARBORO, NORTH CAROLINA  27886 
 

 























MINUTES OF A REGULAR MEETING OF THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE
TOWN OF TARBORO, HELD AT 7:00 PM ON MONDAY, JANUARY 11, 2021 IN
THE COUNCIL ROOM, TOWN HALL, TARBORO, NORTH CAROLINA

MEMBERS PRESENT

Mayor Pitt
Councilman Woodard (Zoom)
Councilman Taylor 
Councilman Burnette
Councilman Brown 
Councilman Jenkins
Councilmember Jordan
Councilmember Bynum
Councilman Mayo

MEMBERS ABSENT

None.

ALSO PRESENT

Troy Lewis, Town Manager
Leslie Lunsford, Town Clerk
Chad Hinton, Town Attorney
 
 

1. MEETING CALLED TO ORDER BY THE MAYOR

2. INVOCATION

Councilman Taylor.

3. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

4. APPROVAL OF AGENDA BY COUNCIL

Agenda approved as presented.
John Jenkins made a motion, which was seconded by Tate Mayo and Passed, Motion.  

5. REQUESTS AND PETITIONS OF CITIZENS

None.

6. REPORTS OF BOARDS AND COMMISSIONS

(1) The Planning Director will present the Planning Board Report.

Catherine Grimm, Planning Director, provided background information.
 
Conditional Use Permit #20-01 - Residential Subdivision



 
Council called for a public hearing. 

Clarence Brown made a motion, which was seconded by Sabrina Bynum and ,
Motion.  

7. TOWN MANAGERS RECOMMENDATIONS

Consent Items

Consent Items approved as presented.
John Jenkins made a motion, which was seconded by Tate Mayo and Passed, Motion.  

(1) Approve minutes of the December 14, 2020 regular meeting.

(2) Tax Collector's Report

Action Items

(3) Disposition of Town-owned Property - Confederate Monument

Council voted to donate the Confederate Monument to Fort Branch after reviewing the
proposals. 
Othar Woodard made a motion, which was seconded by Deborah Jordan and Passed,
Motion.  Ayes: Brown, Burnette, Bynum, Jordan, Taylor, Woodard; Nays: Jenkins,
Mayo

(4) Bid Award - Public Safety Software

Council awarded the bid to CentralSquare Technologies for their bid amount of
$184,079.19 and authorized staff to complete the necessary upgrades. 
Clarence Brown made a motion, which was seconded by John Jenkins and Passed,
Motion.  

(5) Traffic Schedule-Parking

Council adopted a resolution amending the Traffic Schedule. 
Leo Taylor made a motion, which was seconded by Deborah Jordan and Passed,
Motion.  

(6) Appointment for February - Tarboro-Edgecombe Airport Authority

No action taken at this time. 

(7) Appointment for February - Tarboro-Edgecombe Arts Commission

No action taken at this time. 

8. OTHER REPORTS

A. Town Manager

(1) Discussion of Town Council Retreat

Troy Lewis recommended that Council not hold an in-person Council Retreat in
2021. He suggested that staff still prepare information for Council to be discussed



at the March Council Meeting. 
 
Council agreed. 

B. Town Attorney

None.

C. Council Members

Councilman Woodard - none. 
 
Councilman Taylor - none.
 
Councilman Mayo - none.     
 
Councilmember Jordan - asked if the Mayor or Manager had received a response from the
Attorney General's office regarding Suddenlink internet service.  Troy Lewis, not at this time. 
 
Councilman Jenkins -  none. 
 
Councilmember Bynum -  none. 
 
Councilman Burnette - none.
 
Councilman Brown - welcomed everyone back from the holidays. 

9. ADJOURNMENT

Meeting adjourned.  
John Jenkins made a motion, which was seconded by Tate Mayo and Passed, Motion.  



Town of Tarboro, North Carolina
Mayor and Council Communication 

Subject:  2020 Tax Levy Memo

Date:  2/8/2021

Memo Number:  21-06

The Schedule of 2020 Tax Levy Adjusted as of February 8, 2021, attached hereto, lists the
valuation and tax amount of seven (7) after lists and one (1) release. The release has been
approved by Edgecombe County Tax Assessor's Office.
 
It is recommended that Council:
 
1. Order the Tax Collector be charged with after lists 49 through 55 in the amount of $7180.35,
 
2. Enter into the minutes 2020 Tax Levy release number 15 in the amount of $35.16, and
 
3. Approve the Schedule of the 2020 Tax Levy Adjusted as of February 8, 2021, in the amount of
$3,485,327.31.        

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Upload Date Type
2020 Tay Levy Adjustment 2/1/2021 Cover Memo



VALUATIONS                  

Public

Service

Real Personal Companies Dog Tax Total GAP

Balance December 14, 2020 584,297,419 223,296,967 39,174,128 0 846,768,514 4,205,672

After list: 49 - 55 0 1,256,145 0 0 1,256,145 0

Less Releases:   15 0 0 0 0 0 (2,450)

Balance as of February 8, 2021 584,297,419 224,553,112 39,174,128 0 848,024,659 4,203,222

TAX CALCULATIONS                  

Real, Personal, & Late Listing

Pub. Ser. Co. Penalty Auto Tax Dog Tax Total GAP

Balance December 14, 2020 3,471,751.63 5,630.33  0.00 765.00 3,478,146.96 7,735.64

After list: 49 - 55 5,150.22 2,030.13 0.00 0.00 7,180.35 0.00

Less Releases:   15 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 (35.16)

Balance as of February 8, 2021 3,476,901.85 7,660.46 0.00 765.00 3,485,327.31 7,700.48

 

ITEMIZED RELEASES                  

Rel. Real, Personal & Late Listing

No. Name/Description Acct. No. Pub. Ser. Co. Penalty Auto Tax Dog Tax Total GAP

15 Melissa Jaye Williamson 9258 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 35.16

    vehicle registered in FL

    

Total Releases 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 35.16

TOWN OF TARBORO, NORTH CAROLINA
SCHEDULE OF 2020 TAX LEVY

February 8, 2021



TOWN OF TARBORO, NORTH CAROLINA
TAX COLLECTOR'S REPORT

For the Year Ended January 31, 2021

C O L L E C T I O N S

Levy Current Fiscal   This Fiscal Uncollected Collected
Year Year Charges   Month Year-To-Date Balance Percentage

2020 3,332,912.81 396,083.92 3,566,382.47 80,839.59 97.56%

2019 107,185.89 3,673.97 48,137.94 59,047.95 98.19%

2018 53,197.48 673.13 23,916.57 29,280.91 99.10%

2017 23,861.41 398.44 5,468.42 18,392.99 99.43%

2016 19,318.84 82.38 3,735.23 15,583.61 99.53%

2015 15,540.44 53.81 2,256.04 13,284.40 99.60%

2014 12,033.85 0.00 1,548.91 10,484.94 99.69%

2013 9,279.68 0.00 929.19 8,350.49 99.76%

2012 7,909.33 61.18 716.89 7,192.44 99.80%

2011 4,969.36 70.06 352.60 4,616.76 99.87%

2010 3,135.46 0.00 337.03 2,798.43 99.91%

Prior 7,776.79 0.00 331.43 7,445.36  -   

Subtotal 3,597,121.34 401,096.89 3,654,112.72 257,317.87

8,420.37 20,534.47  <== Interest on Taxes  

Net Tax Collections ==> 409,517.26 3,674,647.19

0.00 0.00  <== Beer & Wine Licenses  

TOTAL COLLECTED ==> 409,517.26 3,674,647.19

                        prepared by:  Leslie M. Lunsford, Collector of Revenue

  
 
 
 

2018 LEVY

2019 LEVY

2020 LEVY

THIS COMPARISON SHOWS THE STATUS OF 
TAX COLLECTIONS AT THIS SAME TIME
OF YEAR FOR PREVIOUS TAX LEVIES.



Town of Tarboro, North Carolina
Mayor and Council Communication 

Subject:  Disposition of Town-owned Property - Confederate Monument

Date:  2/8/2021

Memo Number:  21-07

At the January 11, 2021 Town Council Meeting, The Tarboro Town Council voted to convey the
Confederate Monument previously located on the Tarboro Town Common to The Fort Branch
Battlefield Commission, Inc.  Per North Carolina General Statute 160A-279, the attached
resolution outlines the terms of the conveyance including restrictions to ensure the Monument
continues to be used for a public purpose on private property.  Notice of the intent to adopt this
Resolution has appeared in the local newspaper.
 
It is recommended that Council adopt the attached resolution conveying the Confederate
Monument to The Fort Branch Battlefield Commission, Inc.  

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Upload Date Type
Resolution Approving Conveyance of Property to A
Nonprofit Organization 2/3/2021 Cover Memo



 
 
 

Resolution Approving Conveyance of Property to  
A Nonprofit Organization  
Pursuant to G.S. 160A-279 

 
WHEREAS, the Town of Tarboro owns a statue of a Confederate soldier and memorial stone 

statue base [hereafter the “Statue”], which after significant and considered public input, the Town 
Council has determined is no longer appropriate for prominent public display on Town property.  
Even so, the Town Council recognizes the historic and artistic value of the statue and desires the 
public to continue to access it on private lands; and 

 
WHEREAS, North Carolina General Statute § 160A-279 authorizes a city or county to convey 

real or personal property by private sale to a nonprofit corporation if the city or county is authorized 
by law to appropriate money to the corporation; and 

 
WHEREAS, North Carolina General Statute § 160A-488 authorizes a city or town to “establish 

and support museums, art galleries, arts centers, arts facilities, and arts programs and may 
appropriate funds to any such governmental agency, or to any such public or nonprofit private 
association, corporation or organization for the purpose of establishing and supporting such 
museums…”; and  

 
WHEREAS, the Town of Tarboro has sought proposals from any interested nonprofit willing 

to display the Statue and after receiving minimal interest, the Town negotiated with the Fort Branch 
Battlefield Commission, Inc.  [hereafter, Fort Branch] to convey the Statue to Fort Branch, in order 
that Fort Branch may conserve and display it for public viewing; and 

 
WHEREAS, the Statue will remain available for public use, observation and research because 

Fort Branch is a publicly accessible but privately funded nonprofit museum and is the historic site 
of a Confederate river fort at Hamilton, NC, about a thirty minute drive from Tarboro, and the 
display of Tarboro’s Confederate Statue at the Confederate fort will provide greater historical 
context to the public in studying the history of the Statue, the fort, and the contributions of the men 
and women of eastern North Carolina during the Civil War.  Additional information about the 
museum, its conservation of historic artifacts, public events, and activities can be found on their 
website at: www.fortbranchcivilwarsite.com; 

 
THEREFORE, THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF TARBORO RESOLVES 

THAT: 
 
1. The mayor of Tarboro is authorized to execute all documents necessary to convey fee simple 

defeasible title to the Confederate statue and memorial stone base, the same previously displayed 
on the Town Common of the Town of Tarboro.   

 
2. The consideration for the conveyance is the following set of conditions, covenants, and 

restrictions, which shall be incorporated in the bill of sale given by the Town to Fort Branch: 
 

a. Fort Branch will carefully and respectfully take possession of and remove the statue from 
the Town’s storage site and transport the Statue to Fort Branch at its own cost, and at no 
cost or liability to the Town of Tarboro. 

b. Fort Branch agrees to fully indemnify and hold harmless the Town of Tarboro from any 
damage or injury to person or property proximately caused by the officers, directors, 
employees, contractors, or other agents of Fort Branch during the removal and 
transportation of the Statue from Town property.   

c. Fort Branch will preserve, conserve, and maintain the Statue in as good condition as is 
today and respectfully display the Statue on its property in a manner that it is regularly 
accessible to the public for viewing and study.   

d. Upon the dissolution of Fort Branch as a nonprofit corporation, or in the event it is no 
longer able to preserve the Statute or grant access to the Statue to the public on private 



property, then in such event, Fort Branch agrees to convey the Statue to another 
nonprofit capable of maintaining the Statute and its continued public display on private 
property at a place regularly accessible by the public on private property.  

 
3. The town clerk shall publish a notice summarizing the contents of this resolution, and the 

property may be sold at any time after 10 days after publication of the notice. 
 
Adopted this the ____ day of ______, 2021. 
 
 
        

______________________________ 
 [Clerk Seal]       Mayor 
 
 

 
 



Town of Tarboro, North Carolina
Mayor and Council Communication 

Subject:  Piedmont Natural Gas Rectifier Project Compensation and Easement

Date:  2/8/2021

Memo Number:  21-08

Piedmont Natural Gas is in need of installing cathodic protection, via a Rectifier, for pipes installed
throughout town to prevent corrosion and prolong the integrity of their lines.  Piedmont requested a
permanent 10' X 20' easement within Town of Tarboro right-of-way located at 402 E Baker Street. 
The majority of installation materials will be below ground with a cabinet above ground that will be
minimally intrusive aesthetically to the area.  
 
It is recommended that the Tarboro Town Council approve the attached Compensation Agreement
and Easement for Piedmont Natural Gas to install a Rectifier within the Easement Area as
described.  

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Upload Date Type
Piedmont Natural Gas Rectifier Compensation
Agreement & Easement 2/3/2021 Cover Memo

Rectifier Location Detail 2/3/2021 Cover Memo
Rectifier Project Location 2/3/2021 Cover Memo



EASEMENT 

Prepared by, Record, and  
Return To:  
Piedmont Natural Gas 
c/o Burns & McDonnell 
7201 Glen Forest Drive, Suite 100 
Richmond, VA 23226 

STATE OF NORTH CAROLINA LINE NO. ________________ 
COUNTY OF EDGECOMBE 
PARCEL ID # 473547018600 PROJECT NO. 0228455 

THIS "EASEMENT” is made and granted as of this ____ day of __________________, 20___, from TOWN OF TARBORO, 
a North Carolina municipal corporation (“Grantor”, whether one or more), to PIEDMONT NATURAL GAS COMPANY, 
INC., a North Carolina corporation (“Piedmont”). 

WHEREAS, Grantor is the owner of, or has an interest in, that property situated in the County of Edgecombe, North Carolina, 
as more particularly described in the instrument recorded in Book 1702, Page 133, Edgecombe County Registry (the 
“Property”). 

NOW, THEREFORE, Grantor for and in consideration of the sum of Seven Hundred and Fifty Dollars ($750.00) and other 
valuable consideration, the receipt and legal sufficiency of which is hereby acknowledged, hereby grants, bargains, sells, 
and conveys unto Piedmont, its successors and assigns the following easement(s) and right(s) of way under, upon, over, 
through, and across the Property, as shown on the survey attached hereto as Exhibit A and incorporated herein by 
reference (the “Survey”). For purposes of this EASEMENT, the term “Easements” shall refer collectively to all easements 
described herein and as depicted on the Survey and the term “Easement Areas” shall refer collectively to all the easement 
areas described herein and as depicted on the Survey. 

Permanent Easement. A perpetual easement generally 30 feet wide for purposes of constructing, installing, maintaining, 
operating, repairing, altering, replacing, removing, relocating, inspecting, upgrading, and protecting one or more pipelines 
(which pipelines shall be underground) and appurtenant facilities (including, without limitation, valves, markers, cathodic 
protection equipment, and anode beds) for the transportation of natural gas under, upon, over, through, and across that 
portion of the Property designated “Permanent Easement” on the Survey (the “Permanent Easement Area”). 

Temporary Construction Easement. A temporary right to use the area designated “TCE” on the Survey (the “TCE Area”) 
for the purposes of performing construction activities and laying, storing, erecting, parking, and/or protecting any equipment, 
vehicles, materials, fill, components, parts, and tools associated with the construction of Piedmont’s natural gas pipelines 
and appurtenant facilities for which this temporary construction easement is given, which may or may not be located on the 
Property. Piedmont shall have the right, but not the obligation, to install temporary fencing around the TCE Area and to 
exclude all persons, including Grantor, from any fenced portions of the TCE Area.   

The temporary construction easement shall terminate upon Piedmont placing all facilities for which this temporary 
construction easement is given in service and the release of Piedmont from its obligations under all permits issued for 
construction of such facilities including, without limitation, all sedimentation and erosion control permits. Upon completion 
of construction and all facilities being placed in service, Piedmont shall restore the TCE Area to substantially the same 
condition as it existed prior to Piedmont’s entry thereon, ordinary wear and tear excepted. The temporary construction 
easement does not grant Piedmont the right to place any permanent natural gas pipelines or appurtenant facilities in the 
TCE Area.    

Piedmont’s Use. Piedmont shall have all rights necessary or convenient for the full use and enjoyment of the rights herein 
granted, including, without limitation: (1) reasonable access across the Property to and from the Easement Areas, and (2) 
the right, but not the obligation, to keep the Easement Areas cleared of vegetation, undergrowth, trees (including 
overhanging limbs and foliage and any trees standing outside the Easement Areas which are substantially likely to fall onto 
the Easement Areas), buildings, structures, installations, and any other obstructions which unreasonably interfere with the 
rights granted herein (collectively, “Obstructions”). Some or all of the natural gas pipelines and appurtenant facilities 
(collectively, as described in the Easements granted herein, the “Facilities”) may be installed now and/or in the future. All 
Facilities shall be and remain the property of Piedmont and may be removed by it at any time and from time to time. 

Grantor’s Reservation of Rights. Grantor reserves the right to use the Property and Easement Areas for all purposes that 
do not unreasonably interfere with the rights granted herein and that are not inconsistent with the rules and regulations of 
the North Carolina Utilities Commission, or any applicable federal, state, or local law, rule, or regulation. Grantor shall obtain 
written approval from Piedmont prior to making any change in use of the Easement Areas, which approval shall not be 
unreasonably withheld, conditioned, or delayed. Anything to the contrary herein notwithstanding, Grantor shall not: (1) 
unreasonably interfere with Piedmont’s access to or maintenance of the Facilities or the Easement Areas; (2) endanger the 



safety of Grantor, Piedmont, the general public, private or personal property, or the Facilities; or (3) install or maintain, or 
permit to be installed or maintained, any Obstructions within the Easement Areas except as approved in writing by Piedmont. 

Damages. Piedmont shall be responsible for actual physical damage to: (1) the land within the Property and Easement 
Areas; and (2) improvements and annual crops located on the Property that are not in violation of the terms hereof, provided 
that such damage must be caused by Piedmont in exercising the rights granted herein, and provided further that a claim is 
made by Grantor within one hundred and twenty (120) days after such damages are sustained. Piedmont shall restore and 
level the surface of the Easement Areas to, as nearly as can be reasonably done, the same condition as prior to Piedmont’s 
use of the Easement Areas. Piedmont shall not be liable for any damage caused to Obstructions or improvements installed 
in violation of the terms hereof and may remove them at Grantor’s expense without Grantor’s prior approval or permission.  

No Waiver or Additional Representations. The failure by Piedmont to exercise and/or enforce any of the rights, privileges, 
and Easements herein described shall not be construed as a waiver or abandonment of any such rights, privileges and 
Easements, and Piedmont thereafter may exercise and/or enforce, at any time and from time to time, any or all of them. It 
is understood and acknowledged by the undersigned that the person securing this grant on behalf of Piedmont is without 
authority to make any agreement with regard to the subject matter hereof which is not expressed herein, and that no such 
agreement will be binding on Piedmont. 

Ownership of the Property. Grantor represents, warrants and covenants that it is the lawful owner of the Property and has 
the right to convey the rights set forth herein and that the Property is free from all encumbrances, except for encumbrances 
of record. Grantor represents it has obtained any necessary approvals from any applicable tenant interests.  

To have and to hold said rights, privileges, and Easements unto Piedmont, its affiliates, successors, and assigns. Piedmont, 
its successors and assigns, shall have the right to assign, license, lease, or otherwise transfer, in whole or in part, this 
EASEMENT, or any rights granted herein, to any person or entity, including but not limited to, any affiliated parent or 
subsidiary entity of Piedmont, for the uses and purposes expressly stated herein. This EASEMENT shall run with the land 
and inure to the benefit of and be binding upon Grantor, Piedmont and their respective heirs, successors and assigns. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, this EASEMENT has been signed under seal by Grantor, as of the date first above written. 

GRANTOR: 
TOWN OF TARBORO 

_______________________________________ 
Joseph Pitt, Mayor, Town of Tarboro  

Attest: 

_________________________________ 
Leslie Lunsford, Clerk 

STATE OF __________________ 
COUNTY OF ________________ 

I, _____________________________, a Notary Public for _____________ County, ___________________, do hereby 

certify that ________________________________________ personally appeared before me this day and acknowledged 

that she is the Town Clerk of the Town of Tarboro, a municipal corporation of the state of North Carolina, and that by 

authority duly given and as the act of said municipal corporation, the foregoing instrument was signed in its name by its 

Mayor, sealed with its corporate seal, and attested by herself as its Town Clerk. 

Witness my hand and official seal this the ___ day of __________________, 20___. 

[NOTARY SEAL] 

________________________________________ Sign 

________________________________________ Print 

My commission expires:  



Project Name: Project Number: 0228455
Project Tract #: Consideration: $1,000

Landowner: % Ownership: 100.00%
Pay to the Order of:
Deliver Check To:

PERMANENT (G662) Acres %FMV
Permanent Easement Area $750
Perm. Access Easement Area $0
USSE Area $0
Flare Site Easement Area $0

$750

TEMPORARY (G663) Acres %FMV
TCE Area $250
Temp. Access Easement Area $0

$250

SELECT ONE:
Type Acres Yield per Acre Price per Yield Unit

Crops $0
Timber $0

$0

DAMAGES (G656) SELECT ONE:

$0

$1,000

Landowner: Date:

(SIGN)

Joseph W. Pitt, Mayor (PRINT)

(SIGN)

Leslie Lunsford, Clerk (PRINT)

Land Agent:

(SIGN)

(PRINT)

Anticipated Damages   Post-Construction Damages

In consideration of the right(s) of way and/or easement(s) dated _______________, 20___ (collectively, "Easement") granted 
by Landowner to Piedmont, Piedmont agrees to pay Landowner the following amounts: 

Distribution Section 07
002

Piedmont Natural Gas Company, Inc. ("Piedmont")

PER ACRE FAIR MARKET VALUE ("FMV")

Phone: 252-908-4675

Phone: _________________________

         Anticipated Damages           Post-Construction Damages

TEMPORARY TOTAL

Landowner agrees that all terms, provisions, and conditions of this Agreement and the Easement are and shall remain 
confidential and Landowner agrees not to disclose any such terms, provisions or conditions to any person or entity. Landowner 
agrees the amounts paid pursuant to this Agreement shall constitute full and final payment for the Easement and any 
damages, including crops and timber, described above. Landowner understands that trees, shrubs, crops and other 
landscaping  Piedmont removes from the Easement Areas will not be restored or replaced upon completion of its activities on 
Landowner's property. This Agreement shall be governed by North Carolina law.

Town of Tarboro
Town of Tarboro
Town of Tarboro

PO Box 220
Tarboro, NC 27886

PERMANENT TOTAL 

CROP DAMAGE TOTAL

DAMAGES TOTAL

Detailed Description of 
Damages

GRAND TOTAL

CROP DAMAGES (G656)

Total Compensation Agreement for Permanent Easement(s), 
Temporary Easement(s), and/or Damages (“Agreement”)



DHarr13
Callout
RECTIFIER SITE
DEEP WELL SITE
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Edgecombe County
September 25, 2020

 
 

1 inch = 25 feet

PIN: 473847018600

LOCATION: 402 E BAKER ST
ZIP: 27886
STATE: NC
CITY: TARBORO
ADDRESS: P O BOX 220
OWNER: TOWN OF TARBORO

DEED LOC: 1702/0133
SALE PRICE: $14,500
DEED DATE: 10/16/2019

PROPERTY DESCRIPTION:
400-02 E BAKER ST 

BLDG VAL: $70,231
LAND VALUE:$10,000
ACREAGE:  
ACCOUNT: 208942

TAX CODES: C01
SUBDIVISION: 
DEFERRED: $0
NET VALUE: $80,231

ZONING:  

0 0.005 0.010.0025 mi

0 0.008 0.0160.004 km



Town of Tarboro, North Carolina
Mayor and Council Communication 

Subject:  Amend Contract - Auditing Services

Date:  2/8/2021

Memo Number:  21-09

Due to the COVID-19 pandemic, there was a delay in initiating the Town's annual audit. Further,
Town's auditors have chosen to perform all work remotely, which has resulted in a further delay.
 
The previous contract was extended by the Local Government Commission, until January 31, 2021,
and as our report was not submitted by that time, an amended contract is required. The requested
amendment extends the completion date until February 28, 2021.  
 
It is recommended that Town Council approve the amended audit contract with Flowers & Stanley,
LLP.   

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Upload Date Type
Amended Contract - Auditing Services 2/2/2021 Backup Material









Town of Tarboro, North Carolina
Mayor and Council Communication 

Subject:  CDBG-NR Bid Award

Date:  2/8/2021

Memo Number:  21-10

Previously Council approved contractors for the CDBG-NR housing grant project.  The approved
contractor for the Bradley Avenue house felt they would be unable to proceed in timely manner with
their subcontractors, and decided to responsibly rescind their bid prior to beginning the project. 
 
It is therefore necessary to award the bid to the next lowest bidder for this project.  The revised bid
award summary is attached, and there is sufficient funding in the CDBG-NR budget.  
 
It is recommended that Council approve the new contract award to B&B Construction, the new low
bidder for the Bradley Avenue project. 

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Upload Date Type
Award Summary 2/3/2021 Backup Material



Holland Consulting Planners, Inc.

Award Recommendation
Page 1 of 2

Project: Bid Opening Date 5/21/2020

Case File #
Actual Bid 

(Tabulated)
Contractor

Recommended 

Award   (X)
Comments

$88,600.00
Gilbert Everett 

Builder, Inc.

1 NO BID Hope Restorations, Inc.

$70,300.00
B&B Construction of 

Chocowinity

$101,690.00 Moore Design Build, LLC

$62,555.00
Robert Strickland 

Construction, LLC
X

$64,200.00
Paul Woolard Construction, 

Inc.

$78,700.00
Gilbert Everett 

Builder, Inc.

3 NO BID Hope Restorations, Inc.

$45,950.00
B&B Construction of 

Chocowinity

$82,125.00 Moore Design Build, LLC

$42,500.00
Robert Strickland 

Construction, LLC
X

$53,200.00
Paul Woolard Construction, 

Inc.

$97,100.00
Gilbert Everett 

Builder, Inc.

4 NO BID Hope Restorations, Inc.

$90,425.00
B&B Construction of 

Chocowinity

$122,645.00 Moore Design Build, LLC

$85,123.00
Robert Strickland 

Construction, LLC
X

$103,361.00
Paul Woolard Construction, 

Inc.

Johnson - 811 Elm Street,

Low bidder

Tarboro, NC

Town of Tarboro CDBG-NR

Low bidder

Tarboro, NC

Low bidder

Tarboro, NC

Roberts - 1107 Elm Street,

Occupant/Address

Randolph - 617 Martin Luther King Jr. Drive,

RA.08 February 2015



Holland Consulting Planners, Inc.

Award Recommendation
Page 2 of 2

Project: Bid Opening Date 5/21/2020

Case File #
Actual Bid 

(Tabulated)
Contractor

Recommended 

Award   (X)
Comments

Town of Tarboro CDBG-NR

Low bidder

Occupant/Address

$161,500.00
Gilbert Everett 

Builder, Inc.

5 $135,540.00 Hope Restorations, Inc. Bid Rescinded

$143,900.00
B&B Construction of 

Chocowinity
X

$167,000.00 Moore Design Build, LLC

NO BID
Robert Strickland 

Construction, LLC

$144,160.00
Paul Woolard Construction, 

Inc.

$223,930.00
Gilbert Everett 

Builder, Inc.

7 $194,005.00 Hope Restorations, Inc.

$280,000.00
B&B Construction of 

Chocowinity

$219,900.00 Moore Design Build, LLC

NO BID
Robert Strickland 

Construction, LLC

$176,140.00
Paul Woolard Construction, 

Inc.
X

Low bidder

Gomez - 809 West St. James Street,

Low bidder

Carr - 807 Bradley Avenue,

Tarboro, NC

Tarboro, NC

RA.08 February 2015



Town of Tarboro, North Carolina
Mayor and Council Communication 

Subject:  Budget Amendment - Insurance Claim

Date:  2/8/2021

Memo Number:  21-11

On July 28, 2020, the Wastewater Treatment Plant received extensive roof  damage due to high
winds associated with a severe thunderstorm. The related damage was covered by the Town's
property insurance policy, and the necessary repairs totaled approximately $45,935. In order to
properly appropriate the insurance proceeds, a budget amendment is needed.

It is recommended that Council adopt the attached budget resolution.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Upload Date Type
Insurance Claim 2/2/2021 Backup Material

Budget Amendment - Insurance Claim 2/2/2021 Budget
Amendment









 

 

 

Account Number Account Name

Current 

Budget

Amount of 

Change

Revised 

Budget

REVENUES 

31‐3200‐0100 CARES Act ‐ Coronavirus Relief Funds 1,000            + 43,435        = 44,435         

EXPENDITURES  

31‐7130‐7300 Capital Outlay ‐ Improvements 21,000          + 43,435        = 64,435         

 

BUDGET RESOLUTION

TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF TARBORO

February 8, 2021

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF TARBORO, NORTH CAROLINA, that the 2020‐2021 

Fiscal Year Budget be amended by amending Revenue and Expenditure line items as follows:

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Budget Officer is hereby authorized and directed to implement said budget 

as amended.



Town of Tarboro, North Carolina
Mayor and Council Communication 

Subject:  Appointment for February - Tarboro-Edgecombe Airport Authority

Date:  2/8/2021

Memo Number:  21-12

The (5) five year term for Anthony Edwards expired in February.  Mr. Edwards has decided to no
longer serve on this board. 
 
It is recommended that Council be prepared to appoint an individual to fill the expired term at the
February Council meeting.



Town of Tarboro, North Carolina
Mayor and Council Communication 

Subject:  Appointment for February - Tarboro-Edgecombe Arts Commission

Date:  2/8/2021

Memo Number:  21-13

At December's meeting, Council voted to enter into an Interlocal Agreement with Edgecombe
County to create the Tarboro-Edgecombe Arts Commission.  The Tarboro Town Council will need
to appoint (6) individuals who live in the Town of Tarboro as appointees to the Board of Directors. 
One of the Town's appointments shall be a current member of the Board of Directors of the
Blount-Bridger's House/Hobson Pittman Memorial Gallery Foundation, Inc..
 
The Blount-Bridger's House/Hobson Pittman Gallery Foundation has recommended Brandon
Bunn, a current member, for appointment to the Board.  His application is attached.   
 
It is recommended that Council appoint (6) individuals to the Tarboro-Edgecombe Arts
Commission at the February Council meeting..

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Upload Date Type
Bunn Application 2/2/2021 Backup Material
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