AGENDA

REGULAR MEETINGS OF THE
SANTA FE SPRINGS
PUBLIC FINANCING AUTHORITY
WATER UTILITY AUTHORITY
AND CITY COUNCIL

APRIL 26, 2012
6:00 P.M.

Council Chambers
11710 Telegraph Road
Santa Fe Springs, CA 90670

William K. Rounds, Mayor
Richard J. Moore, Mayor Pro Tem
Luis M. Gonzalez, Councilmember

Joseph D. Serrano, Sr., Councilmember
Juanita A. Trujillo, Councilmember

Public Comment: The public is encouraged to
address City Council on any matter listed on the
agenda or on any other matter within its jurisdiction.
If you wish to address the City Council, please
complete the card that is provided at the rear
entrance to the Council Chambers and hand the
card to the City Clerk or a member of staff. City
Council will hear public comment on items listed on
the agenda during discussion of the matter and
prior to a vote. City Council will hear public
comment on matters not listed on the agenda
during the Oral Communications period.

Pursuant to provisions of the Brown Act, no action
may be taken on a matter unless it is listed on the
agenda, or unless certain emergency or special
circumstances exist. The City Council may direct
staff to investigate and/or schedule certain matters
for consideration at a future City Council meeting.

Americans with Disabilities Act: In compliance
with the ADA, if you need special assistance to
participate in a City meeting or other services
offered by this City, please contact the City Clerk’s
Office. Notification of at least 48 hours prior to the
meeting or time when services are needed will
assist the City staff in assuring that reasonable
arrangements can be made fo provide accessibility
fo the meeting or service.

Please Note: Staff reports, and supplemental
aftachments, are available for inspection at the
office of the City Clerk, City Hall, 11710 E.
Telegraph Road during reqular business hours 7:30
a.m. — 5:30 p.m., Monday — Thursday and every
other Friday. Telephone (562) 868-0511.




City of Santa Fe Springs

Regular PFA, WUA, and City Council Meeting April 26, 2012

CALL TO ORDER

ROLL CALL

Luis M. Gonzalez, Director/Councilmember
Joseph D. Serrano, Sr., Director/Councilmember
Juanita A. Trujillo, Director/Councilmember
Richard J. Moore, Vice Chair/Mayor Pro Tem
William K. Rounds, Chair/Mayor

6:00 P.M.

PUBLIC FINANCING AUTHORITY

CONSENT AGENDA

Consent Agenda items are considered routine matters which may be enacted by one
motion and roll call vote. Any item may be removed from the Consent Agenda and
considered separately by the Public Financing Authority.

Approval of Minutes

A. Minutes of the March 22, 2012 Regular Public Financing Authority Meeting
Recommendation: That the Public Financing Authority approve the minutes as
submitted.

Monthly Report

B. Monthly Report on the Status of Debt Instruments Issued through the City of Santa
Fe Springs Public Financing Authority (PFA)

Recommendation: That the Public Financing Authority receive and file the report.
WATER UTILITY AUTHORITY
CONSENT AGENDA

Consent Agenda items are considered routine matters which may be enacted by one
motion and roll call vote. Any item may be removed from the Consent Agenda and
considered separately by the Water Ultility Authority.

A.

Approval of Minutes of the March 22, 2012 Regular Water Utility Authority Meeting

Recommendation: That the Water Utility Authority approve the minutes as
submitted.

Monthly Report
Update on the Status of Water-Related Capital Improvement Projects

Recommendation: That the Water Utility Authority receive and file the report.




City of Santa Fe Springs

Regular PFA, WUA, and City Council Meeting April 26, 2012

Water Well No. 12 (13939 Borate Street) Drilling and Construction — Award of Contract

Recommendation: That the Water Utility Authority: (1) Accept the bids; and (2) Award a
contract to Best Drilling and Pump, Inc. of Colton, CA in the amount of $912,985.00.

Water Well No. 12 (13939 Borate Street) — Construction of Storm Drain Improvements —
Authorization to Advertise for Construction Bids

Recommendation: That the Water Utility Authority: (1) Approve the Plans and
Specifications; and (2) Authorize the City Engineer to advertise for construction bids.

SUCCESSOR AGENCY

NEW BUSINESS
Resolution SA-2012-004 — Approving the Successor Agency’s Administrative Budgets
for Fiscal Years 2011-12 and 2012-13

Recommendation: That the Successor Agency Adopt Resolution SA-2012-004.

Resolution SA-2012-005 — Amending the Successor Agency’s Recognized Obligation
Payment Schedule (ROPS) for February 1, 2012 through June 30, 2012, and Approving
the Successor Agency’s Recognized Obligation Payment Schedule (ROPS) for July 1,
2012 through December 31, 2012

Recommendation: That the Successor Agency Adopt Resolution SA-2012-005.

CITY COUNCIL

CITY MANAGER REPORT

CONSENT AGENDA

Consent Agenda items are considered routine matters which may be enacted by one
motion and roll call vote. Any item may be removed from the Consent Agenda and
considered separately by the City Council.

Approval Minutes
A. Minutes of the March 22, 2012 Regular City Council Meeting

Recommendatidn: That the City Council approve the minutes as submitted.

3




1.

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

City of Santa Fe Springs

Regular PFA, WUA, and City Council Meeting April 26, 2012

ORDINANCE FOR INTRODUCTION/PASSAGE
Ordinance No. 1030 — An Urgency Ordinance Enacting and Adopting Supplement 15 to
the Code of Ordinances for the City of Santa Fe Springs and Declaring an Emergency

Recommendation: That the City Council waive further reading and introduce and adopt
Ordinance No. 1030 which would update the City’s Municipal Code by incorporating all
Ordinances passed by the Council since the last update.

NEW BUSINESS
Walking Deck Improvements at the Clarke Estate (10211 Pioneer Boulevard) — Final
Progress Payment

Recommendation: That the City Council approve the Final Progress Payment (less 5%
Retention) to IBN Construction, Inc. of Orange, CA, in the amount of $55,852.44 for the
subject project.

Approval of Artwork Concept for the El Greco Development on Burke Street

Recommendation: That the City Council approve the Artwork Concept by Alex Shagin
for the El Greco Development at 11650 Burke Street.

Citywide Street Sweeping Services — Authorization to Advertise Request for Bids

Recommendation: That the City Council authorize the Director of Public Works to
advertise request for bids.

Gus Velasco Neighborhood Center Renovation and Modernization Project — Approval of
Contract Change Order No. 7

Recommendation: That the City Council: (1) Approve Contract Change Order No. 7 in
the amount of $116,122; and (2) Authorize the Director of Public Works to execute
Contract Change Order No. 7.

Informal Presentation on Heritage Seismic Imaging Study

Recommendation: That the City Council receive and file the report.

Please note: Item Nos. 17 —25 will commence in the 7:00 p.m. hour.

INVOCATION

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE



19.

20.

21.

22,

23.

24,

25.

City of Santa Fe Springs

Regular PFA, WUA, and City Council Meeting April 26, 2012

INTRODUCTIONS
Representatives from the Youth Leadership Committee

Representatives from the Chamber of Commerce

ANNOUNCEMENTS

APPOINTMENTS TO BOARDS, COMMITTEES, COMMISSIONS
Committee Appointments

ORAL COMMUNICATIONS
This is the time when comments may be made by interested persons on matters not on the
agenda having to do with City business.

EXECUTIVE TEAM REPORTS

ADJOURNMENT

I hereby certify under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of California, that the
foregoing agenda was posted at the following locations; Santa Fe Springs City Hall, 11710
Telegraph Road; Santa Fe Springs City Library, 11700 Telegraph Road,; and the Town
Center Plaza (Kiosk), 11740 Telegraph Road, not less than 72 hours prior to the meeting.

uita Jimener #eril 20, 2012
Deputy City Clerk Date




CITY OF SANTA FE SPRINGS

MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETINGS
OF THE PUBLIC FINANCING AUTHORITY
WATER UTILITY AUTHORITY
AND CITY COUNCIL

MARCH 22, 2012

CALL TO ORDER
Mayor Rounds called the meetings to order at 6:03 p.m.

ROLL CALL
Present: Directors/Councilmembers Gonzalez, Serrano, Trujillo, Vice-Chair/Mayor Pro Tem
Moore, and Chair/Mayor Rounds

The Deputy City Clerk announced that members of the City Council receive $150 for
attendance at each of the Public Financing Authority and Water Utility Authority meetings.

Also present; Thaddeus McCormack, City Manager; Steve Skolnik, City Attorney; Paul
Ashworth, Director of Planning & Community Development; Don Jensen, Director of Public
Works; Dino Torres, Director of Police Services; Hilary Keith, Director of Library & Cultural
Services; Jose Gomez, Director of Finance & Administrative Services; Stan Klopfenstein,
Fire Division Chief; Anita Jimenez, Deputy City Clerk

PUBLIC FINANCING AUTHORITY

CONSENT AGENDA

Approval of Minutes
A. Minutes of the February 23, 2012 Reqgular Public Financing Authority Meeting

Recommendation: That the Public Financing Authority approve the minutes as
submitted.

Monthly Report
B. Status of Debt Instruments Issued through the City of Santa Fe Springs Public
Financing Authority (PFA)

Recommendation: That the Public Financing Authority receive and file the report.

Vice Chair Moore moved the approval of ltems 3A and B; Director Serrano seconded
the motion, which carried unanimously.

A




4,

WATER UTILITY AUTHORITY

CONSENT AGENDA

Approval of Minutes
A. Minutes of the February 23, 2012 Reqgular Water Utility Authority Meeting

Recommendation: That the Water Utility Authority approve the minutes as
submitted.
Monthly Report

B. Update on the Status of Water-Related Capital Improvement Projects

Recommendation: That the Water Utility Authority receive and file the report.

Director Serrano moved the approval of ltems 4A and B; Director Gonzalez seconded
the motion, which carried unanimously.

SUCCESSOR AGENCY

NEW BUSINESS
Resolution SA-2012-002 — Amending the Enforceable Obligation Payment Schedule (EOPS)
and draft Recognized Obligation Payment Schedule (ROPS)

Recommendation: That the Successor Agency Adopt Resolution SA-2012-002.

Director Serrano moved the approval of Item 5; Director Trujillo seconded the motion which
carried unanimously.

CITY COUNCIL

CITY MANAGER REPORT

The City Manager reported that staff is continuing to monitor developments with successor
agencies in regards to redevelopment. The law is vague and ambiguous. The Oversight
Board for SFS will hopefully meet within the next 3-4 weeks. Mayor Rounds asked if anyone
else had been appointed to the Oversight Board. The City Manager stated that no one else
had been appointed as yet, but expected that some of the less controversial appointments
will be made in early April. Some seats may still be vacant by the time the City needs to act
on the ROPS. The City Attorney stated that as soon as 4 members have been appointed to
the board, it can convene and take action. The City Manager stated that this situation is not
unique to SFS, but because the City is now in the 4" District, we are better off than some
other cities. Supervisor Knabe is a former City Council member who knows the importance
of acting quickly on this issue.

Councilmember Gonzalez stated that at the redevelopment workshop he recently attended,
all the sessions began with a statement regarding the lack of clarity in the law.



10.

CONSENT AGENDA

Approval Minutes
A. Minutes of the February 23, 2012 Regular City Council Meeting

Recommendation: That the City Council approve the minutes as submitted.

Mayor Pro Tem Moore moved the approval of Iltem 7A; Councilmember Serrano seconded
the motion which carried unanimously.

PUBLIC HEARING

Resolution No. 9363 — Modifications to Resolution Nos. 9225 and 9322 regarding the
Adoption of Resolutions of Necessity for the Acquisition in Eminent Domain of Portions of
Real Property Interest in Connection with the Valley View Avenue Grade Separation Project

Recommendation: It is recommended that the City Council adopt Resolution No. 9363
modifying Resolution Nos. 9225 and 9332 to correct clerical errors in the aforementioned
resolutions which authorized in eminent domain of certain real property interest from the
properties located at 14027, 14103, and 14100 Borate Street in connection with the Valley
View Avenue Grade Separation Project.

Mayor Rounds opened the Public Hearing at 6:11 p.m. The Deputy City Clerk reported that
no written requests to speak had been received. Mayor Rounds closed the Public Hearing
at6:12 p.m.

Councilmember Gonzéalez moved the approval of Item 8; Councilmember Serrano seconded
the motion which carried unanimously.

NEW BUSINESS
FY 2011-12 Midyear Budget Review and Modifications

Recommendation: Itis recommended that the City Council approve the proposed revenue
and expenditure adjustments as detailed in Attachments A through C.

Councilmember Serrano moved the approval of ltem 9; Mayor Pro Tem Moore seconded
the motion which carried unanimously.

Resolution No. 9365 — Ordering the Preparation of the Engineer’s Report for FY 2012/13 in
Conjunction with the Annual Levy of Assessments for Street Lighting District No. 1

Recommendation: It is recommended that the City Council adopt Resolution No. 9365,
ordering the preparation of the Engineer’'s Report for FY 2012/13 in conjunction with the
annual levy of assessments for Street Lighting District No. 1.

Councilmember Serrano moved the approval of ltem 10; Mayor Pro Tem Moore seconded
the motion which carried unanimously.




11.

12.

13.

14.

Resolution No. 9366 — Ordering the Preparation of the Engineer’'s Report for FY 2012/13 in
Conjunction with the Annual Levy of Assessments for Heritage Springs Assessment District
No. 2001-01 (Hawkins Street and Palm Drive)

Recommendation: It is recommended that the City Council adopt Resolution No. 9366,
ordering the preparation of the Engineer’s Report for FY 2012/13 in conjunction with the
annual levy of assessments for Heritage Springs Assessment District No. 2001-01 (Hawkins
Street and Palm Drive).

Councilmember Serrano moved the approval of Item 11; Mayor Pro Tem Moore seconded
the motion which carried unanimously.

Slurry Sealing of Various City Streets (FY 2011/2012) - Authorization to Advertise for
Construction Bids

Recommendation: Itis recommended that the City Council take the following actions: 1).
Authorize the Slurry Sealing of Various City Streets (FY 2011/12) to be included in the
Capital Improvement Program FY 2006-07 through 2011-12; 2). Approve the Specifications;
and 3. Authorize the City Engineer to advertise for construction bids.

Mayor Pro Tem Moore moved the approval of item 12; Councilmember Serrano seconded
the motion which carried unanimously.

Councilmember Gonzalez stated that he had previously brought forth some street
maintenance issues to be addressed. The City Manager stated that Syringa and Greenwood
would be restriped as requested, but that they are not part of the slurry seal project.

Water Feature Maintenance Services - Extension of Contract with Payless Pool Services

Recommendation: Itis recommended that the City Council take the following actions: 1).
Approve a three-year extension of the contract with Payless Pool Services; and 2). Authorize
the City Manager to execute a contract amendment with Payless Pool Services that will
retain the current services at the existing contract rates with no increases for the term of the
contract.

Councilmember Serrano moved the approval of ltem 8; Councilmember Gonzalez seconded
the motion which carried unanimously.

Mayor Pro Tem Moore stated that he did have some concerns that had been addressed by
the Director of Public Works. The City Manager followed up by stating that all contracts will
be brought to City Council approximately 3 months prior to completion to see if the Council
would like go out to bid again prior to any extensions.

Alcohol Sales Conditional Use Permit Case No. 39-4

Recommendation: It is recommended that the City Council Approve Alcohol Sales
Conditional Use Permit (ASCUP) Case No0.39-4 subject to a compliance review in five (5)
years, to ensure the use is still operating in strict compliance with the conditions of approval.

Councilmember Gonzalez moved the approval of Item 14; Councilmember Trujillo seconded
the motion which carried unanimously.




15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

21.

22.

23.

Mayor Rounds recessed the meetings at 6:15 p.m.
Mayor Rounds reconvened the meetings at 7:06 p.m.

INVOCATION
The Invocation was given by Councilmember Serrano.

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
The Pledge of Allegiance was led by Principal Planner Wayne Morrell.

INTRODUCTIONS
No members of the Youth Leadership Committee were present.

Mayor Rounds introduced Mike Foley of Cushman & Wakefield of California, Inc.

ANNOUNCEMENTS
Hilary Keith gave the Community Announcements.

PRESENTATIONS
Proclaiming the Month of April 2012, as “Fair Housing Month”
This item was removed from the agenda due to absence of recipient.

APPOINTMENTS TO BOARDS, COMMITTEES, COMMISSIONS

Committee Appointments

Mayor Pro Tem Moore appointed Tony Reyes to the Historical Committee and John Salgado
to the Parks & Recreation Advisory Committee.

ORAL COMMUNICATIONS
Mayor Rounds opened Oral Communications at 7:09 p.m. There being no one wishing to
speak, Mayor Rounds closed Oral Communications at 7:10 p.m.

EXECUTIVE TEAM REPORTS

Don Jensen reported that the City had received approval from Caltrans to advertise for the
Valley View project and that the City is ready to proceed.

Dino Torres called on Captain Aviv Barr to give an update on a homicide which occurred in
April 2010. The suspect had been convicted by a grand jury and sentenced to life in prison.
Three additional suspected gang members were also apprehended on an unrelated matter.
Hilary Keith thanked the Friends of the Library for their recent donation of six Nooks that will
be available for patrons to checkout.

Mayor Rounds thanked Friends of the Library member May Sharp.

Mayor Pro Tem Moore reported that members of the Senior Citizen Advisory Committee, to
which he is the Liaison, conveyed their appreciation for the briefing by the Whittier Police
Department.

Councilmember Serrano asked for an update on the 1-5 groundbreaking. Mayor Pro Tem
Moore reported that several elected officials were in attendance including Los Angeles
Mayor Antonio Villariagosa. The cost of the entire project is projected to be $1.6 billion.
Mayor Rounds reported that he has received several letters regarding the Home Repair and
Home Rebate programs from residents complimenting the staff and the City for providing
such programs. Mayor Rounds stated that the residents really appreciate the service
provided and thanked everyone that was involved.

5




24.

ADJOURNMENT
At 7:17 p.m., Mayor Rounds adjourned the meetings in memory of former City Employee
Cookie Rodriguez and former Café ‘n Stuff employee Mike Sortillon.

William K. Rounds
Mayor

ATTEST:

Anita Jimenez, Deputy City Clerk Date




City of Santa Fe Springs

Public Financing Authority Meeting April 26, 2012

NEW BUSINESS
Monthly Report on the Status of Debt Instruments Issued through the City of Santa Fe
Springs Public Financing Authority (PFA)

RECOMMENDATION
That the City Council receive and file the report.

BACKGROUND

The Santa Fe Springs Public Financing Authority is the City entity that is utilized to
facilitate the issuance of public purpose debt in Santa Fe Springs. The following is a
brief status report on the debt instruments currently outstanding that were issued
through this financing authority.

Consolidated Redevelopment Project 2001 Tax Allocation Refunding Bonds

Financing proceeds available for appropriation at 3/31/12 None
Outstanding principal at 3/31/12 $19,380,000
Consolidated Redevelopment Project 2002 Tax Allocation Refunding Bonds
Financing proceeds available for appropriation at 3/31/12 , None
Outstanding principal at 3/31/12 $14,230,000
Consolidated Redevelopment Project 2003 Taxable Tax Allocation Refunding Bonds
Financing proceeds available for appropriation at 3/31/12 None
Outstanding principal at 3/31/12 $4,135,000
Water Revenue Bonds, 2003 Series A
. Financing proceeds available for appropriation at 3/31/12 None
Outstanding principal at 3/31/12 $4,325,000
Water Revenue Bonds, 2005 Series A
Financing proceeds available for appropriation at 3/31/12 None
Outstanding principal at 3/31/12 $2,920,000
Consolidated Redevelopment Project 2006-A Tax Allocation Bonds .
Financing proceeds available for appropriation at 3/31/12 1,638,121*
Outstanding principal at 3/31/12 $31,047,149
Report Submitted By: Jose Gomez and Travis Hickey Date of Report: April 18, 2012

Finance and Administrative Services

3B




Public Financing Authority Monthly Report Page 2 of 2

Consolidated Redevelopment Project 2006-B Taxable Tax Allocation Bonds

Financing proceeds available for appropriation at 3/31/12 None
Outstanding principal at 3/31/12 $13,530,000
Consolidated Redevelopment Project 2007-A Tax Allocation Refunding Bonds

Financing proceeds available for appropriation at 3/31/12 None
Outstanding principal at 3/31/12 $41,205,000

The City budget includes sufficient appropriations and adequate revenues are
expected to be collected to meet the debt service obligations associated with the
Water Revenue Bonds.

The Community Development Commission budget included sufficient appropriations
to meet the debt service obligations associated with the Tax Allocation Bonds.
However, with the implementation of AB1X 26, the CDC was dissolved effective
2/1/12 and will no longer receive tax increment. It is anticipated that sufficient
allocations of property taxes will be made to the City as Successor Agency to meet the
debt service obligations.

Thaddeus McCormack
City Manager/Executive Director

* $1,638,121 of 2006-A tax exempt bond funds had been used for property
acquisitions in relation to the Valley View Grade Separation Project. These funds
were reimbursed from Federal, State and County sources in May 2011. However, due
to the Supreme Court decision upholding AB1X 26 it is recommended that the
Commission does not spend any additional bond proceeds until clarification is reached
about the impact of AB1X 26 on the use of unspent bond proceeds.

Additionally, appropriated but unspent proceeds on hand are not currently being
spent, pending further clarification about the future of unspent bond proceeds.

Report Submitted By: Jose Gomez and Travis Hickey Date of Report: April 18, 2012
Finance and Administrative Services



PLEASE SEE ITEM 3A




Report Submitted By:  Don Jensen, Director \J

April 26, 2012

NEW BUSINESS
Update on the Status of Water-Related Capital Improvement Projects

RECOMMENDATION
That the Water Utility Authority receive and file the report.

BACKGROUND
This report is for lnformatlonal purposes only. The following is a listing of active
water projects along with their current status:

New Water Well Located Within Zone 1l (Well No. 12)
Hydrogeological Design Phase. This phase of the work is complete. The
consultant, Geoscience Support Services, Inc. currently provides construction
support services associated with the drilling and construction of Water Well No.
12,

Drilling and Construction Phase. Under separate cover, staff is recommending
that the City Council award a contract for the Drilling and Construction of Water
Well No. 12 to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder, Best Drilling and
Pump, Inc.

Wellhead and Pump Station Design Phase. AKM Consulting Engineers has
submitted a final Design Report for equipping Water Well No. 12. The report is
currently under review by staff. Under separate cover, staff is requesting the
approval of plans and specifications and the authorization to advertise for storm
drain improvements for Water Well No. 12.

Required Emissions Upgrades to Internal Combustion Engines (ICE)

The Installation of emission control equipment has been completed at the City’s
reservoirs. All primary Internal Combustion Engines (ICE) meet the South Coast Air
Quality Management District (SCAQMD) amended Rule, 1110.2 for exhaust
emissions.

FISCAL IMPACT
The projects are fully funded through the Water Fund.

INFRASTRUCTURE IMPACT
A fully functioning water production well will provide a source of potable water within

Zone Il and the water well will enhance the reliability of the City’s water system.
. e

MMO” P
/:///’//’ _

Thaddeus McCormaok

Executive Director

Attachment(s):
None.

Debnartment of Public Works

Date of Report: April 18, 2012 L‘B




3 City of Santa Fe Springs

Water Utility Authority Meeting

T T T T T T

NEW BUSINESS
Water Well No. 12 (13939 Borate Street) Drilling and Construction — Award of

Contract

RECOMMENDATION
That the Water Utility Authority take the following actions:

1. Accept the bids; and

2. Award a contract to Best Drilling and Pump, Inc. of Colton, CA in the amount
of $912,985.

BACKGROUND

The City Council, at their meeting of February 23, 2012 authorized staff to advertise
for construction bids for the drilling, development, and testing of Well No. 12 (13939
Borate Street).

Bids were opened on March 29, 2012 and a total of four (4) bids were received.
Upon receiving bids, staff reviewed the proposals submitted to the City and has
determined that all bid proposals are in compliance with the project specifications.
The lowest responsive and responsible bidder for the project was Best Drilling and
Pump, Inc. of Colton, CA in the amount of $912,985. The following represents the
bids received and the amount of each bid:.

Company Name Total Bid Amount
Best Drilling and Pump Inc. $ 912,985
Bakersfield Well and Pump Services Co. $ 989,431
Arizona Beeman Drilling $ 49,418,483
South West Pump and Dirilling Non-Responsive

The bid submitted by Best Drilling and Pump, Inc is 7% above the Engineer's
Estimate of $850,000. The Department of Public Works has reviewed the bids and
has determined the low bid submitted by Best Drilling and Pump, Inc. to be
satisfactory.

The bid by Arizona Beeman Drilling was submitted with an error on the Bid Schedule
that increased their bid total to $49,418,483.

The bid submitted by South West Pump and Drilling was determined to be non-
responsive because Addendum No. 1 was not included in the bid proposal when it
was submitted.

Report Submitted By: ~ Don Jensen, Director | Date of Report: April 18, 2012
Department of Public Wor



; Water Well No. 12 (13939 Borate Street) Drilling and Construction Page 2 of 2

i
;
i
i
i
i
i
i

|
i
|

H
]
|
1
1
!
i

i

|

4
=

]
i
:

d

H

FISCAL IMPACT
The amount of $912,985 has been allocated from the City's Water Bond fund.

e

h

addeus McCormack
Executive Director

Attachment(s):
None.

| _
? Report Submitted By: Don Jensen, Director Date of Report: April 18, 2012

Department of Public Works




Water Utlhty Authonty Nleetmg ) Apnl 26 201 2

> NEW BUSINESS
Water Well No. 12 (13939 Borate Street) — Construction of Storm Drain
Improvements — Authorization to Advertise for Construction Bids

RECOMMENDATION
That the Water Utility Authority take the following actions:

1. Approve the Plans and Specifications; and

2. Authorize the City Engineer to advertise for construction bids.

BACKGROUND

AKM Consulting Engineers, the City’'s Mechanical Equipping consultant, has been
contracted by the City to design and develop a storm drain ‘pump to waste’ line for
Water Well No. 12 (13939 Borate Street). The storm drain waste line receives all
start up well water in order to minimize pressure surge, water hammer, sanding,
and disturbing pipe sediment. The project consists of the installation of
approximately 1,200 feet of storm drain conduit from the new water well site at
13939 Borate Street tying into an existing 36-inch storm drain near the intersection
of Radburn Avenue and Gannet Street.

The total estimated cost for the construction of the storm drain lmprovements is
$480,180.

The project plans and specifications are complete and the Public Works Department
is ready to advertise for the construction bids for this project, upon City Council
approval of the plans and specifications. A copy of the project plans and
specifications are on file with the City Clerk and are available for public review.

FISCAL IMPACT
The project is fully funded through the Water Fund.

INFRASTRUCTURE IMPACT
A fully functioning water production well will provide a much needed source of
potable water within Zone Il and the water well will enhance the reliability of the

City’s water system.
Ty

Thaddeus MoCormack
Executive Director

Attachmeni(s):
Location Map

Report Submitted By: Don Jensen, Director (@ Date of Report: April 18, 2012
Department of Public Work (’




/

7

-

CITY OF LA MIRADA

¢ /\ .,,\\‘_wnxl «\\
— [ BT 77 ] T
AAY M3AIA A TIVA — N
S ——— o I _
S
o // -
m : / \\\ / <
Whl g / \\ﬁ o
7 / / > M
% S/ / / o
T g \\ \\ ' / J m \ PR
_mAa / / A \ \ ) AV Y ISIAYNOE , /
v 4 \ ! / e . N
<t \\ / / \ \\ Ll w f // /
i v ’ % / { Si |/ / AN
= \ / \\ \q\Of O < 1/ y
Nl Y] mase N/ /7, O ; /]
m /J\G \ \\\\ /s H ,.:|_\ ’ // \\
N \/A,\ 5/ 2 \
{
.
iy
6
=
7 e AY 1a
y 4 0 \ ’
7/ 0
\\ O |
\ 7p :
- 7ov SNIEIS wb eI 1)
. = r
()] - _|_I_
) T A BINEES
[ [ )

LOCATION MAP



April 26, 2012

NEW BUSINESS
Resolution SA-2012-004 Approving the Successor Agency’s Administrative Budgets

for Fiscal Years 2011-12 and 2012-13

RECOMMENDATION
That the Successor Agency Adopt Resolution No. SA-2012-004.

BACKGROUND

AB x1 26 was upheld by the California Supreme Court on December 29, 2011,
dissolving redevelopment agencies within the State of California. The legislation
requires a Successor Agency to assume responsibility for the former Community
Development Commission of the City of Santa Fe Springs (CDC). The City has
assumed the role of Successor Agency to the former CDC, and as such is entitled to
recover the cost of administering the former CDC. The administrative cost allowance
provided in the legislation is capped at 5% of tax increment in Fiscal Year 2011-12
and 3% of property taxes allocated to the Successor Agency in Fiscal Year 2012-13.

Furthermore, AB x1 26 requires that Successor Agencies prepare an administrative
budget for each six-month period and submit it to its Oversight Board for approval.
Due to the delay in the Supreme Court’s ruling on AB x1 26, the period for the initial
administrative budget is less than six months, from February 1, 2012 to June 30,
2012. From July 1, 2012 onward, the administrative budget will be presented for
approval on a six-month basis.

The proposed Administrative Budgets (attached) comprise Successor Agency
personnel and non-personnel City support service costs (recovered through an
overhead assessment), for the current year (FY 2011-12) and the following one (FY
2012-13). The Successor Agency personnel for which salaries and benefits are
listed include the City/Successor Agency Attorney, City Manager, Director of Finance
and Administrative Services, Assistant Director of Finance and Administrative
Services, Accountant and City/Successor Agency Clerk, all of whom will spend a
significant amount of their time working on Successor Agency matters.

The legislation requires that the administrative budget be approved by the Oversight
Board before any distributions from the County’s property tax trust fund are made to
the Successor Agency. The initial Oversight Board meeting is scheduled for April 25,
2012. This item is being brought to the Successor Agency for its approval as well.

Report Submitted By: Jose Gomez and Travis Hickey Date of Report: April 20, 2012
Finance and Administrative Services 7



April 26, 2012

The Administrative Budgets for Fiscal Years 2011-12 and 2012-13 are included as

Exhibits “A” and “B” to Resolution SA-2012-004.

Thaddeus McCofmack
City Manager

Attachments

Resolution SA-2012-004

Exhibit A — Administrative Budget for Fiscal Year 2011-12
Exhibit B — Administrative Budget for Fiscal Year 2012-13

Report Submitted By: Jose Gomez and Travis Hickey Date of Report: April 20, 2012
Finance and Administrative Services




RESOLUTION NO. SA-2012-004

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SANTA FE SPRINGS
ACTING AS SUCCESSOR AGENCY TO THE COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
COMMISSION/REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY OF THE CITY OF SANTA FE SPRINGS
APPROVING THE SUCCESSOR AGENCY’S ADMINISTRATIVE BUDGETS
FOR FISCAL YEARS 2011-12 AND 2012-13.

THE CITY COUNCIL ACTING AS SUCCESSOR AGENCY HEREBY RESOLVES
AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. The City Council hereby approves the Successor Agency’s
Administrative Budgets, attached hereto as Exhibits “A” and “B”, as described in Section
34171 of the California Health and Safety Code, for Fiscal Years 2011-12 and 2012-13.

SECTION 2. If any section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause or
phrase in this Resolution, or any part hereof, is held invalid or unconstitutional, such decision
shall not affect the validity of the remaining sections or portions of this Resolution. The City
Council hereby declares that it would have adopted each section, subsection, subdivision,
paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase in this Resolution irrespective of the fact that any one or
more sections, subsections, subdivisions, paragraphs, sentences, clauses or phrases may be
declared invalid or unconstitutional.

SECTION 3. The Deputy City Clerk shall certify to the adoption of this Resolution.
SECTION 4. The Successor Agency’s officials and staff are hereby authorized and
directed to transmit this Resolution and take all other necessary and appropriate actions as

required by law in order to effectuate its purposes.

APPROVED and ADOPTED this 26" day of April 2012.

Mayor

Attest:

Deputy City Clerk



CITY OF SANTA FE SPRINGS

EXHIBIT A

Resolution SA-2012-004

April 26, 2012

Successor Agency to the Santa Fe Springs Community Development Commission

Administrative Budget
Fiscal Year 201112

Description

Salaries
Benefits
Total Personnel Costs
City Support Services (Overhead)

Total Administrative Budget

FY 2011-12
$ 119,100
117,600
236,700
118,300
$ 355,000




CITY OF SANTA FE SPRINGS

EXHIBIT B

Resolution SA-2012-004

April 26, 2012

Successor Agency to the Santa Fe Springs Community Development Commission

Administrative Budget
Fiscal Year 2012-13

Description

Salaries

Benefits
Total Personnel Costs

City Support Services (Overhead)
Total Administrative Budget

FY 2012-13
$ 285,200
281,600
566,800
283,400
$ 850,200




April 26, 2012

NEW BUSINESS
Resolution SA-2012-005 Amending the Successor Agency’s Recognized Obligation

Payment Schedule (ROPS) for February 1, 2012 Through June 30, 2012 and
Approving the Successor Agency’s Recognized Obligation Payment Schedule
(ROPS) for July 1, 2012 Through December 31, 2012

'RECOMMENDATION
That the Successor Agency Adopt Resolution No. SA-2012-005.

BACKGROUND

The Recognized Obligation Payment Schedule (ROPS) identifies bond debt service
and other payments that must be made by the Successor Agency upon dissolution of
the Community Development Commission (CDC). The ROPS, and any amendments,
must be approved by the Oversight Board and will be subjected to an audit conducted
by Los Angeles County to validate the items on the schedule. The Oversight Board is
set to hold their initial meeting on April 25, 2012. Once the audit is completed the
ROPS becomes “certified” and will serve as the basis for property tax allocations to
be made to the Successor Agency to pay obligations of the former CDC.

Amended ROPS for February 1, 2012 through June 30, 2012

As more information becomes available about which items should or should not be
included on the draft ROPS, staff proposes amendments to the schedules. Based on
recent analysis of expected and allowable charges, staff believes it is appropriate to
amend the schedule at this time to include a line item for legal services which may be
rendered to the Oversight Board.

The draft ROPS was originally adopted by the City Council, acting as Successor
Agency on February 23, 2012 and amended March 22, 2012 and April 12, 2012.

Second ROPS for July 1, 2012 through December 31, 2012
The Second ROPS covers the period of July 1, 2012 through December 31, 2012. A
new ROPS must be prepared and approved every 6 months. The list of obligations is
identical to the original ROPS and the amounts have been updated reflecting known
debt service payments and estimated operating, administrative, and other costs. The
- obligations listed serve as the basis for the distributions from the County’s proPerty
tax trust fund. Trust fund payments will be made every January 16" and June 1% with
the first such distribution scheduled for June 1, 2012. This payment is intended to
cover all of the obligations included in the Second ROPS.

Report Submitted By: Jose Gomez and Travis Hickey Date of Report: April 19, 2012
Finance and Administrative Services ?




April 26, 2012

If at some point in the future staff determines that the ROPS should be modified, a
proposed amendment would be brought to the Successor Agency for approval.

P

Thaddeus McCormack
City Manager

Attachments
Resolution SA-2012-005

Exhibit A — Recognized Obligation Payment Schedule for February 1, 2012 through
June 30, 2012

Exhibit B - Recognized Obligation Payment Schedule for July 1, 2012 through
December 31, 2012

Report Submitted By: Jose Gomez and Travis Hickey Date of Report: April 19, 2012
Finance and Administrative Services




RESOLUTION NO. SA-2012-005

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SANTA FE SPRINGS
ACTING AS SUCCESSOR AGENCY TO THE COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
COMMISSION/REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY OF THE CITY OF SANTA FE SPRINGS
AMENDING THE SUCCESSOR AGENCY’S RECOGNIZED OBLIGATION
PAYMENT SCHEDULE (ROPS) FOR FEBRUARY 1, 2012 THROUGH
JUNE 30,2012 AND APPROVING THE SUCCESSOR AGENCY’S RECOGNIZED
OBLIGATIONPAYMENT SCHEDULE (ROPS) FOR JULY 1, 2012 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2012.

THE CITY COUNCIL ACTING AS SUCCESSOR AGENCY HEREBY RESOLVES
AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. Pursuant to its responsibility set forth in Section 34180(g) of the
California Health and Safety Code, the City Council hereby amends the Successor Agency’s
Recognized Obligation Payment Schedules (ROPS) for the period February 1, 2012 through
June 30, 2012, attached hereto as Exhibit “A” and approves the Successor Agency’s
Recognized Obligation Payment Schedules (ROPS) for the period July 1, 2012 through
December 31, 2012, attached hereto as Exhibit “B”, as described in Sections 34171 and 34177
of the aforesaid Code.

SECTION 2. If any section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause or
phrase in this Resolution, or any part hereof, is held invalid or unconstitutional, such decision
shall not affect the validity of the remaining sections or portions of this Resolution. The City
Council hereby declares that it would have adopted each section, subsection, subdivision,
paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase in this Resolution irrespective of the fact that any one or
more sections, subsections, subdivisions, paragraphs, sentences, clauses or phrases may be
declared invalid or unconstitutional.

SECTION 3. The Deputy City Clerk shall certify to the adoption of this Resolution.
SECTION 4. The Successor Agency’s officials and staff are hereby authorized and
directed to transmit this Resolution and take all other necessary and appropriate actions as

required by law in order to effectuate its purposes.

APPROVED and ADOPTED this 26" day of April 2012.

Mayor
Attest:

Deputy City Clerk




£69'872'22 191°260 9£9'9/9') 9¢1'8/9't 9g1e89'L YIL'ELIEL 81£°220'9C Z00'690°6.C sabied [V - €30} puBID
S21'980'C 521'980°2 0 0 0 0 S21'980'C S6L'ELT Y suoedliqo 40 - slejoL|
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 9.2'960'C v afied - sfejol]
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 118'1z.'8 € abed - siejoL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 268'956'91 T sbed - siejoy|
80.'299'02 9e9'l10C 9€9'9/9'L 9el'8/9'1 EEEED EEEED £61'9€6'€2 822'090°92 abed syl - s(ejol
)
000'5) 00051 J11d4d[ 00051 000°51 pleod Wbislang lo} sasiaes [eba7 pauiuLiajapun 1asuno [e6a7 pJeod Jubisiano((og
0 411dY pautuLEEpun pUe| paumo 5QJ Joj Uswaaiby wawdoersa]  sisuped abejisH a4 BluesS| Jawaalby uonisods|q pue Juswdojeraq sisuped abejlaH a4 ees|(sz
0 Slldy 6812012 S§paadeid jo co:_monw_n_ o} EmEmw..d( "0Q g uosjie) ueyeueioopy uswiaaiby Co:_wonwmﬂ >tmno._n_ AmN
000°02¢ 000'0ze 411d¥| 000'02¢ 000°'0TE UBIS pIEOGIapEaY JO UOINISUOD 10} S0UBISISSY "o} “J9jua) JoniL swo] ublS pleoqiapeay lop souejsissy uolonysuod[(Ze
00055 00012 000°L2 0001 000°1L 00042 J1idd] 6oo'sse 000'SSE UOENSIUIWPY AoUsBy Jossaaons SNOLEA S35UBdXT SAFEISIUILIBY| (67 |
012'e0b Zv9'0Z Z2v9'0Z 299’02 2¥9'0Z 2r9'02 d11du] 002°292 00L'2¥2 sisog juswiabeuely Apadold SNoUeA uswabeue|y Apadold|(sg
005'v 005'L 00s'L 0051 d11d¥) 008" 005Y Sa3IAIBS Buljinsuog sbeniqly| xiys1boT puog saag abeniqiv|(re
000°0L 0005 000 L[ 000708 000°0E 599 Juaby [edsld Ueg sn saa Jusby [edsid|(cg
00021 00021 4L1d4M| 00072 000'v2 SIS JIpNY| QoI sa31A93 1pNV[ (22
0 411dy| 008'v01 00870 SEUEISU] Aiadold PUe Kger] Vidr Tv3 asuesnsul{(1z
S06'3LL') 18L'56T 181'6¢2 18L°66C 18.'6€2 182'6€2 dL1d¥] $06'82L'L 0pa'v96'L TFoAN 1312/A MSN JG UDHINIISU0D pue Ubisag S3S o Aug (2 auoZ) Z14 llsM, JoieM MaN| {02
08L'L8L'Y 9v5'156 9v5'LG6 95 LS6 9v5' 156 b5’ 156 d11dY| 0£L'28L'% 0eL'avl'y 13)U0 po0YI0qyBEN J0 UoHeAcUsY S48 o KD pafoid Uajjeaouay Jaad pooliooqublan|{sl
0 HLLdY 000'S.2'L) JUBWaIIU} XeL Slea ) §1 PaauX3 0} )oN aseyaind pue]| sbundg abejiaH je sebejlin awas.By Uoyisods|q pue Juswidojeraq SbUldS shejlaH I8 SeDeliA| (8l
S2L'856' | L99'16E 299'L6¢ 199°16€ 199'L6¢ 199'L6E puey uo| 000°00LY 000°002'% sueleladg BUoBUQ 1o} sainyipisdxg jo Jusliled SNOLIBA sainypuadx3 AARY Bulsno 2i-1102[ (L
0 ALLdy 000'592°L 1 SSIHIIGerT PSPURJUN $0 JUSWAE U SIEUS Of UOREBHGO S4510 AI0|  (PaUGUIoD) SSRIIIGE] ] PApUNiUn 3O SIEUS |BUCIN0GGId JO JUalIAES 164 Juaiaaiby| (Bl
0 ETPY| 000°568° Runog V1 yim yusWealbe Jad UeoT S35 10 M0 Cpala uoiBUiysepn) xe L Saleg - Ueo | juawaiou] XeL| (5l
0 EINET] 000°006°L (1102 ‘o€ sunr jo Se) JueWaloul Xe} ainjn} Jo Ueo'] Aunog ssjebuy so (palg uojBliysen) teo Juatwaisul xe ||
0 FIRPTY SYY'e6le WalwAed Jvy3s | 102 Pund 0} UeoT pun4 BuishoH 209 {pauiquiod) ueo Jvas L102|(el
0 EINET] 516vL WaWked YIS 0102 pund 0} UeoT pund puog g800Z 940 (pAIg uolbulysepn) UeoT Jvuas 0102[RL
0 411dy 22L'%05'0L WalwAed 4v¥3S 0102 pUnd 0} Ueo pund puog 8900z 942 (pajepjlosuod) ueo Jvy3s 0L0Z|(Ll
9l2'82L 91.'821 ALld¥| zey'ise vpe’Leg') Wwawked JYHT 9002 Pun 0} Ueo Y3082 (paulgtioQ) ueo w3 8002| (0L
518121 518'12L 411dy] oeg'erz 0Z1'vL6 JusliAed Jv3 5002 bund 0} ueo VY32S0 (pauiquwiod) Ueo Svd3 500¢((6
0 ALlldd 000°000') Wawked a3 #002 Pund 0} Ueo pung Buisnop a0 pajepiosucd) pund BujsnoH 9GO Wold UeoT 3vy3 $002|(8
0SZ'E9Y'C 052'e9'2 dLLdN| 082'e9P'T 052'581'6S Spuod 2002 40 UORIGd PUE ‘g66) *L661 Punjay| jued s v saliag spuog Buiplnjay Uoesolly Xe1 £002| (L
$59'802'2 §58'802°C JLLdY| §59'902'2 26'SLL9L SaljinaY Jawdojanapay Jjueg sn g sapas spuog Uoiedolly XeL lqexel 900z|(9
eLLbLL €LLLAL dLLdY| eL1LaL PTO'LLG'ES SaliAlY Juaidojarspay Jued sn v salias spuog usliedolly xel 9002[(s
802°¢L9 802'€L9 JLLdN| 802'€L9 29.'68L'S (BulshoH) SPUDE €661 PapUNjeY Jued sn ' saiiag spuog Buiplnjay uoledofiy xel alqexel c00z| (i
12Uy 122'9ZLY dLLdY| 1292y LL§'8LT'LL SPUOE 2661 PURBY/SAAYD d pay djued sn v SeUsg spuoq BUIpUN}aY UsHesolly XEL 2002 (€
S62°20.'1 §62°20L'L 411dY| 662202°L erv'seeal SAWAOY Juswidolanapay Jued sn '/ S3119g spuog uclieao]ly Xel 1002[
§50°22¢ 55022 411dY| §50'22e $L9'08)'L SPUOE] £661 40 Uojplod BuisnoH punjey Jjueg sn {Buisnior]) v sa1iag spUGE UGReadlly XeL L00Z| (1
ealy 123[0.d pajepliosuo) ayj o} Alalos 3jelay g-1 swal
lejoL unp few gy e Qo4 annog JBaA 18381 GoRebHa0 10 1950 uoljdiosaq sahed uonebilqo jqaq / awen joalold
Bulng ang (ejol,
Z102 - Yiuow Aq sjuawAed Buipun
691Y¢ pue LgLy¢ UORIIS - 92 AY J3d
S FINAIHOS INIWAV NOILLYOITE0 A3ZINDODIY 14vHd
$00-ZL0T-YS Uonnlossy
V LigiHX3 pauIgWos (s)easy alold

sabed 30 | abed

a Aunwiod sbupds a4 ejues

Rouaby wadojaaapay Jo sweN




0 1] 0 0 4] 1} 0 768'956'91 abed sy, - siejo |
0
0 spuog 0£8'aL dID pauluLIaapury 80-10 A (SANGIS §) Sapeibdr [BUBES JljelL| (08
0 spuog PAUIISIEPUN did paUURRpUN 5(EpepaD J G09/fB L. - UOREIHIPOWY [EUBIS dielL(6e
0 spuog] 90V°95Y ) paulliaiepun () o5eld) SUOREBIN SUOZ SunD| (82
0 spuog| 168°8L1'9 diD| pauLI}EpUn (2 8sByd) qeyay 19as [euysnpulfeniatiwod| (g
0 mu:om_ 12€'S0L dio pauuIaBpun UOHONIISUCIaY/DUIOBHNSSY PEOY BIonx] (92 |
Y mucom_ 26L°LL dlo pauluIRpuN SUBIS Ajeioads [euolpeng aoejdey] (52
g Spuog| 2896l dio paUILLalEpUN sjuawAoidw) uawpedsq and| b2
0 mv:om_ 000'001 dIo pauIgiapun sjuawancidul] jooy uonels and|(ez
[4 spuog 00068 dio paululalepun 119/ 18150 2 YSd "ASIN - € 8seUd - Wajshs Az ssaife)[(ze
0 spuog 000'22 dI0 pauluLaiBpun Wi9isAS aild Ajioed Butbels saiod|(ig
0 spuog g18'sl diD pauiIB)BpUN SYUBL abelo}g jand pUnois sAoqy|(0e
0 spuog 2LECor dio CENIUEE ] Wooy WalidinbT pue INO3IoA puedxd - ¢ ON UCHESS ol | (6
0 mucoml__ 680°¢8l dlo paulisishun 10je13U89) aue|day - 2 “ON Uones aiid| (8l
0 spuog 00001 dIo paulLISiapLn Hodied Sugspay 8sojauz - DH andf{ZL
0 mucom_._ 00062 dID)] pausispun 19010 3G Ul ebeles ppy - DH 8iid| (@l
0 %com_ 6€6'€2L'Y dio pauilsiapun uoisuedx sa0 - OH andf{GL
0 spuog| 000°005 dI pauUISIBpUN SIUSWAOIGUI] Sied sHoSUEliSsIN| W) |
0 spuog 000'006 [Sile] pauluLsiepun sjuawanoidw ajeysg axseot(el
0 spuog 000°009 =ik paulIsepun (o7 Bunjled yinog) | eseld - yled oy efyj L
0 spuog 000009 dlo pauLISIBPUN (o7 Bupiied YHoN] | asedd - died & spnf(lL
0 spuog| FENOOEETs] 1) FENEUEE gl Butpling esoding-inA sied malaaxeTl (01
0 spueg SlL'sve dl9) paulualepun | aseud - ued axe aln| (6
0 spuog 00089 dio pauRULIalapUn Ueld Jo1SE|y do[aAaq - JajUa0 ARAIY| (8
0 spuog paulul_pun 19D pauliRtepun {spalord Yied Jaald) Ueld Ja)sey Yied s3s| (2
0 spuog 000'00} diD pauwIBiBpUrt Nied Jarep sojRIN so|(g
0 spuog ShE'TY dID| pauiuiaiepun Jejuag pooiooqubBleN U} Ie sejeg Aundasl (g
0 spuog| 000°00} dio pallueIapun Japeg pooyicaqubiaN auj je AreiqrT ysuelg ojaIN{(y
o spuog] 000002 dio pauiwIsiEpun leH 1SjUa5 UM L - slioonsay ableT ajeacuay| (€
0 spuog 000 dI0) pauUIBiEpUN SINPNAS SpEUS Yied malnae| (2
0 mucow._ ov8'zsl diD [FENNIEIET ) ucisledxg Jeg yoeus Jajuag axeT] (|
Ietol unp Aei gy den go4 3ainog VN E] uohebiqo 103930 uoduaseq salked uoneblqo 1gaq 7 aWeN Paloid
2102 - Yo Aq sjuswAed Bupuns Buung ang fejol | Bupueising 1ejol

2102 '92 ludy
S00-ZL02-V'S Uainjosay

YV LIgiHX3
sabed g j0 2 sfed

691Lv¢ Pue [glpg Uoldasg - 9T gV 43d

FTNA3IHOS LNIWAVA NOILYDITFO A3ZINDOIIA 14VHd

PBUIqWOD

UOISSIWWOY Jualidojeaaq] AuUnwiiog sbupds a4 ejues

(s)eary wafoid
Rouafy uswidojerapay Jo sweN




o 9 & 0 Q [} lo 118°122'8 abed SL - slejo)
0
0 mucom“ 9628} ) dio pauiajepun (uBisaq) g+ / BjiuswIeD - sableyd waishs Jajem|(0e
0 spuog 000'00¢ dlo pauiwiaEpun *Bplg UoneulWeIol MaN - 2 ON JioAlesad|(gZ
0 spuog 000°000°% dio peUIlLIEIEpUn (1 3sBUd) | SUoZ - [loAn Jejep maN| (8
0 spuog 000'002 dIo [EEITETT Jieday g AU g aseYd - Ule[y uoissiWsuell YaU-oL| Uz
0 spuog 000'0SY dIo pauilialepun Jteday p AUJ | aseyd - Ulely uoissiwsuelt Ysu-gL|{ez
0 spuog 000'009 dlo pauiwisispun 2 3U0Z - []ap\ MaN sasijived Jusulesl L Jjusssy|(GZ
0 mucom— 000'000°L 0 pauilsajapun LDISUBTXT JIOAIRSBY ¢ 8U0Z MaN|(be
0 mvcom_ 000002 dlo pauiwlaispun Z pue |, "soN [Iap 10} S10}e1aUss 8jqepod| (€2
0 spuog| £EV'VEL dID pauluLIa}epun BIMUINS g 9DEUBIS 'S3S0N) ~ Z aseld Jajusd umoL|(ee
0 spuog]| 65Y°5L diD PSR (2 aseyd) Ueld Jaysel Jsjuag umoL[(12
9 spuog €EL'YvaY dlO paulLLSiapuN: 307 Bupjied apls 1sap - Jejusd ums L} {0z
0 wnccmn_ 156'0Lp fite] paukuIsispun uideaspueT Jajuag umo (6L
0 wncom_ €65°0pT dio pautiLIRiapun @pIstinog) speliog UBlsapad - 1saiod ueqin|(el
0 mucom_ 0000002 Tts) paULIB}BpUN uoneledas apeid) malA Aslien| (L
0 mu:om_ 000°'052 dlo paulusiapun (2 aseyd) Baly pu| - Usjstaauod MBI 19245[ (0L
0 mucom_ 000'002 dIo paullLiaiapun eubig dyel | Uojesoy 7 saualold| (gl
0 spuog| PSULLIZIEpU diD) PaULIapUr aBpId 50971 % G097 O} JoAld DS - shemied EOCECM_H‘.
[) spuog] PauIlLIaIapUn 4D FENTOEE s} Red % L0 1e ydeibala] - sAemied paauequs|(cl
0 mucom_ sieye dIo pauliuisiapun Apmig asnsay pue (e1ads JopinoD &|@L
0 mucom_ 000°2y dI9 pauiLIapun (Pepund Ov'1) UONEZIUCIYIUAS JeUbIS eAy aaualold|(Lt
0 spuog 99V diD paulIaepun Rilioe4 {esodsiq Buidesms jeals]| (0L
0 mucom‘ 92e' LY lte] pauIsepur 3104 ON D00/5UEI93SCY Jos/iid - Jalieq 2BpLg|(6
0 mucom_ 966'L¢ dlD pauuLIdapun SJusWancldW] UBIPS[ ‘PG BIPUoY| (8
[i] mucom_ £6L'661 dIo padilniayapun UBisaq - ulelq Uojs LosUaies] (7
0 spuog] 0002 Clte} PpaujuLalRpun WwajsAs Juawabeueyy Juswaaed|(9
1 spuog 000°9L dio PaulULIBIBPUN 2910 3j0K00/AEMUBIH leladw] - jajed abpug| (&
g %SmA LY§'Se dio paullIe)apun 1aalo:d ucipasieil] malp Keliep/elpuoly|(y
[ spuog| 000°02) D PaUNIZIapUN 50-80 Ad (sdMi0]5 ¢) sepelbdr [BUBLS SGjeiL (5 |
0 mu:om_ €15'951 di0 pauilIBBpun PIBWO0g/eLI0D - [lejsu [eUuBlS oiel |2
0 spuog 986'2Y dIo pautuLaleapun (lasliold o/s |a1) epeded abpuig yddn wiedsy|(L
lejol unp Ae 1y e Qa3 aanog JBaA 129813 UoReBIq0 10 198 uoduassg sahed uoneblqo 3ga¢] / sweN oalold
Z10Z - Yuow Ag sjustihed Buipund Buung ang fejoL | Buipueising [eyoL
691P¢ pue LgLy¢ UOHIRS - 92 AV 419d
P FINAIHOS INAWAVA NOILLYOITEO QIZINDOOTY 14vHd
500-Z102-YS Uojniosay
VY 1IgIHX3 paligue) (s)easy afoid
sabed g Jo ¢ afed twog juawdojeaad Aunwiwod sbunds a4 ejues Aousby uswdojaAapay Jo sWeN




Y 9/2'960°

9bEd S - SIEJ0L

(62

(8Z

[V

(92

3

(64

[(53

0z

(61

(gl

00005V

fils]

CENUEEal

JeRUapIsaY - UCISIaAUOD J4BI 1oalS

[

[2)

spuog
spuog

000°052

ikl

FENOUEE )

sliedoy eInjesJ Joje, SNOBUE(ISSIN

[

o™

olo|e|o|e|ojojefjelo|lec|o]olojo|ololo]|e]ejololo|olojo|o|o| ||l

spuog

9.T°96E'C

[its]

FENTEE D)

(v U0}eDo™) Z auoZ - s Jajeph MaN

[

el

unp Aen Jdy Jein qad

2102 - Yiuow Aq sjuswhed

aunos
Bulpung

IEDNCEEP] UoREBIq0 10 1920
Buung ang jejoy | Buipueising lejoL

uondussac]

ssfed

UolieblIqO 198Q / BweN joalold

2102 ‘92 iudy
S00-2L02-vS uonnjosay

Vv 1igIHX3
safied g Jo ¢ afied

69LYE Pue L9]1pE UOBIIS - 92 AV J3d
AINAIHOS INANAVC NOILYDITEO0 AIZINOOIIN 14VHa

paulque)

uoissiwwoy wawidojarag Aunwiiiod sbuds a4 eues

(s)eay paloid
:Aauaby slwdojanspay Jo sWEN




S@)eWIISa ale sjunowe juauiled ||y

Jeak aad volpiw g g4 Ajrewixosdde) Juawialaul xey Jo 3diaaal o3 Joird f3unog v Aq pajonpap ale sjuatlhed LopEs UORIIS -
seale jaafold ayj jo ay| aiua sy ybnoiyy pasinbal ate sjuswdied ybnosyy ssed “sjuswied Z|~1[0Z pue L1-010Z aus Ajuo sapnjoul uoyebijqo payodal ayl :L 3joN

00'571'980'2 § | 00°s21'980'C $] - | | S $Joosziesoz  §Joosereizy  § suones|qQ JeuiQ - slejol]
- $ (82
- $ (e
- $ (92
- $ (52
- $ ez
- $ (cz
- $ sjuswiAed ybnoil) ssed Z1-1102 pue |1-0102 AUN0D v (1Lovee) wawAhed ybnoiyL ssed|(ze
00°000'80L  $ | 00°000'80L 0000080} 00°000'812 slusWAed YBnoly) ssed Z1-1102 pue |1-0L0Z[  “ISIQ J00UdS PaHUM BpeliN ET-HBMION (L09gg) JuawAed ybnoiy )L ssed[(Lg
00°009'8  $|00009'8 0070098 00°00%LL sjuswAed ybnoiy] ssed Z1-1102 pue L1-0L0Z ISIQ [0649S paliun Dgv/| (L09¢e¢) wawhed ybnoiy | ssed|(0e
00700025 $ [ 007000°2S 00°000°25 00°008'01 sjusWAed ybnoay) ssed Z1-1102 pue L1-010Z 1510 968j0] WWo) 0puoH oy (L09gg) WawAed ybnoiy] ssed|(6l
0070005k  $ [ 00°000°GL 00°000°5) 00°002°0€ sjuswAed ybnoiuy) ssed ¢1-11.02 PUe L1-0L0Z 1510 963][0] WWoY SojIe) (L09¢g) Juswiked ybnoiy) ssed|(gl
00'000'2v€  $ | 00°000'2PE 00°000°2v€ 00°000'169 sjuswAed ybnoly) ssed Z1-11.02 Pue L1-0L0T 181(1 10040 YBIH UoIUN JONUYA] (L09gg) JuswiAed ybroiy] ssed[(ZL
00°0€S $ [ ooogs 00°0£S 00°0.0°1 SjuSWAEd YBnoay) ssed Z1-1102 pue L1-0L0Z 1810 j00Yas Al JalIUAA (L09¢g) JuswiAed ybnoy] ssed|(gl
00°000cS  $ [ 00°000°¢S 00°000°cS 60°000°201 sjualAed (yBnoll] ssed z1-1102 PUe L1-0102 1510 [0049S JIIUAM Uinog (Zogge) wwawhed ybnoy] ssed|(gl
00°000'es  $ | 00°000'cS 00°000°€5 00°000°201 sjusluAed UBnoi] ssed Z1-110Z PUE | L-0L0Z 351 J00Y9S SOJRIN S0 (Logeg) Juawied ybnoiy] ssed|(yL
0000076 $ [ 00700076 0000076 00°000°061 sjuaWAed ybnolt| ssed z}-110Z PUe L1-0L02 18107 [00Ydg AlID @xeT s (L09¢g) Juawied ybnoiy ] ssed|(cl
000052k  $ | 00°005°2L 00°005°21 00°002'62 sjusiAed ybnoiyL ssed Zi-1102 PUe 11-0L02 p3 0 800 AUnod v (L09¢gg) WaWAed ybnoly| ssed|(zl
00°0£S ¢ [ oooes 00°0ES 00°0L0°L sjusliAed ybnoiyL ssed Zi-110Z bue 11-0L02 3810 JusLuysiua|day] Jajepn (L09¢g) JuswiAed ybnoly] ssed|(11
000060,  $ [ 00°006°0L 0000601 00700022 sjuaiAed ubnolyl ssed gi-11.0¢ pue L1-0102 AMIN Uiseg [enuad (L09ge) Juswied ybnoiy] ssed|(0l
00°000'%6L $ [ 007000761 00°000'v61 00°000°26¢ sjustiAed yBnonL ssed gi-110g pue LL-0107 S4S 0 A0 (L0geg) JuswWied ybnoiy] ssed|(s
00'69p $ | 00'g9p 00°59% 00°0%6 siuawhed ubnoi] ssed zi-11.0zZ Pue |1-0102 JEMION JO AID (£09€ee) JuswAed ybnoiy] ssed|(8
00°0EY $ [ o0'oey 000 00°0.8 sjusAed ybnoiy ] ssed gi-} 102 PUE |1-010¢ epelly &40 1D (L09¢¢) JuswAed ybnoiy] ssed|(Z
0000105 $ [ 00700105 0000108 000517101 sjusWiAed ybnoy1 ssed gi-110Z Pue 11-0102 JSIQ uoheueS Aunod v (L09¢¢) Juawhed ybnoiyL ssed|(9
00029'L  $[00029°) 000291 00°0.2°¢ sjusluAed Ubnoiyl ssed gi-} L0z bue 11-0102 "JS107 J0JJU0D JOJ03A IS V' Jaleais) (L09¢¢) Juswihed yBnoiyL ssed|(g
00089'L  $[o00s9) 00°059'L 00'gZe’e sjuswWiAed ybnoiyl ssed gi-110g Pue 11-0102 Js1g Aejawag ayeT sl (£09¢¢) JuswAed ybnoiy] ssed|(y
0000L°9¢  $[0000L'9¢ 00°00.°9¢ 00°00L'%L sjustiAed ybnoy ] ssed g1-1 102 Pue 11-0102 [03ucg paold Aunod vl (£09¢e¢) JuawAed ybnoiy L ssed|(g
00°00L'92  ${00°00L792 00°001'92 00°00L'2S SjusWAed ybnolyL ssed gi-110¢ Pue 11-0L02 ald Auno) v (L09g¢) Juswhed ybnoly] ssed|(z
00°000'620°L $ | 00°000°G20°L 00°000'620°L 00000120 sjuswAed ybnoiy ] ssed g}-4 10z pue 11-0L02 {B13Ua9) AUNo) v (£09g€) Juawhed ybnoly | ssed|(L
[eloL unp fepy 1dy Jey qsd 6 JB3A [80s51d Mr 3}ON) uogduasag 2afed uonebi|qo 19aq / sweN Josfoid
uung ang |ejo. uonebilgo Jo 193
yuows Aq sjuswied a 5oL mEucmﬁWO _Mom_
691YE PUB L9LPE U0NJI3G - 92 gV J3d
210262 110y SNOILVYSITE0 ¥3HLO - 3T1NA3IHOS LNJNAVC NOILYDITA0 dAZIND0I3Y 14vdd
G00-2L02-¥'S uoinjosay
v 1l1gIiHX3 pauIquio) (s)ealy palosd

safed G Jo g abey

uoissiwwo) Juswdojanag Aluniutio)) sbullds a4 ejues

:Aausby Juawdoaaspay Jo sweN




EVEE6Z 1L || 659616 651 '€EL 005'E86 951°EEL 306°160°0L || 656'L€8 1E52200Z CILIET LT , sabed |l - g0} puerd
0 0 0 0 [} [ a $z1'980'C S6LELZY suoyeBIqo Jeto ~ slejo L]
] 0 0 0 0 [ [ 0 9/Z960°C ¥ abed - sjejoL|
[ 0 0 0 0 [ [ 0 119'12L8 £ eBed - siejoL|
0 0 [} 0 [} [ 4 ] 265 696 OF z afied - sjzjo
SYEE6C YL | 659616 651 'EEL 005°€86 8SLEEL §06'1600L | 656288 507986 L1 866 Y2 ¥VT abed siL - slejol]
0
000°SL 000'S) 3L1dy] 000°S1 000°51L pie0g JBISIaAQ 19} SeOIAIeS [eBa] pauUluiiaiepun lesuneg jeBaT preog WBistano|(0e
0 ETRRY) pauIslepun PUE| paUMO D 10} Juewiseiby Juewdojeasq|  sleuped obejioH o4 ejueg| JUeWioaiBy Uonisodsig pue JelwdojeAsq sieuied ebejIe @4 ENES] (62
0 dildy 58L'20L'2 'Sp8as0ld Jo UO; oummﬂ 104 Justuaslby, 09 @ uUospe ueyeuei9opn ucmEmmﬂm.( uopisodsiq Emnchu AmN
0 dL1dy OD0.0Nn :|m|_w pie0qiapeady J0 Uooniisuoy 10} 30UB]SISSY| oy ;m«cmO JjoniL suwo] | :w._w pi20qiopeay] Jo} asle}s|ssy Ucqoniisuog pN
00152y 058'0L 059°0L 058°0L 058'0Z 058'02 05801 ALLd¥[ 002058 002058 HRLSIUILPY FousBy SR sastiedxd anensiuipy| (92
2S8ECL 90T v9'0C Y902 TH90T Th90C 90T 11d¥| 00L°Lv 00.°26C 51503 JuslusBeuen Riedoid SAOHEA JusweBeuel Aradold| (5
0057 0S¥ J11du[ 05T 0057 §00|AI5S BUNSUOD GRERIY xjjsiB0 puogl $30] GBERGY|(he
00008 000°0¢ AL1dM[ 600'ae 000°6E So6 JUeDY [esly Sued sn 5084 JUaby 20814 | (€2
000°CL 0002 JLLdd| 000vE 50072 sasjAles PNy G| 58010388 J1pNY| (22
00870 008701 4114} 00840l 008%01 saueinsu] Apedold pue Ager Widr 19| IR 0F3
000'058 1591} 189°L51 199151 939171 999'11 195 L7L 11| OveV96 L CERE [I7A J5Je, MeN JO UoRanAsieg pue Ubisad $4530 A0 (2 5u02) 13 [OM\ 1878 MBN| (62
000°000°C | 00D 00§ 000 008 00008 500005 306005 000008 411d4] D0EZrYe 00EZrr'e 16J080 POOYIOqUBISN 30 UojeAdtoy S50 Ao 303001l UOJEAOUSY JAJUa0 BOOHIDOqUBIEN
0 d1ldd 000'622'21 Justieiou] Xe | sies A G peasxg 0} jJoN aseyaing puel mmﬂ%lmthmI je mog\/ juswasiby uolisodsiq pe Jualudo[sas sbuudg abejliaH je sane| >ﬂ
1] puey ug 000'00L't mco_um._mmO mEom:O Joj sesnypusdxy jo u:QE>N& SNOUBA] sainjipusdxg Miagoy ButsnoH Z1-1Lo2[ (21
000°s2L 000'STL I11c%| 000 05¢ 000692 LI B PepURJUN J0 JUSWAR Ul G1eqg 0f UGRERO S50 AID|  (PAUIGUIOD) SsRIIGRI PAPURUN JO 81eqs [euafiodoid J0 JUsWAed 10, Juelisaiby| (9]
4 ALLdd 000'569'7 GN0D ] Qi JusuIselBe Jad Ueo] 4830 0 (PAlg UOIBUIGSE) XeL Se[Es - Ueo] yuswenu] XeL| (S} |
[+ 11| 000'006°'L Q LOZ ‘0t sunp j0 se) Jusllaidu) xe) almn} jo Leo ac:oO mm_mm=< 507 A.U>_m uojbulyse, ueoT juawialou] xe| | ﬂ
[ 31149 SYYE6 T Weliked JvaaS 1102 Pund 0f UB0] pund BUSAGH 5G5 (PoUIqWoD) UEo 43 L10T|(E
0 3L1du Y5161 JueuwiAed IyH3S 0102 Pund o} UBod pung puog 85002 500 TpAjg UGIBUIGSEN) UE0T] Jvu3S 0L02|(2L
0 3L1dy 22505 01 Jslfed JYH3S 0L0¢ pund o} Uea Pun3 PUOg 69002 909 {pejepfiosuod) Ueo Jvu3s 010g|(L)
OLEBZL oLE'STL 3L1dd| 029'95¢ YYELET L Juouked 3vyS 900¢ Pund of Uso VG089 {pauiquiod) Ueo Jvai3 9002{{0L
1€0'cel Le0eeL d11dy| 290%ve 0ZL726 WskIAed Va3 G00¢ pund Of UE0T Y4050 aUIqUI0D) UBDT Jvad S002)(6
0 414N 000°000°} awed JvyE y00Z pund o3 Ueo’ punj BuisnoH 509 (pajepiiasuod) pund BuisnoH D@D Woid ueo’ 4vy3 $00Z](8
SZLYEY L STLYEY' L 3L1.dd| S29'0sh'T 05,58} 'S5 SPUOS ZG0T 0 Y0MOd PUE ‘8661 'L66| PUeY ueg S 7 SoH8S spuog BupUMeY YoResolly XeL L002Z| (L
926'0v8'L 926'9v9'| ALLdd| 1516812 YZ6'GLL 9L SaAoY Juewdolanepey ueg sn § Sausg splog Uojesolly X2 aigexel 9062|(9
955001 95500} Ji1du| 15041 Y23 115 €5 sofiARoY Jusuidojenapey Fueg 50 '/ SoJ16S SPUog UoResdlly XeL 9002|(S
$0L'655 $01 635 JL1d%] 052299 Z9L'S8L'S (BujsnioH) spuod €661 PapunieY jueg SN '\ SeUdg Spuog BUIpUMSY Uogesolly XeL elqexel 00|
198°682°C 199'58.°¢ AL1dY| SLEES0 Y 1L§BLT 1L SPUOY <661 PUNjew/seRAjaY Weidojaropay UEg SO 'y sallag spuog BUIpUnjay UOFeao|ly XL 2002 (&
SVo'8LE L SV9'8.E | T11d4| 02649 L ZrvSss 8k SB[IAGoY JuewWdajenapey %UEE SN 7 Sa|1ag SpUog UOREAO|Y XEL LGDZ| @
925'€0C 925'£0¢ J11d%| 0E661€ SIG0ELL SPUGH £661 JO UORIOd BUISNOH PURjox jued SN {BuishoH) v 819 Spuog Uogeds]y el L00Z|(L
ealy «umwoun— pajepijosua) ayj o) >_m_ow [ejay g1 swIy|
[ejol Jegiuaseq JsquusaoN JeqopQ lsquiajdeg snBny Anp soineg JBBA [edsl] UoEBIqO 10 1980 uonduaseg sahed 0 J9aQg / aweN jaa(old
ZL02 ~ YUOW Aq SjuswiAed Bupungy | BUenaSnaIsioL | BulpuEiS (el
691¥E PUB J9LyE UORISS - 92 gV 43d
210292 judy (z1oz 234 - Inr) ATINAAHOS LNIIWAVC NOILYDIT1H0 AIZINDOITH 14v¥d AaNOD3S
S00-ZL0Z-v'S Uogniosay
g 11gIiHX3

sobed g Jo | ebed

PoUWI0D

()ealy pafold
:KaueBy Juawidolsaapay Jo suleN




0 0 0 0 0 0 To 268'956 9% obed S[UL - S/ejo.]
[
[} mucom_ 0£8'8L 4o paULIBIepUN 80-L0 AJ (sdnaig) ¢) sepelBd) [Eubis oBrelL | (0t |
0 %ﬂmi PeUSEpU dio paulIS}apu| 8[epIepeg J€ S09/19L - UGRealipolN 1eudls ourel] |(6Z |
0 spuog| 807 957 a3 [EIUEER (| eseld) SUCHEBRI 8uoZ on0] (8¢ |
0 Spuog]| 1688419 EE) pauLIsiepun (7 5l d) qeyoy 1905S [eHISTPuIepIeWWoD (72
0 Spuog| 1IES0L a0 pauLISIapUT UGHIRSUGosw/BUE] NS0y peoy elenld|(9e
0 spuod] 6L LL dio PaUILIBEPUN SUBJS Aeeds [euogosliq soeiday|(Ge
0 Spua| 289612 EE) paULI}epIn| SueIABIGL] JusuTedsd elid[(re
[} spucH 000°G0% EE) PaULIelepUr §jiBliaAcidul] Jooy UoReS alld| (e
0 mu:o.m.A 000°58 £l paUlLIEEpIN| TIoAA 161504 5 VSd “ASI - € 05eUd - Weysks Kiju3 ssalken| (@2
g Spuog 00022 4o PoULISapUn| 53
0 spuog BI8'SL EE) pauIelepU| {0z
0 Splog TITTOY dio PauIILIB}epUN| WovY JUsWdNb PUE JNONION PUedXa - £ “ON UOREFS B1l| (6L
0 Spicy 580°581 dio PaUILIS}EPUN 10jeIoUBS B0e|dey ~ 2 "ON UOREFS BIid| (8L
0 spucg 00061 a0 GeUIISERIn| Jiodies) BuysiXd 8s0pus - OH eld| (1
0 %ﬁ&_ 000°S EE) paulIa}epun 180167 I Ul 9BEIED PPy - DH olld|(9F
§ SpuoH| BE6C2L Y dio PaUIISISpUT Uoj§Ued X 9h0 - OH 6did| (5L
0 spuog| 000°00S dIo pauiIsjepuq| SjuellA0dU] Jied shosuefeasi| L
0 spucy 000°006 EE) PoUILISIRUN SUswar0Idu] sjersa oelo| (gt |
0 Spuog 000°009 di5 patjuisiepur] (07 BUpyied GnGs) | eseld - 3ped axe o[ 21 |
3 spuod 000°009 dio pauiIsjepln (07 Bubied YHON) | oseyd - ied a3 o (L1 |
0 spuog] paUMIIGI8PUN EE) pauIe}opu| BUping ssodind-RInN Jied malasse| (gL
0 Spuod] SLLBYS Jio pauIsiepUr] ] 8Seld - ted o%e1 a6 |
0 SpUoH 000°89% dio pauILIS}epU Ueld Japsely dojoaad - 18)U8D AV (8
0 Spuog| PaULIBIRPUN ) paUIIGIopUT] (5100[01d Yied 1aA) Ueld 193selN J1ed SA8|U
0 5pUoE 0007001 dio paUNISIepUr] SHed JB1eM SORIN 5071[(9
0 Spuog SYETY did paUILISIERUT 18)UsD PooYI0oqGUBISN 2y 1e safeD Aunoes|(s
[ mucom_ 000°001 dio paUILIBI3pUN 151053 POOYIG0qUBISN 8UF 1€ ATEIGTT YoUelid OIeIN|
0 SpUoH| 0007002 dig pelIeieRUN JleH JejuaD) UMo - swoosisey eble] ajenousy| (€
0 spuog| 0007 dio e GINJONLS SPEUS Yied MelASYET|(Z |
0 spuog ovg'Zo1 dio paulLieIepuN Uojsuedxg leg Yoeus Jejueg axe|(, |
[ejol Jaquiesaq JaquisaonN Jaqopo lsquisideg sndny Anp aoinag 1Ba A [RISI] uogebliqo 40 3987 uoyduasaq saled uopeb)qo 1qag / aweN palold
2102 - Yiuows Aq sjustuAed Buipung Buung anq 1oL | Buipuessing fejoL
69LPE pUe L3Lpg UoRISS - 92 gV Jod
2102 ‘0z 1dy (z10Z 234 - 1nr) 3TINAIHOS INFWAY NOILYOITS0 QIZINDODTY 14VHd ANODIS
S00-2L0Z-VS uopnjosay
g LigiHX3 pauiquio) (s)eery j08fo1d
safied  jo g 9bed uojssiuWeg Jualudejerag :fauefy jueuidojaaapay jo sweN




2L0Z ~ Yiuow Aq sjustlided

Bujpuny

Buung ang {ei0)

Buipueising ejo).

0 0 lo 118'12.'8 abB S| ~ S[efo]
0
0 m_sam_ GECBLL dIo paulliIaepun (UBIS50) g1 / ejuswies - Sebueys Walshs Jatepa| (Ue
9 u._mam_ 000008 3| peULIaeRIN "Bpig UORBU[WEIOND Mo - 2 ‘ON JloAlosod|(6¢ |
0 %.amn_A 000°000°) did pauiuliaiepun (1 as8Ud) | 3UOZ - 13\ Jareps MeN] (82
0 spucg 400'00Z dio: pauIslepun :wamm 3 AU| Z 8seyd - Uley uoissiusuel] yourgl ANN
0 spuag| 000057 310 PaUWIS}epUn J[2day 7§ AUl + 958U - UlE[N UOISSIUSUEIL GougL[(oz
0 spuod| 500609 EI) pBUILISIepU Z 607 - [[oN) MON SeRiifoed JuswiesiL oussly|(6¢
0 spuog 00G°000'© EE) [EEEE ] Uo[EUBd X JoAIaSsY g 8U6Z MaN| (e
0 %Em._ 000°002 EE) [EEIE Z PUE | SON [I5M 10} SI0jelalas) ajqenad|(ee
0 spuod| TEYVEL EE) BAUILITGIapu IMIUINS g GDEUBIS 'SYSOD, - ¢ 85eud J8jU8) UMOL|([eZ
0 CE] BSV'EL ER) PRUILIEIePUNT (2 85811 d) Utjd 15358 163080 UMOL| (L2
g Spuog SELPEY EIE) PaLuLISepUn)| 307 BUped epiS 35aM - Jajue0 umo 1| (a¢ |
0 Spuog 75601y EE) POUIILISIEPUTT Buideaspue ] 1ejue0) UMOL| (61
0 spuog £65°0VC di5 [EEUEEy) [GPISROS) Spiefjog UeLjsepad - 150104 Ueqin| (@)
0 L] 000°000°2 EE) paUILLIBIRpUN UGHEledag apeid) MalA AeleA|(Z1 |
[ SpUoE 060'052 dio paufLIs}EpUN ( 9520 d) ealy pu| - UoF 5 BT 1es S| (GL
0 SpUoE 006°002 dio paUILISIEpUN TeUB[g Sljer] Uojesoy / 850810k (51 |
0 wucom.A peUIIBIRpUN] dio pauLIB}epUN B8 50671 ¥ S091 0 oA 95 - SAemvjied Peouequa
0 spuog pauwisiepun d1o peulLtalapun) >ND 2 1O e ydeibajs) - mxlﬂsafa& pasuequl((g)
0 spUog SIZ7E dio PAUILIBIEPUN FPniS 8nsay pue fepeds 10pHIog &| L
0 Spuog| 0002y dia pauiisepun (pSpUn OV 1) UOREZIUGIIUAS JeUBIS aAy eouaiol[(L1
0 Spuog| 981V d1o| poUNLIBIRpUN 1984 [esodsiq Buldesms jeans|{ol
0 Spuog| SRELY dig PaUWISTERIN 10 ON 000/SUeI0850y '10S/1id - Jonsed abpg| (6
0 EZE] 9662 EE) PoUIWISIEPUN sjuaLiaAoIduw] UEpain "pAE eIpuaiv|(g
1] spuog £6L°66L a1 paUlLIZIepUN uBlsa(] - ulelq Wil0)g uasualog| (L
0 Splog 0007L EE) pauiIaapun| EEEST: W [l
0 Spucg 0009} dIo pauISEpUN %9810 sjoRu0/KeMUBIH [elsdul] - Jeilied sbppg| (S
0 Spucy 7S She EE) pauiliisepun| Toe[0ld UORoeSIal] Mai, ASIIE/VeIpuoly| (7
0 E] 500021 a5 peuiisiapun 60780 Ad (S9n0I9) £) sepeibdy [eubls opel1[E |
0 SpoGE £15061 E) [EIETCT PIBYWOG|gRLGS - 12iSU] [BUBtS SueI [T |
4 Spuog| 886'CH 410 PaUILIBIEPUL (1aaU0]d ©/6 [o1) apebed abpud uudn mredad|(l |
[N EnBnY AT SIN0g Tes [easd GOReB|IG0 10 1380 Uodiiosag] SaAE UoReBIq0 1990 / eWEN Jo8[old]

S00-2L02-v'S uopnjosay

69LYE PUE L9LpE UORIAg - 92 gV Jad
(zLoz 93a - 1Nr) 3TINA3HIS INIWAV NOILYOITE0 AIZINDOITY L4VHA ANODIS

PoUIGLIoD

UDISSIWLOD JuewdoeAs( AUNLILIY SBULGS 84 Bjuesg

(s)ealy 1oafo1d
:KaueBy Juawdojaaapay Jo auleN




9/2'960°C

56 SIJL - 51}0]

(oe

(82

iz

&z

spaog

000°05Y

dio

[EUEERTS

[ERUGPISaY - UDISIGAUOD J40[ | J8ah S|

spuog

000°0s2

dId

PaULIBIepUn,

sifeday ainjead Jajeiy SNOBUE|Gos|N|

o|o]lo|oclolo|olo|o|elolo|ojojolo|ojo]|ojo|ojo|o|oclojo|ojojo|o|a]a

spuog

8/2'968'C

dio

[ENRUEERT

(v U0RE36]) ¢ GUGZ - [l 518N MaN

1301

Jaquiedaq ToqUWanoN 104oR0 Jequieldag

IshBny

Anp

2102 - iuow Aq juaitied

aoinog
Bugpun.

183 A [easly
Buung ang |ejo,

GoReB|q0 10 1950
Bujpueising [eoy,

uonduassq

seked

Uoneb|qo 1Gad / SWEN 399[0l|

2102 ‘92 ludy
5002102V Uopnjosay

g 11giHX3
sebed g o ¢ abeg

69LPE PUB L91PE UOWIIS - 92 Y I19d
(2102 934@ - 1Nr) 31NAIHOS INIWAVC NOILYIITHO AIZINDOITY L4vHa ANODIS

POUIGWIOD

Uo[SSIIW0Y JuswdojeAsq MIUNWWOD SBUUdS o4 BjueS

(s)eauy paloig
:foueby juswdojerapay Jo eweN




S3JRWIRSI ale sjunowe JuawAied Iy

{1ea£ sad uoniw g-¢$ A1ejewxoadde) Juswaiout xey jo 3d1asal o3 Joud fjunog v Aq ps3anpap ale sjuawifed Lopes UORIDS -
sease Josfoid 3y Jo ayif ainua ayy ybnoay; pasinbal ase sjuswhed ybnoiyy ssed “syuswied Z1-L10Z PuUe L1L-0L0Z 343 Ajuo sapnjoul uogebiigo papodal ayl i ajoN

s| - s - R $] - S $ [ szies0z $]selcizy | suopeBilqQ JBRQ - sejoL]
$ (8¢
S (T
3 (9C
$ (¢
S (23
$ (€2
3 siuaWAed YbnoiyL ssed Z1-11.0Z Pue 1 1-010g| AUnNod v (1ovee) uswheg ybnoiy ) ssed|(2z
$ 000'80L 00082 sjuawAed ybnoyL ssed ¢l-1 102 PUE 11-0102|  3sid [0040S paliun epelii e1-jemioN (Z0g¢ee) Jwawhed ybnoll] ssed|{iz
S 009'8 00r'ZL sjuswied Ubnoiy L ssed z1-11.02 Pue 110102 181 [00U9S paliun Ogv| (Z0gee) wslhed ybnaly) ssed|(oz
H 000'2§ 00570l sjusAed ybnoiyL ssed g1-110¢ Pue 1 1-0L0g| 1510l absjie)) WWoD opuoH ofy (20geg) wawhed ybnaly] ssed|(l
g 000'GL 002'0€ sjuaWAed ybnouy L ssed gi-1 102 pue 1 1-0L0g| 1513 aBs][0) WWoJ SajIaY) (209¢e) Wauwhed ybnoiy L ssed|(gl
$ 000'Z¥E 000°L69 sjuslWAed UbnoiyL ssed Zi-110¢ PUe 1 L-0L0Z] 18I [00U9S UBIH UOIUM JBIRIUAA (Z09¢e) wawhed ybnouyy ssed|(Z1
$ (53] 0.0°1 sjualAed Ubnoty | ssed Z1-1102 PUE L1-0L0Z ISiQ 100438 A1 JBIRIUW (209¢¢) Juslifed ybnoiyL ssed|(gl
5 000°€S 000°20L sjuawAed UbnolyL ssed zL-L 102 Pue [1-0L0T 1510 10049 JBIHUM Yinos| (Zogee) Juawhed ubnoiy | sseq|lgL
$ 000'€S 000°201 SjuswAed UBNoIYL ssed Z1-110Z PUe | L-0L0Z 181(7 0023 SOJBIN 567 (Z09¢e) Juslihed ybnoaL ssed|(yL
$ 00076 000°061 sjuaifed UBnoiy) ssed z1-1102 PUE 11-0L0Z 810 100098 MO e el (z09¢ee] Juawhed ubnoay L sseqd|lel
$ 00§'2) 00T'ST sjusiliAed UBnolyL ssed g1-1 LOZ PUe | 10102 P3 40 o0 AUNoD v (L0gee) Justiked ybno [ ssed|(zi
$ 0E5 0.0, sjuswiAed UBNoIYL ssed z1-1L0Z PUE |[0L0T 1510 Jusluysiuaday Jejep) (Zogee) ustiAed ybnoi | ssed|(LL
$ 00601 00022 SpaWABd YBnouy L ssed Z1-110Z PUe |1-0L02 QMIN uiseg [euad (/09e€) usifed ybnon L ssed[(olL
$ 00076 00026 sjuatifed Ybnoly L, ssed Z1-1.102 PUB 11-0102 S48 0 RO (Looge) uswhed ybnoly] ssed|(e
$ [ 06 sjusliAed ybnoiy L ssed Z1-1102 PUe 11-0102 S[eMIoN Jo A0 (Z09ee) slwiked Ybnoly ssed|(g
$ (533 0/8 sjusulifed UBnoyL ssed z1-1 102 Pue }|-0102 epeliy 27 Jo K10 (Zogee) usuifed ybnoiy] Ssed|(L
$ 00109 0517101 sjusuhed ybnoiy L ssed Z1-L1.02 PUe 11-0L02 1sIq uoepues funod v (£0g¢ee) Juswhed ybnoly] ssed|{g
$ 029°L 0.2 SjusUiAed YbnolyL ssed Z1-1 102 PUB L1-0L0Z 18I0 10JJUOD JOPBA 158, VT J8jeals) (L6gee) Juewhed ybnolyL ssed|{s
S 059'L gze'e SjuBWARH UbnoJyL ssed Z1-11.02 PUB 1,-0L0g| I51Q Alejswa) e el (209¢e) Juswhed ybnouy | ssed|(
$ 0049 00L'pL sjuswed YbnolyL ssed g1-11.0Z Pue LL-0L0C loJus) poold AUNoY v (20gee) Jusulfed ybnoy L ssed|(e
$ 00L'92 00.28 sluswhed UBnolyL'ssed g1-1 102 Pue LL-0L0Z ali4 AUno) v (Zogee) waltlAed YBnolu ) ssed|(z
s 0005201 0001202 sjuslAed UBnoJy L ssed 21-110¢ PUE L 1-0L0¢] [esausg) Aunol v (209g€) Juauifed ybnaly L ssed((L
[GEN Jaquiaoeq JaquisaoN J3qop0 Jsqaides 1snbny Anp 5 Jes A 20514 wv SJON) uonduasag aaked uonediiqQ 193Q 7 aweN 1safoid
uunRg sng ejo. uolnen), Plopst-T
yiuow Aq sjuswied Ling eng 1oL mc‘wnc m_mw._o _Mom
691P¢ Pue L9Lpg UOIS8g - 92 gV J8d

2102 ‘oz 1y SNOILVYDITHO ¥3H10 - ITNAIHIOS INJNAVd NOILLYOITFO0 A3ZINDOITY Ldvud

S00-ZLOZ-YS Lognjosay

g 11glHX3 paUIUIO) (s)ealy jo8loid

sabed g Jo g abeq

ualssiuiiog juswdoereg Aunwiuion sbuuds a4 BlUES

:fouaBy jusiwdajanspay jo aweN




PLEASE SEE ITEM 3A

|0A



City of Santa Fe Springs

City Council Meeting April 26, 2012

ORDINANCE FOR INTRODUCTION/PASSAGE

Ordinance No. 1030 — An Urgency Ordinance Enacting and Adopting Supplement
15 to the Code of Ordinances for the City of Santa Fe Springs and Declaring an

Emergency

RECOMMENDATION
That the City Council waive further reading and introduce and adopt Ordinance No.
1030 which would update the City’s Municipal Code by codifying all Ordinances

passed by the Council since the last update.
1

BACKGROUND

The City of Santa Fe Springs contracts with American Legal Publishing Corporation
to codify its ordinances on an ongoing basis; the last update was adopted by the
Council on December 9, 2010. At this time, American Legal has completed
Supplement No. 15, which brings the Code of Ordinances up to date as of March
14, 2012.

To provide for the usual daily operation of the City and for the immediate
preservation of the public peace, health, safety, and general welfare of the City, it is
necessary that the City Council adopt Ordinance No. 1030 and declare that it be in
effect immediately upon adoption.

i

,Thaddeus McCormack :
City Manager

Attachment(s)
Ordinance No. 1030
Supplement 15 to the City’s Code of Ordinances

Report Submitted By: Anita Jimenez Date of Report: April 18, 2012
City Manager’s Office ‘ \




REMOVE OLD PAGES
Title Page

City Officials Page

3,4
45, 46
49,50

61 through 64

5,6

29 through 32

5,6
31,32

73 through 76

SANTA FE SPRINGS, CALIFORNIA
Instruction Sheet
2012 S-15 Supplement
INSERT NEW PAGES
Title Page

City Officials Page

ADOPTING ORDINANCE

5,6

 TITLE III: ADMINISTRATION
3,4
45, 46
49, 50
61 through 64
TITLE V: PUBLIC WORKS

5,6

TITLE IX: GENERAL REGULATIONS

29 through 32F

TITLE XIII: GENERAL OFFENSES
5 through 6B
31,32
PARALLEL REFERENCES

73 through 76



Santa Fe Springs - Instruction Sheet

REMOVE OLD PAGES INSERT NEW PAGES

INDEX

13, 14 13,14

memyf 02/12



. CITY OF SANTA FE SPRINGS, CALIFORNIA

CODE OF ORDINANCES

2012 S-15 Supplement contains:
Local legislation current through Ordinance 1028, passed 12-8-11

AMERICAN LEGAL PUBLISHING CORPORATION

432 Walnut Street Cincinnati, Ohio 45202-3909 (513) 421-4248




COPYRIGHT © 2012

AMERICAN LEGAL PUBLISHING CORPORATION



2012 S-15

CITY OF SANTA FE SPRINGS
LIST OF OFFICIALS

Mayor

Mayor Pro Tem
Councilmember
Councilmember
Councilmember
City Manager

City Attorney
Deputy City Clerk

Director of Finance and
Administrative Services

Fire Chief

Director of Planning and
Development

Director of Police Services

Director of Public Works

Police Chief

Assistant Director of Public Works
Director of Library and Cultural Services
Director of Parks and Recreation Services

Director of Family and Human Services

William K. Rounds

Richard J. Moore

Joseph D. Serrano, Sr.

Luis M. Gonzalez

Juanita Trujillo

Thaddeus McCormack

Steven Skolnik

Anita Jimenez

Jose Gomez

Alex Rodriguez

Paul R. Ashworth
Dino Torres
Donald Jensen
Jeff Piper

Noe Negrete
Hilary Keith
Carole Joseph

Maricela Balderas






ORDINANCE NO. 1021

AN URGENCY ORDINANCE ENACTING AND ADOPTING SUPPLEMENT NO. 14 TO THE CODE
OF ORDINANCES FOR THE CITY OF SANTA FE SPRINGS

WHEREAS, American Legal Publishing Corporation of Cincinnati, Ohio has completed Supplement No.
14 to the Code of Ordinances of the City of Santa Fe Springs, which Supplement contains all ordinances of a
general and permanent nature enacted since the prior Supplement to the Code of Ordinances of the City of Santa

Fe Springs; and

WHEREAS, American Legal Publishing Corporation has recommended the revision or addition of certain
sections of the Code of Ordinances, which are based on or make reference to sections of the City of Santa Fe
Springs Municipal Code; and

WHEREAS, it is the intent of the City Council to accept these updated sections in accordance with the
changes of the law of the City of Santa Fe Springs; and

WHEREAS, it is necessary to provide for the usual daily operation of the municipality and for the immediate
preservation of the public peace, health, safety, and general welfare of the municipality that this ordinance take
effect immediately upon its adoption.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY OF SANTA FE SPRINGS DOES ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1.  That Supplement No. 14 to the Code of Ordinances of the City of Santa Fe Springs, as
submitted by American Legal Publishing Corporation of Cincinnati, Ohio, and as attached hereto, be and the same
is hereby adopted by reference as if set out in its entirety.

Section 2. Such Supplement shall be deemed published as of the day of its adoption; and approval by the
City Council and the Deputy City Clerk is hereby authorized and ordered to insert such Supplement into the copy
of the Code of Ordinances kept on file in the Office of the City Clerk.

Section3.  This ordinance is declared to be an urgency ordinance and shall take effect immediately upon
its adoption.

ADOPTED AND APPROVED this 9th day of December 2010.

Joseph D. Serrano, Sr. /s/
Mayor

ATTEST:

Anita Jimenez /s/
Deputy City Clerk

2012 S-15



Santa Fe Springs - Adopting Ordinance



CHAPTER 30
Section
General Provisions
30.01  City Hall and Council Chamber
designated
30.02 Interference with appointments or
removals in administrative service
prohibited
30.03  Salary of Council members
Meetings
30.15 Time and place; meetings to be public
30.16  Adjourned meetings; time
30.17  Notice of adjournment not required;
exception
30.18  Special meetings; notice required
30.19  Quorum
30.20 Compelling attendance of members at
meetings
30.21  Conduct of meetings

Statutory reference:
City Council, see Cal. Gov't Code §§ 36502
and 36513 to 36516

GENERAL PROVISIONS

§ 30.01 CITY HALL AND COUNCIL
CHAMBER DESIGNATED.

(A) That certain building designated and located
at 11710 Telegraph Road shall be named and
designated as the “City Hall” in and for the city. (‘64
Code, § 2-1)

2012 S-15

: CITY COUNCIL

(B) That certain room at 11710 Telegraph Road,
identified as the Council Chamber, shall be designated
as “Council Chamber” of the City Council. (‘64
Code, § 2-4)

(Ord. 102, passed - - ; Am. Ord. 314, passed 8-3-67)

§ 30.02 INTERFERENCE WITH
APPOINTMENTS OR REMOVALS IN
ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICE PROHIBITED.

Neither the City Council nor any of its members
shall direct or request the appointment of any person
to, or his removal from, office by the City Manager or
any of his subordinates or in any manner take part in
the appointment or removal of officers and employees
in the administrative service of the city. Except for
the purpose of inquiry, the City Council and its
members shall deal with the administrative service
solely through the City Manager and neither the City
Council nor any member thereof shall give orders to
any subordinates of the City Manager, either publicly
or privately.

(‘64 Code, § 2-16) (Ord. 18, passed --)

§ 30.03 SALARY OF COUNCIL MEMBERS.,

In accordance with the provisions of Cal. Gov’t
Code § 36516, the compensation of the members of
the City Council shall be $1,174.71 per month, each
payable monthly.

(‘64 Code, § 2-16.1) (Ord. 135, passed - - ; Am.
Ord. 731, passed 4-28-88; Am. Ord. 771, passed
4-26-90; Am. Ord. 857, passed 7-13-95; Am. Ord,
876, passed 6-26-97; Am. Ord. 900, passed 6-24-99;
Am, Ord. 916, passed 4-26-01; Am. Ord. 973, passed
11-17-05; Am. Ord. 980, passed 9-28-06; Am. Ord.
987, passed 1-10-08; Am. Ord. 1022, passed 2-10-11)




MEETINGS

§ 30.15 TIME AND PLACE; MEETINGS TO BE
PUBLIC.

(A) The regular meetings of the City Council
shall be held in the Council Chamber on the second
and fourth Thursdays of each calendar month,
beginning at the hour of 6:00 p.m. In the event that
any of such Thursdays shall fall on holidays, the
regular meeting for that day shall be held on the
immediately preceding Tuesday in the Council
Chamber. (‘64 Code, § 2-5)

(B) All meetings of the City Council shall be
public. (‘64 Code, § 2-6)
(Ord. 1, passed - - ; Ord. 15A, passed - - ; Ord.
704, passed 11-13-86; Am. Ord. 949, passed 1-22-04)
Statutory reference:
City Council meetings, see Cal. Gov't Code
§§ 54953 to 54962
For additional provisions, see Cal. Gov’t Code
§§ 36802, 36803, 36805 to 36811, 36813,
and 36814

§ 30.16 ADJOURNED MEETINGS; TIME.

(A) Any regular meeting of the City Council, or
adjourned session thereof, may be adjourned to a
stated day and hour which shall be specified in the
order of adjournment; and when so adjourned, such
adjourned meeting shall be a regular meeting for all
purposes. Such adjourned meeting may likewise be
adjourned, and when so adjourned, shall be a regular
meeting for all purposes. (‘64 Code, § 2-7)

(B) In the event any order of adjournment of a
City Council meeting fails to state the hour at which
the adjourned meeting is to be held, such adjourned
meeting may be validly held on the day specified in
the order of adjournment, if held at the hour
prescribed for regular meetings. (‘64 Code, § 2-8)
(Ord. 1, passed - - ; Ord. 15A, passed --)

2004 S-9

Santa Fe Springs - Administration

§ 30.17 NOTICE OF ADJOURNMENT NOT
REQUIRED; EXCEPTION.

No notice of any adjournment of any regular
meeting or adjourned regular meeting of the City
Council, when such adjournment is made by the City
Council, or by members thereof when a quorum is not
present, need be given, as all members of the City
Council are charged with the duty and responsibility of
ascertaining the time and place of each such regular
meeting and adjourned regular meeting. In cases
where a meeting is adjourned by the City Clerk,
pursuant to the provisions of state law, written notice
of the date and time to which the meeting has been so
adjourned shall be given to the Mayor and each
Council member at least three hours before the
adjourned meeting.

(‘64 Code, § 2-9) (Ord. 1, passed - -; Ord. 15A,
passed --)

§ 30.18 SPECIAL MEETINGS; NOTICE
REQUIRED.

Special meetings of the City Council may be
called and notice thereof given, as contemplated under
the provisions of state law pertaining to such matters.
Any special meeting of the City Council may also be
validly called and held without further notice if all of
the members of the City Council, and other persons or
agencies who may be entitled to notice of special
meetings under the provisions of Cal. Gov’t Code
§ 54956, shall give their consent in writing to the
holding of such special meeting and such consent is on
file in the office of the City Clerk at the time of the
holding of such meeting. A telegram or letter from a
Council member, or other person or agency entitled to
notice, consenting to the holding of the special
meeting shall be deemed to be a consent in writing
within the meaning of the terms as expressed in this
section. Atany special meeting, the power of the City
Council to transact business shall be limited to the
subjects and matters referred to in the written notice or
written consent, pursuant to which such meeting is
held.

(‘64 Code, § 2-10) (Ord. 1, passed - -)
Statutory reference:
City Council meetings generally, see Cal. Gov't
Code §§ 36805 and 36806
For additional provisions, see Cal. Gov't Code
§ 54956



Taxation 45

Ord. 497, passed 5-13-75; Ord. 522, passed 5-26-77,
Ord. 545, passed 6-22-78; Am. Ord. 791, passed
5-9-91; Ord. 793, passed 5-23-91; Ord. 822, passed
3-11-93; Am. Ord. 855, passed 7-13-95)
Cross-reference:

Business regulations generally, see Title XI

UTILITY USERS TAX

§ 35.105 SHORT TITLE.

This subchapter shall be known as the “Utility
Users’ Tax Law of the City of Santa Fe Springs.”
(‘64 Code, § 13A-1) (Ord. 648, passed 6-28-84; Am.
Ord. 1015, passed 7-28-10)

§ 35.106 DEFINITIONS.

For the purpose of this subchapter, the following
definitions shall apply unless the context clearly
indicates or requires a different meaning.

ANCILLARY TELECOMMUNICATION
SERVICES. Services that are associated with or
incidental to the provision, use or enjoyment of
telecommunications services, including but not limited
to the following services:

(1) CONFERENCE BRIDGING
SERVICE. An ancillary service that links two or
more participants of an audio or video conference call
and may include the provision of a telephone number.
Conference bridging service does not include the
telecommunications services used to reach the
conference bridge.

(2) DETAILED TELECOMMUNI-
CATIONS BILLING SERVICE. An ancillary
service of separately stating information pertaining to
individual calls on a customer’s billing statement.

(3) DIRECTORY ASSISTANCE. An
ancillary service of providing telephone number
information, and/or address information.

2012 S-15 Repl.

(4) VERTICAL SERVICE. An ancillary
service that is offered in connection with one or more
telecommunications services, which offers advanced
calling features that allow customers to identify callers
and to manage multiple calls and call connections,
including conference bridging services.

(5) VOICE MAIL SERVICE. Anancillary
service that enables the customer to store, send or
receive recorded messages. VOICE MAIL SERVICE
does not include any vertical services that the
customer may be required to have in order to utilize
the voice mail service

BILLING ADDRESS. The mailing address of
the service user where the service supplier submits
invoices or bills for payment by the customer.

CITY. The City of Santa Fe Springs.

COMMUNICATION SERVICES. See TELE-
COMMUNICATIONS SERVICES and ANCILLARY
TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES.

GAS. Natural or manufactured gas or any
alternate hydrocarbon fuel which may be substituted
therefore.

MOBILE TELECOMMUNICATIONS
SERVICE. The meaning and usage as set forth in the
Mobile Telecommunications Sourcing Act (4 U.S.C.
§ 124) and the regulations thereunder.

MONTH., A calendar month.
NON-UTILITY SERVICE SUPPLIER.,

(1) A service supplier, other than a supplier
of electric distribution services to all or a significant
portion of the city, which generates electricity for sale
to others, and shall include but is not limited to any
publicly-owned electric utility, investor-owned utility,
cogenerator, distributed generation provider, exempt
wholesale generator (15 U.S.C. § 79z-5a), municipal
utility district, federal power marketing agency,
electric rural cooperative, or other supplier or seller of
electricity;

(2) An electric service provider (ESP),
electricity broker, marketer, aggregator, pool



46 Santa Fe Springs - Administration

operator, or other electricity supplier other than a
supplier of electric distribution services to all or a
significant portion of the city, which sells or supplies
electricity or supplemental services to electricity users
within the city; or

(3) A gas service supplier, aggregator,
marketer or broker, other than a supplier of gas
distribution services to all or a significant portion of
the city, which sells or supplies gas or supplemental
services to gas users within the city.

PAGING SERVICE. A telecommunications
service that provides transmission of coded radio
signals for the purpose of activating specific pagers;
such transmissions may include messages and/or
sounds.

PERSON. Without limitation, any natural
individual, firm, trust, common law trust, estate,
partnership of any kind, association, syndicate, club,
joint stock company, joint venture, limited liability
company, corporation (including foreign, domestic,
and non-profit), municipal district or municipal
corporation (other than the city) cooperative, receiver,
trustee, guardian, or other representative appointed by
order of any court.

PLACE OF PRIMARY USE. The street address
representative of where the customer’s use of the
communications service primarily occurs, which must
be the residential street address or the primary
business street address of the customer.

POST-PAID TELECOMMUNICATION
SERVICE. The telecommunication service obtained
by making a payment on a communication-by-
communication basis either through the use of a credit
card or payment mechanism such as a bank card,
travel card, credit card, or debit card, or by charge
made to a service number which is not associated with
the origination or termination of the tele-
communication service.

PREPAID TELECOMMUNICATION
SERVICE. The right to access telecommunication
services, which must be paid for in advance and
which enables the origination of communications
using an access number or authorization code,
whether manually or electronically dialed, and that is

2010 S-14

sold in predetermined units or dollars of which the
number declines with use in a known amount,

PRIVATE TELECOMMUNICATION
SERVICE. A telecommunication service that entitles
the customer to exclusive or priority use of a
communications channel or group of channels between
or among termination points, regardless of the manner
in which such channel or channels are connected, and
includes switching capacity, extension lines, stations,
and any other associated services that are provided in
connection with the use of such channel or channels.
A communications channel is a physical or virtual path
of communications over which signals are transmitted
between or among customer channel termination
points (i.e., the location where the customer either
inputs or receives the communications).

SERVICE ADDRESS. The residential street
address or the business street address of the service
user., For a telecommunication service user,
SERVICE ADDRESS means either;

(1) The location of the service user’s
communication equipment from which the
communication originates or terminates, regardless of
where the communication is billed or paid; or,

(2) If the location in division (1) of this
definition is unknown (e.g., mobile tele-
communications service or VoIP service), the service
address means the location of the service user’s place
of primary use,

(3) For prepaid telecommunication service,
SERVICE ADDRESS means the location associated
with the service number or, if not known, the point of
sale of the services.

SERVICE SUPPLIER. Any entity or person,
including the city, that provides utility service to a
user of such service within the city.

SERVICE USER. A person required to pay a
tax imposed under the provisions of this subchapter.

STATE. The State of California.

STREAMLINED SALES AND USE TAX
AGREEMENT. The multi-state agreement commonly




Taxation 49

services, VolP, and private communication services,
provided that such rules are based upon custom and
common practice that further administrative efficiency
and minimize multi-jurisdictional taxation (e.g.,
Streamlined Sales and Use Tax Agreement).

(C) The Tax Administrator may issue and
disseminate to communication service suppliers,
which are subject to the tax collection requirements of
this subchapter, an administrative ruling identifying
those communication services, or charges therefore,
that are subject to or not subject to the tax of division
(A) of this section.

(D) As used in this section, the term
TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES shallinclude,
but is not limited to, charges for: connection,
reconnection, termination, movement, or change of
telecommunication services; late payment fees;
detailed billing; central office and custom calling
features (including but not limited to call waiting, call
forwarding, caller identification and three-way
calling); voice mail and other messaging services;
directory assistance; access and line charges;
universal service charges; regulatory, administrative
and other cost recovery charges; local number
portability charges; and text and instant messaging.
TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES shall not
include digital downloads that are not “ancillary
telecommunication services,” such as music,
ringtones, games, and similar digital products.

(E) To prevent actual multi-jurisdictional
taxation of communication services subject to tax
under this section, any service user, upon proof to the
Tax Administrator that the service user has previously
paid the same tax in another state or city on such
communication services, shall be allowed a credit
against the tax imposed to the extent of the amount of
such tax legally imposed in such other state or city;
provided, however, the amount of credit shall not
exceed the tax owed to the city under this section.

(F) The tax on communication services imposed
by this section shall be collected from the service user
by the service supplier. The amount of tax collected
in one month shall be remitted to the Tax
Administrator, and must be received by the Tax

2012 S-15 Repl.

Administrator on or before the twentieth day of the

following month.
(Ord. 1015, passed 7-28-10)

§ 35.109 ELECTRICITY USERS’ TAX.

(A) There is hereby imposed a tax upon every
person using electricity in the city. The tax imposed
by this section shall be at the rate of 5% of the charges
made for such electricity, and for any supplemental
services or other associated activities directly related
to and/or necessary for the provision of electricity to
the service user, which are provided by a service
supplier or non-utility service supplier to a service
user. The tax shall be collected from the service user
by the service supplier or non-utility service supplier,
or its billing agent.

(B) As used in this section, the term CHARGES
shall apply to all services, components and items that
are: necessary for or common to the receipt, use or
enjoyment of electric service; or, currently are or
historically have been included in a single or bundled
rate for electric service by a local distribution
company to a class of retail customers. The term
CHARGES shall include, but is not limited to, the
following charges:

(1) Energy charges;
(2) Distribution or transmission charges;
(3) Metering charges;

(4) Stand-by, reserves, firming, ramping,
voltage support, regulation, emergency, or other
similar charges for supplemental services to
self-generation service users;

(5) Customer charges, late charges, service
establishment or reestablishment charges, demand
charges, fuel or other cost adjustments, power
exchange charges, independent system operator (ISO)
charges, stranded investment or competitive transition
charges (CTC), public purpose program charges,
nuclear decommissioning charges, trust transfer
amounts (bond financing charges), franchise fees,




50 Santa Fe Springs - Administration

franchise surcharges, annual and monthly charges,
and other charges, fees or surcharges which are
necessary for or common to the receipt, use or
enjoyment of electric service; and,

(6) Charges, fees, or surcharges for
electricity services or programs which are mandated
by the California Public Utilities Commission or the
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, whether or
not such charges, fees, or surcharges appear on a
bundled or line item basis on the customer billing.

(C) Asused in this section, the term CHARGES
shall include the value of any other services, credits,
property of every kind or mnature, or other
consideration provided by the service user in
exchange for the electricity or services related to the
provision of such electricity.

(D) The Tax Administrator, from time to time,
may survey the electric service suppliers to identify
the various unbundled billing components of electric
retail service that they commonly provide to
residential and commercial/industrial customers in the
city, and the charges therefore, including those items
that are mandated by state or federal regulatory
agencies as a condition of providing such electric
service. The Tax Administrator, thereafter, may issue
and disseminate to such electric service suppliers an
administrative ruling identifying those components and
items which are: necessary for or common to the
receipt, use or enjoyment of electric service; or,
currently are or historically have been included in a
single or bundled rate for electric service by a local
distribution company to a class of retail customers.
Charges for such components and items shall be
subject to the tax of division (A) above.

(E) As used in this section, the term USING
ELECTRICITY shall not include the mere receiving
of such electricity by an electrical corporation or
governmental agency at a point within the city for
resale.

(F) The tax on electricity provided by
self-production or by a non-utility service supplier not
under the jurisdiction of this section shall be collected
and remitted in the manner set forth in § 35.111, All
other taxes on charges for electricity imposed by this
section shall be collected from the service user by the

2010 S-14

electric service supplier or its billing agent. The
amount of tax collected in one month shall be remitted
to the Tax Administrator, and must be received by the
Tax Administrator on or before the twentieth day of
the following month; or, at the option of the person
required to collect and/or remit the tax, such person
shall remit an estimated amount of tax measured by
the tax billed in the previous month or upon the
payment pattern of the service user, which must be
received by the Tax Administrator on or before the
twentieth day of the following month, provided that
such person shall submit an adjusted payment or
request for credit, as appropriate, within 60 days
following each calendar quarter. The credit, if
approved by the Tax Administrator, may be applied
against any subsequent remittance that becomes due.
(‘64 Code, § 13A-4) (Ord. 648, passed 6-28-84; Am.
Ord. 679, passed 9-26-85; Am. Ord. 1015, passed
7-28-10)

§ 35.110 GAS USERS’ TAX.

(A) There is hereby imposed a tax upon every
person using gas in the city, which is transported and
delivered through a pipeline or by mobile transport.
The tax imposed by this section shall be at the rate of
5% of the charges made for such gas, including all
services related to the storage, transportation and
delivery of such gas. The tax shall be collected from
the service user by the service supplier or non-utility
service supplier, or its billing agent, and shall apply to
all uses of gas, including but not limited to, heating,
electricity generation, and the use of gas as a
component of a manufactured product.

(B) As used in this section, the term CHARGES
shall apply to all services, components and items for
gas service that are: necessary for or common to-the
receipt, use or enjoyment of gas service; or, currently
are or historically have been included in a single or
bundled rate for gas service by a local distribution
company to a class of retail customers. The term
CHARGES shall include, but is not limited to, the
following charges:

(1) The commodity charges for purchased
gas, or the cost of gas owned by the service user
(including the actual costs attributed to drilling,
production, lifting, storage, gathering, trunkline,



City Policies . 61

§ 38.42 PROJECTS SUBJECT TO HERITAGE
ARTWORK IN PUBLIC PLACES PROGRAM
REQUIREMENT.

(A) The requirements of this subchapter shall
apply to the following activities:

(1) New residential, commercial, or
industrial development having total project costs of
$300,000 or more as determined by the city’s
valuation of building permits issued for the
development;

(2) Expansion of existing buildings,
remodeling of existing buildings, or tenant
improvements to existing buildings, when any such
work has a building permit valuation of $300,000 or
more; and

(3) A development project consists of all
facilities combined within the development site that
require a building permit.

(B) The value of land is excluded from this
requirement.

(C) The requirements of this subchapter shall not
apply to the following activities:

(1) Reconstruction of structures which have
been damaged by fire, flood, wind, earthquake, or
other calamity.

(2) Facilities dedicated to exclusive use by
a formally constituted non-profit organization
providing religious or cultural activities (i.e.
museums, theatres, and performing arts centers)
available to a broad public.
(Ord. 909, passed 4-27-00; Am. Ord. 1018, passed
10-28-10)

§ 38.43 REQUIREMENT TO PROVIDE
ARTWORK OR PAY IN-LIEU CONTRIBUTION.

When a project is subject to the requirements of
this subchapter, the developer shall comply with
provisions of either divisions (A) or (B) of this section
or a combination of both.

2012 S-15 Repl.

(A) Artwork contribution.

(1) When project costs equal or exceed
$300,000, the project developer shall acquire and
install artwork in a public place on or in the vicinity of
the project site as approved by the City Council
pursuant to this subchapter.

(2) The cost or value of such artwork shall
equal not less than 1% of the total project costs
excluding land.

(3) The developer may acquire and install
artwork in a public place not on the developer’s
property, subject to approval by the City Council.
Installation of artwork not on the developer’s property
shall be permitted if the City Council and the
developer agree that installing the artwork on the
developer’s property would not achieve the purposes
of the Heritage Artwork in Public Places Program or
would cause the artwork to be so isolated as to make
it minimally visible to the public at large.

(B) In-lieu contribution.

(1) Pursuant to § 38.47, the Heritage
Artwork in Public Places Fund (the “Fund”) is
created. When project costs equal or exceed
$300,000, the developer has the option to pay to the
Fund an amount equal to 1% of the total project costs
excluding land. This payment shall be made in lieu of
acquiring and installing artwork.

(2) The in-lieu payment shall be made by
the developer prior to issuance of a building permit,
unless otherwise provided by the City Council.

(Ord. 909, passed 4-27-00; Am. Ord. 1018, passed
10-28-10)

§ 38.44 COMPLIANCE.

(A) When the developer, with the concurrence of
the city, has elected to acquire and install an artwork,
the building permit shall not be issued until the City
Council has received and approved the Heritage
Artwork in Public Places application, conceptual art
plan, and final report. The certificate of occupancy
shall not be issued until the approved artwork has been
completed in compliance with this subchapter.




62 Santa Fe Springs - Administration

(B) When a developer has elected to pay the
Heritage Artwork in Public Places in-lieu fee, no
building permit shall be issued until such fee has been
paid.

(Ord. 1018, passed 10-28-10)

§ 38.45 HERITAGE ARTS ADVISORY
COMMITTEE; OPERATIONS.

(A) The Heritage Arts Advisory Committee
(HAAC) is hereby created as a committee appointed
by the City Council to advise the city’s Heritage
Artwork in Public Places Program. The HAAC shall
consist of a maximum of nine voting and six
non-voting members who may be reappointed at the
discretion of the City Council:

(1) A member of the Beautification
Committee to serve a minimum of two years.

(2) A member of the Historical Committee
to serve a minimum of two years.

(3) A member of the Planning Commission
to serve a minimum of two years.

(4) A member of the Chamber of
Commerce and Industrial League to serve a minimum
of two years.

(5) Each member of the City Council shall
appoint/reappoint one member to serve a minimum of
two years.

(6) A member of the City Council shall
serve in a nonvoting capacity as Council
representative to this Committee.

(7) The City Manager or designee shall
serve in a nonvoting capacity.

(8) The Director of Library and Cultural
Services or designee shall serve in a nonvoting
capacity.

(9) The Director of Planning and
Development or his appointed representative shall
serve in a nonvoting capacity.

2010 S-14

(10) A staff member from the Heritage
Park/Library Staff shall serve in a nonvoting capacity
as executive secretary for this Committee.

(11) A staff member from the Department of
Planning and Development shall serve in a nonvoting
capacity.

(B) The responsibility of the HAAC is to review
and make recommendations to the City Council
relative to the acquisition of artwork for public places.
Duties include, but are not limited to the following:

(1) Establish and approve Heritage Artwork
in Public Places Program policies and guidelines.

(2) Review Heritage Artworks in Public
Places applications and advise on the proposed artist,
artwork, budget and location among other
considerations.

(3) Recommend action to the City Council
on Heritage Artworks in Public Places applications.

(4) In consultation with the City Manager
or designee, prepare a Heritage Artwork in Public
Places Program annual report to the City Council
including proposed expenditures from the Heritage
Artwork in Public Places Fund.

(5) In consultation with the City Manager
or designee, ensure the inspection of the condition of
the artwork in the city’s collection and report on
needed maintenance and repair.

(6) Recommend action to the City Council
on proposed donations of artwork to the city in
accordance with the Donations of Artwork Policy.

(7) Recommend action to the City Council
on proposed deaccessioning of artwork in accordance
with the Deaccessioning of Artwork Policy.

(8) Provide public art advocacy, community
education, and awareness.

(C) Operations.

(1) At its regular meeting in July of each
year, the Committee shall elect a chairperson and a




City Policies 63

vice chairperson from its membership, with each to
serve a term of one year.

(2) If any member of the Committee fails
to attend three consecutive Committee meetings, or
fails to attend a total of five Committee meetings
during any fiscal year, then that member’s office shall
be deemed vacant, and a new member shall be
appointed. Absences due to extenuating
circumstances may be excused by the City Council.

(3) The terms of the five, Council
appointed voting members, shall expire on June 30 of
even numbered years and the terms of the four,
Committee/Commission/Chamber appointed voting
members, shall expire on June 30 of odd numbered
years. The terms shall be established by the drawing
of lots at the first official meeting of the Committee
following approval of this amendment to the City
Code.

(Ord. 909, passed 4-27-00; Am. Ord. 1018, passed
10-28-10)

§ 38.46 GUIDELINES FOR ARTWORK.

Guidelines for the approval and maintenance of
artworks shall include but are not limited to the
following criteria:

(A) Location of the artwork shall be in an area
on public or private property that is publicly
accessible, allowing unobstructed and unrestricted
access to the artwork.

(B) The artwork shall be constructed of
permanent materials requiring a low level of
maintenance.

(C) The following do not meet the criteria to be
considered as an art piece in the Heritage Artwork in
Public Places Program and, therefore, are
unacceptable:

(1) Artobjects which are mass produced or
of standard design, such as functional equipment,
fountains, or statuary objects.

(2) Reproductions or replicas, by
mechanical or other means, of original works of art

2012 S-15

except in the cases of film, video, photography,
printmaking or other media arts.

(3) The architecture of the building or
facility, or any portion thereof, including decorative,
ornamental, or functional elements unless designed by
a qualified artist specifically commissioned for this

purpose.

(4) Landscape architecture and landscape
gardening, except where these elements are designed
by an artist specifically commissioned.

(5) Directional elements such as
supergraphics, signage, or color coding.

(6) Services or utilities necessary to operate
or maintain the public art over time.

(D) Expressions of obvious bad taste or
profanity, which would likely be offensive to the
general public, are unacceptable.

(E) The artwork shall be in substantial
compliance with any Heritage Artwork in Public
Places policies, implementation procedures, and
developer guidelines adopted by the HAAC and City
Council.

(F) The continued maintenance of the artwork
shall be the responsibility of the developer or its
successors throughout the lifetime of the artwork,
unless otherwise negotiated and approved by the City
Council.

(1) The developer shall enter into a
covenant obligating the developer or successors in
interest to maintain the artwork over the life of the
artwork unless otherwise negotiated and approved by
the City Council.

(2) In the event the developer of the
property wishes to remove on-site art work, the city
must be notified in writing prior to its removal. The
developer shall be required to replace the artwork with
an artwork of equal value to the acquisition value or
current value as determined by an independent art
appraiser, whichever is greater. The replacement
artwork shall be subject to the same artwork selection
process as the original artwork. The developer shall be



64 Santa Fe Springs - Administration

required to notify the artist prior to removal pursuant
to the requirements of the California Preservation of
Works of Art Act and the Federal Visual Artists
Rights Act (VARA).

(3) If the artwork is removed, stolen or
destroyed beyond repair, the owner shall be
responsible for the replacement of the artwork or must
pay an amount equivalent to the original requirement
into the Fund.

(G) The HAAC shall insure the regular review
of all artwork in the collection. The committee shall
insure the inspection of the condition of each piece for
any damage and maintenance problems, including
lighting and landscaping of the piece. Current
property owners shall be informed of the committee’s
findings and recommendations.

(Ord. 909, passed 4-27-00; Am. Ord. 1018, passed
10-28-10)

§ 38.47 HERITAGE ARTWORK IN PUBLIC
PLACES FUND.

(A) Fund established. A Heritage Artwork in
Public Places Fund (Fund) shall be established and
shall continue from year to year unless specifically
terminated by the City Council.

(B) Accounting. Any monies collected in
accordance with the in-lieu contribution provisions of
§ 38.43 shall be deposited in a separate account
entitled the “Heritage Artwork in Public Places
Fund.” The City Manager or designee shall establish
accounting records sufficient to identify and control
these funds. The account containing these funds shall
earn interest and the earned interest shall be used for
and be subject to the same restrictions established in
division (C) of this section.

(C) Budget. The Heritage Artwork in Public
Places Program shall have an annual administrative
budget that shall be included as part of the city’s
budget.

(D) Use of Fund. The Heritage Artwork in
Public Places Fund may only be used to support:

2012 S-15

(1) Selection, acquisition and installation of
public artwork;

(2) Maintenance and restoration of public
artwork;

(3) Generational or intergenerational art
education programs and events;

(4) Live theatre, music and dance festivals;
(5) Museum activities;

(6) Facilities that support the creation,
performance, and exhibition of art;

(7) Artwork identification plaques and
signage;

(8) Publicity and promotional materials for
public art programs and functions;

(9) HAPP administration; and

(10) Training and development for members
of the HAAC.

(E) Administration, The Fund shall be
administered by the City Council. The Heritage Arts
Advisory Committee (HAAC) shall provide a Heritage
Artwork in Public Places Program annual report to the
City Council on:

(1) The provision of on-site art installations
and arts services, programs, facilities and amenities;
and '

(2) The use of all in-lieu fees collected and
deposited in the Fund, including identification of all
income, expenditures, and balances of each of the
accounts in the Fund during the prior fiscal year and
its recommendations for proposed expenditures for the
subsequent fiscal year.

(3) Upon receipt of such report, the City
Council shall authorize expenditures from the Fund.

(F) Selection of artists and artworks shall be
based on the guidelines set forth in § 38.46.




Solid Waste Provisions 5

§ 50.03 DUMPING ON PUBLIC OR PRIVATE
PROPERTY.

(A) No person shall dispose of or dump upon
any public property, street or alley or upon any
property of another, except such property as may be
provided and set apart for such use by the city, any
solid waste, tin cans, bottles, junk, trash, rubbish,
garbage, or waste matter of any kind or composition.
(‘64 Code, § 11-3)

(B) No person shall throw, place, scatter or
deposit any rubbish or waste material in or upon any
public alley, street or highway in the city except as
expressly authorized in this chapter, nor throw, place,
scatter or deposit any rubbish or waste material upon
or below the surface of any premises in such a manner
that the same is or may become a nuisance oOr
endanger the public health. (‘64 Code, § 11-4)

(C) No person shall dispose of or dump upon
any private property of another, or into any container
or receptacle owned or leased by another, within the
city, any solid waste, tin cans, bottles, junk, trash,
garbage, rubbish, or waste material or other objects of
any kind or composition. (‘64 Code, § 11-5) (Ord.
531, passed 10-13-77; Am. Ord. 887, passed 5-28-98)
Penalty, see § 50.99

COLLECTION AND DISPOSAL OF
SOLID WASTE

§ 50.20 PERMIT REQUIRED.

No person shall remove or convey any solid
waste upon, along or across any public street, alley,
highway or other public place without first applying
for and receiving a permit therefor from the City
Council.

(‘64 Code, § 11-13) (Ord. 78, passed - - ; Ord. 144,
passed - - ; Am. Ord. 166, passed 1-26-61; Am.
Ord. 887, passed 5-28-98) Penalty, see § 50.99

2009 S-13

§ 50.21 PERMIT APPLICATION;
CONSIDERATION BY CITY COUNCIL.

(A) Any person desiring to obtain a permit to
remove or convey any garbage upon or along any
public street, alley, highway or other public place
shall pay an application fee and sign and file an
application with the City Council, which application
shall set forth the name and address of the applicant
and such other information as may be required by the
City Council. (‘64 Code, § 11-14)

(B) When application shall be made to the City
Council for a permit, it shall be the duty of the City
Council to consider the matter and it shall have a right
to grant or reject the permit sought.

(‘64 Code, § 11-15)
(Ord. 78, passed - - ; Am. Ord. 887, passed 5-28-98)

§ 50.22 NUMBER PERMITTED; FEE.

(A) Not more than four commercial permits and
three residential permits for the collection of solid
waste shall be issued and outstanding at any given
time. A holder of one type of permit shall not be
prohibited from also holding the other type of permit.

(B) Each holder of a commercial permit shall
pay a franchise fee of a percentage of their total gross
receipts from customers located within the city as set
by City Council resolution.

(C) Each holder of a residential permit shall pay
a franchise fee of a percentage of their total gross
receipts from customers located within the city as set
by City Council resolution. The franchise fee is
determined annually through a calculation prepared by
the Department of Finance and Administrative
Services as part of the placement of the annual
residential service charge on the County of Los
Angeles property tax bill.
(‘64 Code, § 11-16) (Ord. 78, passed - - ; Ord. 702,
passed 10-23-86; Am. Ord. 791, passed 5-9-91; Ord.
838, passed 4-28-94; Am. Ord. 875, passed 6-12-97,
Am, Ord. 887, passed 5-28-98; Am. Ord. 997, passed
3-26-09)




6 Santa Fe Springs - Public Works

§ 50.23 COLLECTION AND DISPOSAL
RATES.

The rates charged by a Contractor to a resident
or business for collecting and disposing of solid waste
shall be established by City Council resolution.
(Ord. 887, passed 5-28-98)

§ 50.24 REPORTS, REMITTANCES AND
PENALTY FOR LATE PAYMENT.

(A) Each contractor shall, on or before the last
day of the month following the close of each calendar
quarter or at the close of any shorter reporting period
which may be established by the Director, file a form,
as provided by the city, of the contractor’s total gross
receipts for that period. At the time the report is filed,
the full amount of the franchise fee payable shall be
remitted to the city. The Director may establish
shorter reporting periods for any contractor if it is
deemed necessary by the Director in order to insure
remittance of the franchise fee. The Director may
require additional information from the contractor in
order to verify the franchise payment. A final filing
and payment are due immediately upon cessation of
business by contractor for any reason,

(B) The penalty for late payment of any
franchise fee due shall be 50% of the amount payable.
The Director may excuse the payment of any such
penalty upon good cause being shown for such late
payment.

(C) The city shall have the right, upon
reasonable advance notice, to inspect, audit and copy
all records relating to the permit. In the absence of
extraordinary circumstances, five business days notice
shall be considered reasonable. Such records should
be made available to the city at the contractor’s
regular place of business, but in no event outside the
County of Los Angeles. The city reserves the right to
employ a Certified Public Accountant to examine the
contractor’s records as necessary to obtain data
relating to the permit and franchise fee. If the
examination discloses a material deviation with
respect to the gross receipts reported by the contractor

2012 S-15 Repl.

or the examination discloses the contractor is charging
or billing below or above the collection and disposal
rates approved by the City Council, the cost of the
audit shall be borne entirely by the contractor. If the
examination discloses franchise fees that are due,
these franchise fees are considered delinquent and
subject to the 50% late payment penalty outlined in
division (B) of this section. If the examination
discloses that the contractor is charging collection and
disposal rates below or above the City Council
approved rates, the solid waste permit will be subject
to revocation.

(D) It shall be the duty of every contractor liable
for the collection and payment to the city of any fee
imposed by this chapter to keep and preserve for a
period of three years all records as may be necessary
to determine the amount of such franchise fee.

(E) Quarterly tonnage reports.

(1) Each contractor shall, prior to 60 days
following the close of each calendar quarter or at the
close of any shorter reporting period which may be
established by the City Manager, file quarterly
tonnage reports which include the following:

(a) Total amount of solid waste
removed from the city for each month in the reporting
period; and

(b) The name, address, and telephone
number of each solid waste disposal and/or recycling
facility used by the contractor during the reporting
period.

(2) Eachreport shall be signed by an officer
of the contractor. If the contractor has more than one
collection route, it shall submit a separate report for
each collection route. Each report shall be submitted
to the city prior to 60 days following the quarterly
reporting period. Reports must be submitted to the
City Manager by 5:00 p.m.

(‘64 Code, § 11-16.1) (Ord. 381, passed 5-28-70;
Am. Ord. 887, passed 5-28-98; Am. Ord. 1003,
passed 9-9-09)



Section

93.01

93.02

93.03
93.04

93.05
93.06
93.07
93.08
93.09
93.10
93.11
93.12
93.13

93.14

93.15

93.20
93.21
93.22
93.23
93.24
93.25
93.26

93.27

93.28
93.29

2012 S-15

CHAPTER 93: FIRE PREVENTION AND PROTECTION

General Provisions

Adoption of California Fire Code and
other recognized standards
Establishment and duties of Division
of Fire Protection

Amendments to the Fire Code
Amendments to Chapter 1,
Division II

Geographic limits

[Reserved]

[Reserved]

[Reserved]

[Reserved]

[Reserved]

[Reserved]

[Reserved]

New materials, process or
occupancies which may require
permits

Fees for inspections and re-
inspections and permits

Bonds to secure performance upon
facility closure

Fireworks

Time for sale and discharge

Sale of permit required
Application for a permit
Prerequisites to issuance of permit
Operation of stand—regulations
Temporary sales tax permit required
Display of license and sales tax
permit

Prohibitions on discharge
Dangerous fireworks prohibited
Public display

29

93,30  Smoking near stands
93.31  Seizure by the Fire Chief
93,32  Conflicting provisions
93.99  Penalty

GENERAL PROVISIONS

§ 93.01 ADOPTION OF CALIFORNIA FIRE
CODE AND OTHER RECOGNIZED
STANDARDS.

A certain document, three copies of which are on
file in the office of the City Clerk of the City of Santa
Fe Springs being marked and designated as the
California Fire Code, 2010 edition, including Chapters
1 through 49, in addition to Appendix Chapter 4,
Appendices B, BB, C, CC, D in part, G and H as
published by the International Code Council, and is
hereby adopted as the Fire Code of the City of Santa
Fe Springs in the State of California regulating and
governing the safeguarding of life and property from
fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage,
handling and use of hazardous substances, materials
and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or
property in the occupancy of buildings and premises as
herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits
and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of the
regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and
terms of the Fire Code on file in the office of the City
of Santa Fe Springs are hereby referred to, adopted,
and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this code,
with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes,
if any prescribed in § 93.04.

(Ord. 1020, passed 11-23-10)




30 Santa Fe Springs - General Regulations

§ 93.02 ESTABLISHMENT AND DUTIES OF
DIVISION OF FIRE PROTECTION,

(A) The Fire Code as adopted and amended
herein shall be enforced by the Fire & Environmental
Protection Bureau in the Fire Department of the City
of Santa Fe Springs which is hereby established and
which shall be operated under the supervision of the
Fire Chief.

(B) The Fire Marshal in charge of the Division
of Fire Prevention shall be appointed by the Fire Chief
on the basis of examination to determine his
qualifications.

(C) The Chief of the Fire Department shall
recommend to the Fire Marshal the employment of
technical inspectors, who, when such authorization is
made, shall be selected through an examination to
determine their fitness for the position. The
examination shall be open to members and
nonmembers of the Fire Department, and
appointments made after examination shall be for an
indefinite term with removal only for cause.

(Ord. 895, passed 5-27-99)

§ 93.03 AMENDMENTS TO THE FIRE CODE.

The Fire Code is amended and changed in the
following respects:

Section 103.1 is amended to read as follows:

General. The department of fire prevention is
established within the jurisdiction under the direction
of the fire code official. The function of the
department shall be the implementation, administration
and enforcement of the provisions of this Code, in
addition to environmental programs, including the
Certified Unified Program Agency.

Section 105.3.1 is amended to read as follows:

Expiration. An operational permit shall remain in
effect until reissued, renewed, or revoked or for such

2012 S-15

a period of time as specified in the permit.
Construction permits shall automatically become
invalid unless the work authorized by such permit is
commenced within 120 days after issuance, or if the
work authorized by such permit is suspended or
abandoned for a period of 120 days after the time the
work is commenced. Before such work recommences,
a new permit shall be first obtained and the fee to
recommence work shall be one hundred percent the
amount required for a new permit for such work, and
provided further that such suspension or abandonment
has not exceeded one year. Permits are not
transferrable and any change in occupancy, operation,
tenancy or ownership shall require that a new permit
be issued.

Section 105.6 is amended to read as follows:
Required operational permits. The fire code official
is authorized to issue operational permits for the
operations set forth in Section 105.6.1 through
105.6.48, or as required by the fire code official.

Section 105.6.14 is amended to read as follows:

Explosives. An operational permit is required for the
manufacture, storage, handling, sale or use of any
quantity of explosives, explosive materials, fireworks
or pyrotechnic special effects within the scope of
Chapter 33, or when a local permit or approval for the
fire code official is required per CCR Title 19,
Division 1, Chapter 6-Fireworks, or Chapter
10-Explosives.

Section 105.6.48 is added to read as follows:

Pallet yards. An operational permit is required to
store, manufacture, refurbish or otherwise handle
wooden or plastic pallets in excess of 200 cubic feet
on the exterior of any site.

Section 105.7 is amended to read as follows:
Required construction permits. The fire code

official is authorized to issue construction permits for
the work set forth in Section 105.7.1 through



Fir Prevention and Protection 31

105.7.14, in addition to the construction, addition,
alteration, installation, modification or repair of any
building, or building system and equipment, or as
required by the fire code official.

Section 109.3 is amended to read as follows:
Insert; misdemeanor, $1,000.00, 180 days.
Section 113.1 is amended to read as follows:

Fees. A fee for service shall be charged for the
review, plan check and permitting of documents as
required by the Code, or as required by the fire code
official. A permit shall not be issued until the fees
have been paid, nor shall an amendment to a permit be
released until the additional fee, if any, has been paid.

Section 113.6 is amended to read as follows:

False fire alarm response. A service charge for the
response and investigation of false alarms shall be
paid as required, in accordance with the schedule as
established by the applicable governing authority.

Section 202 is amended to read as follows:

Addition. An extension or increase in floor area or
height of a building or structure.

False Alarm. In addition, the activation of any fire
alarm system which results in a response by the Fire
Department, and which is caused by the negligence or
intentional misuse of the fire alarm system by the
owner, its employees, agents or any other activation
of a fire alarm system not caused by heat, smoke or
fire, exclusive of a nuisance fire alarm.

Repair. The reconstruction or renewal of any part of
an existing building for the purpose of maintenance.

Section 301.3 is added to read as follows:
Hazard discontinuation. The fire code official is

authorized to require the discontinuance of any
hazardous, offensive or nuisance condition.

2012 S-15

Section 502.1 is amended to read as follows:

Fire apparatus access road. A road that provides fire
apparatus access from a fire station to a facility,
building or portion thereof. This is a general term
inclusive of all other terms such as fire lane, public
street, parking lot lane, access roadway, and anything
that augments fire ground operations.

Section 503.2.1 is amended to read as follows:

Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an
unobstructed width of not less than 26 feet (7924
mm), exclusive of shoulders, except for approved
security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and
an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 13
feet 6 inches (4114.8mm).

Section 503.2.9 is added to read as follows:

Traffic calming features. Traffic calming features
shall be approved by the Fire Code Official.

Section 504.4 is added to read as follows:

Access signage. When required by the fire code
official, exterior and interior doors shall be identified
as to function of that room or area, or when the door
is not functional.

Section 505.1 is amended to read as follows:

Address identification. New and existing buildings
shall have approved address numbers, building
numbers or approved building identification placed in
a position that is plainly legible form the street, road
fronting the property or alley., These numbers shall
contrast with their background. Address numbers shall
be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers
shall be a minimum of 4 inches high with a minimum
stroke width of .5 inches. Where access is by means
of a private road and the building can not be viewed
from the public way, a monument, pole or other sign
or means shall be used to identify the structure.




32 Santa Fe Springs - General Regulations

Section 507.4 is amended to read as follows:

Water supply test. The fire code official shall
perform the water supply test, and provide
documentation of the test results prior to the final
approval of any documents related to fire protection
water supplies.

Section 605.3.1.1 is added to read as follows:

Labeling maintenance. Labeling required per
605.3.1, and as required for photovoltaic installations
shall be legibly maintained at all times.

Section 901.1.1 is added to read as follows:

Aesthetics. Aesthetics of fire protection systems shall
be taken into consideration by designers and installers,
and to provide consistency with all relevant City codes
and standards.

Section 901,10 is added to read as follows:

Fire Protection Equipment Access. Unobstructed
access and adequate working space to fire protection
equipment shall be maintained at all times. The fire
department shall not be deterred or hindered from
gaining immediate access to any fire protection
system.

Section 903.2.1.1 is amended to read as follows:

1. Where the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet
(465 sq. m)

Section 903.2.1.3 is amended to read as follows:

1. Where the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet
(465 sq. m)

Section 903.2.1.4 is amended to read as follows:

1. Where the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet
(465 sq. m)

Section 903.2..2 is amended to read as follows:

2012 S-15

3. Where the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet
(465 sq. m)

Section 903.2.3 is amended to read as follows:

1. Where the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet
(465 sq. m)

Section 903.2.4 is amended to read as follows:

1. Where the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet
(465 sq. m)

Section 903.2.6 is amended to read as follows:

3. Where the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet
(465 sq. m)

Section 903.2.7 is amended to read as follows:

1. Where the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet
(465 sq. m)

Section 903.2.9 is amended to read as follows:

1. Where the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet
(465 sq. m)

Section 903.2.9.1 is amended to read as follows:

2. Where the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet
(465 sq. m)

Section 903.2.9.2 is amended to read as follows:

Bulk storage of tires. Buildings and structures where
the area for the storage of tires exceeds 5,000 cubic
feet shall be equipped with an automatic fire sprinkler
system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1.

* Section 903.2.10 is amended to read as follows:

1. Where the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet
(465 sq. m)




Fire Prevention and Protection 32A

Section 903.3.1.3 is amended to read as follows:

NFPA 13D sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler
systems installed in one and two-family dwellings and
townhomes shall be permitted to be installed
throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D, including
garages per NFPA 13D A8.6.4.

Section 903.6.3 is added to read as follows:

Retrofit requirements. In existing building(s) when
additions, alterations and /or repairs to such
building(s) causes the floor area to exceed 5,000
square feet or the height to exceed 40 feet or three or
more stories irrespective of height.

In existing buildings(s) over 5,000 square feet when
alterations and/or addition to such buildings exceed
25% of the current assessed value of said building(s)
in accordance with the Los Angeles County Assessor’s
records.

For the purpose of clarification, additions, alterations
and repairs, or where a change of use and/or
occupancy is taking place, the entire building shall be
made to comply with the provisions of this section.

Section 903.6.4 is added to read as follows:

Consideration for separation walls. Requirements
for automatic fire sprinkler systems may be waived by
the fire code official if the building is divided into
areas of less than 5,000 square feet, provided the
building is not considered a three story or higher
building,. Such divisions shall be made by the
construction of a four-hour fire resistive area
separation wall(s) which meet the requirements of the
California Building Code. Four hour walls shall be
required regardless of type of building construction
type used.

Area separation walls shall be without openings or
penetrations. Area separation walls shall extend from
the foundation to a point at least 30 inches above the
roof,

2012 S-15

Section 905.3 is amended to read as follows:

Required installations. Standpipe systems shall be
installed where required by Section 905.3.1 through
905.3.11 and in locations indicated in 905.4, 905.5
and 905.6. Standpipe systems are allowed to be
combined with automatic fire sprinkler systems.

Section 905.3.11 is added to read as follows:

High pile storage areas. An area greater than 12,000
square feet within a building which is designated,
intended, proposed or actually used for high pile
combustible storage shall be equipped with a Class I
wet standpipe system in accordance with NFPA 13 or
in accordance with NFPA 14.

Section 905.4 is amended to read as follows:

7. At every other access door, or as deemed
necessary by the Fire Code Official.

Section 907.2 is amended to read as follows:

Where Required-new buildings and structures. An
approved fire alarm system installed in accordance
with the provisions of this Code and NFPA 72 shall be
provided in new buildings and structures in
accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.23
and provide occupant alarm initiation, notification and
annunciation, in accordance with 907.6, unless other
requirements are provided by another section of this
code.

A minimum of one manual fire alarm box shall be
provided in an approved location to initiate a fire
alarm signal for the fire alarm system employing
automatic fire detectors of water-flow detection
devices. Where other sections of this Code allow
elimination of fire alarm boxes due to fire sprinkler or
automatic fire alarm systems, a single fire alarm box
shall be installed at a location approved by the
enforcing agency.

Section 907.2.1 is amended to read as follows:

Delete Exceptions.




32B Santa Fe Springs - General Regulations

Section 907.2.2 is amended to read as follows:

Delete Exception.

Section 907.2.2.1 is amended to read as follows:

Delete Exception.

Section 907.2.2.2 is amended to read as follows:

Delete Exception.

Section 907.2.3 is amended to read as follows:

Delete Exceptions.

Section 907.2.4 is amended to read as follows:

Delete Exception.

Section 907.2.7 is amended to read as follows:

Group M. A manual fire alarm system that activates
the occupant notification system in accordance with
Section 907.6 shall be installed in Group M
occupancies.

Section 907.2.7.1 is amended to read as follows:

Occupant notification. During times that the building
is occupied, the initiation of a signal from a manual
fire alarm box or from a water flow switch shall be
required to activate the occupant notification
appliances in accordance with Section 907.6.

Section 907.3 is amended to read as follows:

Where required in existing buildings and structures.
An approved fire alarm system shall be installed in
existing buildings and structures where required by
Chapter 46, in addition to existing buildings under
going a change of use, change of occupancy or fire
alarm system modification.

Section 907.5.2 is amended to read as follows:

2012 S-15

Manual fire alarm boxes. Where a manual fire alarm
system is required by another section of the Code, or
as required by the Fire Code Official, it shall be
activated by fire alarm boxes installed in accordance
with Sections 907.5.2.1 through 907.5.2.5.

Section 907.6.2.3 is amended to read as follows:

Visible alarms. Visible alarm notification appliances
shall be provided in accordance with Sections
906.6.2.3.1 through 907.6.2.3.5. Notification
appliances shall remain activated when the fire alarm
system has been silenced.

Section 907.7.3.1.1.1 is added to read as follows:

Annunciator panel signage. Approved graphic
signage including building and fire alarm features
shall be mounted at each annunciator panel.

Section 913.5.4 is amended to read as follows:

Pump room environmental conditions. Tests of
pump room environmental conditions, including
heating, natural and mechanical ventilation, natural
and powered illumination shall be made to endure
proper manual or automatic operation of the
associated equipment.

Section 1910 is added to read as follows:
STORAGE OF COMBUSTIBLE IDLE PALLETS
Section 1910.1 is added to read as follows:

General. Storage of combustible idle pallets shall be
in accordance with this section. A permit shall be
obtained in accordance with Section 105.6.

Section 1910.2 is added to read as follows:

Storage location. Pallets shall be stored outside or in

a separate building designed for pallet storage, unless
stored indoors in accordance with 1910.3,



- — =

Fire Prevention and Protection 32C

Section 1910.3 is added to read as follows:

Indoor storage. Pallets stored in a building shall be in
accordance with high hazard commodity high pile
combustible storage per Chapter 23.

Section 1910.4 is added to read as follows:

Outdoor storage. Pallets stored outside shall be
stored in accordance with Table 1910.4.1 and Table
1910.4.2, and Sections 1910.5 and 1910.6.

Section 1910.5 is added to read as follows:

Outdoor pile dimensions, Pallet stacks shall not
exceed 15 feet (4.6m) in height nor shall cover an area
greater than 500 square feet (46.5m2). Pallet stacks
shall be arranged to form stable piles. Piles shall be
separated by a minimum of 8 feet (2.5m). Piles shall
be a minimum of 10 feet (3.1m) from property lines.

Section 1910.6 is added to read as follows:

Fire department access. Fire department access
roadways shall be maintained within 150" of all pallet
storage.

Table 1910.4.1

Required Clearance Between Outside Idle Pallet
Storage and Other Yard Storage

Pile Size Minimum Distance,
Jeet (m)
Under 50 pallets 20 (6.1m)
50-200 pallets 30 (9.2m)
Over 200 pallets 50 (15.2)

2012 S-15

Table 1910.4.2

Regquired Clearance Between Outside Idle Pallet
Storage and Structures

Minimum Distance of Wall from

Wall Storage, feet (m)
Construction | yuder 50 | 500200 | Over 200
" Pallets Pallets Pallets

Blank masonry 0 0 10 (3.1m)
Masonry, 1 0 10 (3.1m) | 20 (6.2m)
hour openings
Masonry, < 1 10 (3.1m) | 20 (6.2m) | 30 (9.3m)
hour openings
Other 10 (3.1m) | 20 (6.2m) | 30 (9.3m)
construction
with exposure
protection
Other 20 (6.2m) | 30 (9.3m) 50
construction (15.5m)
without
exposure
protection

Section 2702.1 is amended to read as follows:

Rail cars. For the purpose of this chapter, a rail car
shall be considered a stationary tank if the rail car is
connected into a chemical manufacturing, blending, or
filling process. Storage requirements may be waived
if the rail car off- loads its product into a designated
storage tank and is connected in line to the storage
tank for a period of less than 24 hours for off loading
purposes.

Section 2704.2.2 is amended to add the following:

Secondary containment for hazardous material
liquids and solids. Where required by Table
2704.2.2, buildings, rooms or areas used for the
storage of hazardous material liquids or solids shall be
provided with secondary containment in accordance
with this section when the capacity of an individual
vessel or the aggregate capacity of multiple vessels
exceeds the following:




32D Santa Fe Springs - General Regulations

1. Liquids: Capacity of an individual vessel exceeds
55 gallons (208L) or the aggregate capacity of
multiple vessels exceeds 1,000 gallons (3785L); and

2. Solids: Capacity of an individual vessel exceeds
550 pounds (250kg) or the aggregate capacity of
multiple vessels exceeds 10,000 pounds (4540kg).

In addition, there shall be a minimum of three feet
between the toe of the tank and any other structures,
berms or tanks. For Purposes of this article,
anhydrous ammonia storage or process tanks shall
comply with section 2704.2.2.

Section 3301.2 is added to read as follows:

Permits. Permits shall be required as set forth in
Section 105.6, and regulated in accordance with this
section,

Section 3903.3 is added to read as follows;

SADT. Areas with organic peroxides with
self-accelerating decomposition temperatures (SADT)
less than 125*F shall be provided with supervised

temperature controls and alarms. Stand-by power shall
be provided for control systems.

Section 4303.3 is added to read as follows:

SADT. Areas with unstable reactive materials with
self-accelerating decomposition temperatures (SADT)
less than 125°F shall be provided with supervised
temperature controls and alarms. Stand-by power shall
be provided for control systems.

Appendix D is amended to read as follows:

Delete Figure D 103.1.

Delete Table D103.4.

Appendix K is added to read as follows:

Solar Photovoltaic Installation Guidelines.
Photovoltaic installations shall be in accordance with

2012 S-15

guidelines as published by the Office of the State Fire

Marshal.
(Ord. 1020, passed 11-23-10)

§ 93.04 AMENDMENTS TO CHAPTER 1,
DIVISION I1.

The following sections of Chapter 1, Division
II are hereby revised:

Section 101.1. Insert: city of Santa Fe Springs

Section 109.3. Insert: Misdemeanor, $1,000.00,
180 days

Section 111.4 Insert: $100.00, $1,000.00
(Ord. 1020, passed 11-23-10).

§ 93.05 GEOGRAPHIC LIMITS.

The geographic limits referred to in certain
sections of the 2010 California Fire Code are hereby
established as follows:

Section 3404.2.9.6.1. Insert: In all portions of
the City of Santa Fe Springs which are not zoned
for industrial purposes by the zoning ordinances
of the City, unless completely screened from
view from all public streets and is not located
within any required parking or vehicle circulation
area, shall have safety features such as detection
and alarm systems, automatic shut off valves and
other safety systems as deemed necessary by the
Fire Code Official.

Section 3406.2.4.4. Insert: In all portions of the
City of Santa Fe Springs which are not zoned for
industrial purposes by the zoning ordinances of
the City, unless completely screened from view
from all public streets and is not located within
any required parking or vehicle circulation area,
shall have safety features such as detection and
alarm systems, automatic shut off valves and
other safety systems as deemed necessary by the
fire code official.




Fire Prevention and Protection 32E

Section 3506.2. Insert: In all portions of the City
of Santa Fe Springs which are not zoned for
industrial purposes by the zoning ordinances of
the City, unless completely screened from view
from all public streets and is not located within
any required parking or vehicle circulation area,
shall have safety features such as detection and
alarm systems, automatic shut off valves and
other safety systems as deemed necessary by the
Fire Code Official.

Section 3804.2. Insert: In all portions of the City
of Santa Fe Springs which are not zoned for
industrial purposes by the zoning ordinances of
the City shall be limited to 125 gallons,

(Ord. 1020, passed 11-23-10)
§ 93.06 [RESERVED]
§93.07 [RESERVED]
§ 93.08 [RESERVED]
§93.09 [RESERVED]
§93.10 [RESERVED]
§93.11 [RESERVED]
§93.12 [RESERVED]

§ 93.13 NEW MATERIALS, PROCESS OR
OCCUPANCIES WHICH MAY REQUIRE
PERMITS.

The City Manager, the Fire Chief and the Fire
Marshal shall act as a committee to determine and

2012 S-15

specify, after giving affected persons an
opportunity to be heard, any new materials,
processes Or occupancies for which permits are
required in addition to those now enumerated in
the  Fire Code. The Fire Marshal



32F Santa Fe Springs - General Regulations




General Provisions 5

(3) Carry or discharge any firearms, fire
crackers, rockets, torpedoes, or any other fireworks,
or air gun, or slingshot, without special written permit
from the Director of Recreation Services.

(4) Cut, break, injure, deface, or disturb
any tree, shrub, plant, rack, building, monument,
fence, bench, or other structure, apparatus, or
property, or pluck, pull up, cut, take out or remove
any shrub, bush, plant or flowers, or remove or write
upon any building, monument, fence, bench, or other
structure or thing, except in connection with and in
the course of actual duties being performed as an
employee of such city.

(5) Cut or remove any wood, turf, grass,
soil, rock, sand or gravel, except in connection with
and in the course of actual duties being performed as
an employee of such city.

(6) Distribute any handbills or circulars, or
post, place or erect any bill, notice, paper, or
advertising device or matter of any kind, without
special written permit from the Director of Recreation
Services.

(7) Make or kindle a fire, except in picnic
stoves provided for that purpose, unless a special
written permit shall be obtained in advance from the
Director of Recreation Services.

(8) Camp or lodge, unless a special written
permit shall be obtained in advance from the Director
of Recreation Services.

(9) Indulge in riotous, boisterous,
threatening, or indecent conduct, or use abusive,
profane or indecent language.

_(10) Sell or offer for sale any merchandise,
article or thing whatsoever without special written
permit from the Director of Recreation Services.

(11) Gamble, or play or bet at or against any
game which is played, conducted, dealt or carried on
with cards, dice, or other device for money, chips,
shells, credit, or any other representation of value; or
maintain or exhibit any gambling table, or other
instrument of gambling or gaming.

2007 S-11

(12) Practice, carry on, conduct, or solicit
for any trade, occupation, business or profession, or
circulate any petition of whatsoever kind or character
without special written permit from the Director of
Recreation Services.

(13) Play or engage in any game excepting
at such place or places as shall be set apart for that
purpose.

(14) Loiter between the time of closure on
any day, and the time of sunrise on the following day,
without special written permit from the Director of
Recreation Services.

(15) Deposit any paper, fruit, rubbish,
debris, or any waste material of any kind except in
such receptacles as may be located in such park
therefor.

(16) Possess, exhibit, transport or drink any
alcoholic or intoxicating beverage without special
permit from the Director of Recreation Services.

(17) Loiter in or about any public toilet or
enter any public toilet designated for the opposite sex;
except that this provision shall not apply to persons
under eight years of age, or to municipal employees in
the regular course of their duties.

(18) Call, hold, conduct, arrange for, or be
present at any distinct, individual, or separate, group,
gathering, lodge, association, company, corporate or
other picnic, meeting or assembly having, or which
will have, in excess of 100 persons in attendance
thereat without special written permit from the
Director of Recreation Services.

(19) To use or attempt to use or interfere
with the use of any table, space, or facility in such
parks which at the time is reserved by written
reservation then in effect to any other person or
persons; provided, however, that all such reservations
shall specify the period covered by same and shall be
subject to cancellation by the Director of Recreation
Services or his authorized representative. Unless the
actual use of the table, space or facility referred to in
any reservation is commenced within 30 minutes after




6 Santa Fe Springs - General Offenses

the period covered by such reservation, the
reservation shall thereupon be void and all rights
under such reservation may be cancelled by the
Director of Recreation Services or his authorized
representative.

(20) To fail to obey the directions of the
Director of Recreation Services, or his authorized
representative, to cease and desist from any activities
prohibited by this title, or by any other provisions of
this code, or by any regulation of the Department of
Community Services.

(21) To fail to leave the park premises or a
recreation facility when directed to do so by the
Director of Recreation Services, or his duly
authorized representative, because of violation of any
of the provisions of this title, or of this code, or of
any regulations of the Department of Community
Services, or to return to the park or recreation facility
without the prior authorization of the Director of
Recreation Services, or his duly authorized
representative, after having complied with a direction
to leave the park.

(22) Smoke or possess any lit cigar,
cigarette, or pipe, unless the city has designated a
specific smoking area.

(C) Violation of this section shall be deemed an
infraction.
(‘64 Code, § 15-39) (Ord. 311, passed 6-29-67; Ord.
413, passed 1-13-72; Am. Ord. 975, passed 5-25-06;
Am. Ord. 1023, passed 4-28-11) Penalty, see
§ 10.97

§ 130.05 VEHICLES, SKATEBOARDS AND
SCOOTERS ON PUBLIC PROPERTY.

(A) It shall be unlawful for any person within or
upon any property owned or operated by the city to
operate, drive, park or leave standing any motor
vehicle, skateboard, scooter, or any other vehicle or
bicycle, where notice of such prohibition has been
posted and is visible at at least two entrances to the

2012 S-15

prohibited area, or in the immediate area where such
activity is prohibited. This section shall not apply to
persons participating in any city-sponsored program,
event or class in which use of the self-powered
wheeled devices described herein are utilized,
permitted or required.

(B) It shall be unlawful for any person, within or
upon posted private property in commercial zones and
industrial zones open to the public, to operate, drive,
park or leave standing any motor vehicle, skateboard,
scooter, or any other vehicle or bicycle, where notice
of such prohibition has been posted and is visible at at
least two entrances to the prohibited area, or in the
immediate area where such activity is prohibited. This
section shall not apply to persons participating in any
city-sponsored program, event or class in which use of
the self-powered wheeled devices described herein are
utilized, permitted or required.

(C) Violation of this secti