AGENDA

P.

1



IL

I1I.

VI

VII.

AGENDA

City of Franklin, Kentucky
City Commission

February 10, 2020
Regular Meeting — 12:00 Noon

City Hall Meeting Room
117 West Cedar Street
Franklin, Kentucky

Call to Order and Member Roll Call

Opening Prayer - Chris Patterson, First United Methodist Church

Approval of Minutes

e Approval of Minutes of January 27, 2020 Regular Meeting Pg. 5
e Approval of Minutes of February 4, 2020 Special Called Joint Meeting Pg. 9
Recognitions

Hear the Public

Community Services

e Presentation regarding City Bicentennial Activities Pg.l2
Presenter: Tammie Carey, Community Development Director

e Discussion and/or possible action regarding Alley Revitalization Project Pg. 13
Presenters: Tammie Carey, Community Development Director
and Amy Ellis, F-S Renaissance Director
General Government
e Discussion and/or possible action regarding Approval of Resolution for Kentucky Transportation
Cabinet TAP Grant Funding (Wildcat Way Project)

Presenter: Tammie Carey, Community Development Director Pg. 16

e Discussion and Update regarding West Madison Street Property Demolition
Presenter: Steve Akin, Public Works Scheduler Pg. 36

¢ Discussion regarding Budget Planning Schedule
Presenter: Kenton Powell, City Manager Pg. 40

e Discussion and/or possible action regarding Amending Planning & Zoning Ordiaance
Presenter: Scott Crabtree, City Attorney Pg. 42

P. 2



VIIIL.

IX.

XI.

XII.

XIII.

X1v.

XV.

XVL

Public Services

Public Safety

Utilities

Ordinances
* Possible first reading of Ordinance No. 2020-002 titled: An Ordinance Of The City Of

Franklin, Kentucky Relating To The City/County Building Inspector Program And

Amending Sections 151.15, 151.16, 151.18, 152.01, And 153.02 Of The City

Of Franklin Code Of Ordinances And Adding Section 11.5 To The Frankiin-S. impson

Planning And Zoning Regulations

Presenter: Cathy Dillard, City Clerk Pg. 47

Executive Session
LAND ACQUISITION - Deliberations on the future acquisition or sale of real property by a public agency
where publicity would be likely to affect the value of a specific piece of property to be acquired for public use
or sold by a public agency {KRS 61.810(1)(b)}

LITIGATION - Discussion of proposed or pending litigation {KRS 61.810(1)(c)}

City Attorney Reports
City Manager Reports
Other Commission Business

Adjournment

P. 3



MINUTES

P.

4



MINUTES OF SPECIAL CALLED SESSION
OF THE
CITY OF FRANKLIN
CITY COMMISSION

January 27, 2020
City Hall

117 West Cedar Street
Franklin, Kentucky

The Franklin, Kentucky City Commission met in Special Called Session at 2:00 PM, Monday,
January 27, 2020, in the City Hall meeting room located at 117 West Cedar Street, Franklin,
Kentucky.

Members attending were as follows:

Mayor Larry Dixon Present
Commissioner Jamie Powell Present
Commissioner Herbert Williams Present
Commissioner Brownie Bennett Present
Commissioner Wendell Stewart Present

Others present included City Manager Kenton Powell; City Attorney Scott Crabtree; City
Personnel Director/Deputy Clerk, Rita Vaughn; City Finance Director, Shaunna Cornwell;
City Police Chief, Roger Solomon; Public Works Director Chris Klotter; City Clerk, Cathy
Dillard; Franklin Favorite/ WFKN media representative, Keith Pyles; John Craddock and
Peggy Craddock; Steve Akin, City Scheduler; Kenny Massey, Distribution Superintendent;
Trent Coffee, Wastewater Superintendent; Tammy Carey, Community Development Director;
and Jon Zambrano.

Mayor Dixon called the meeting to order at 2:00 PM, and Eric Walker of the Franklin
Community Church offered the opening prayer.

APPROVAL OF MINUTES

Motion was made by Commissioner Bennett and seconded by Commissioner Stewart to
approve the minutes as presented of the January 13, 2020, regular meeting of the Franklin City
Commission.

Voting Aye: All. Motion carried unanimously.

P. 5



RECOGNITION

On behalf of City of Franklin and the City Commission, Mayor Dixon presented John
Craddock with a Key to the City. Mr. Craddock served the City in several different capacities.
He served as a Director on the Franklin Electric Plant Board; two terms as City Commissioner;
as Chairman of the F-S Code Enforcement Board; and, as Chairman of the Property
Maintenance Board.

John Craddock has served the City of Franklin and its citizens and we honor this commitment
and service with this well-deserved and distinguished recognition.

COMMUNITY SERVICES

Public Works Director Chris Klotter, with assistance from Jon Zambrano, presented an
overview of the Geographic Information System (“GIS”). The GIS system utilizes the industry
standard ESRI software and Klotter provided samples of its various mapping capabilities and
explained how City staff and personnel utilize this system. He noted that all field staff are now
using GIS in some form and explained how this technology streamlined work details and
eliminated the paper system of work orders and expense tracking.

GENERAL GOVERNMENT

City Manager Kenton Powell presented the Commission with a proposed 2020 Commission
regular meeting dates calendar which included scheduled budget works sessions, regular joint
meetings and City holidays.

No action was taken on this matter.

City Attorney Scott Crabtree asked the Commission to consider approval for the Mayor to sign
three quitclaim deeds on behalf of the City. The parcels in these deeds were transferred to the
Kentucky Municipal Finance Corporation, a Kentucky League of Cities entity, through a
leased loan program. Through inadvertence these parcels were not transferred back to the City
when the indebtedness was satisfied.

Motion was made by Commissioner Powell and seconded by Commissioner Williams to
authorize the Mayor to sign three quitclaim deeds transferring property from the Kentucky
Municipal Finance Corporation to the City of Franklin.

Voting Aye: All. Motion carried unanimously.

Community Development Director Tammie Carey presented a proposed map which would
expand the downtown Historic Preservation District boundaries. After some discussion it was
determined that the change in District boundaries would require an amendment to the existing
ordinance. In addition, the City Attorney recommended a public hearing on the proposal prior

P. 6



to the adoption or amendment of an ordinance due to the effect on the property rights of
property owners in the proposed expansion area.

No action was taken on this matter.

UTILITIES

Wastewater Superintendent Trent Coffee asked the Commission to consider approval of the
purchase and installation of five (5) actuators from Wascon for $27,500.00 for Wastewater
Treatment Plant.

Motion was made by Commissioner Powell and seconded by Commissioner Stewart to
approve the purchase and installation of five (5) actuators for the Wastewater Treatment Plant
from Wascon for $27,500.00 and to further authorize the Mayor to sign any documents
necessary for this purchase.

Voting Aye: All. Motion carried unanimously.

ORDINANCES

City Clerk Cathy Dillard provided second summary reading of the following ordinance:

Ordinance No. 2020-001 titled: An Ordinance Rezoning Approximately 5.00 Acres
Immediately North of 6007 Bowling Green Road from A-1 (Agriculture) to I-2 (Heavy
Industry)

Motion was made by Commissioner Powell and seconded by Commissioner Bennett to
approve Ordinance No. 2020-001 and was unanimously approved by the following roll call
vote:

Mayor Dixon Yes Commissioner Bennett Yes
Commissioner Powell Yes " Commissioner Stewart Yes
Commissioner Williams Yes

EXECUTIVE SESSION

At 2:44 PM, motion was made by Commissioner Williams and seconded by Commissioner
Bennett to enter into Executive Session for the purpose of:

(1) LAND ACQUISITION — Deliberations on the future acquisition or sale of real
property by a public agency where publicity would be likely to affect the value of a
specific piece of property to be acquired for public use or sold by a public agency
{KRS 61.810(1)(b)}

(2) LITIGATION — Discussion of proposed or pending litigation {KRS 61.810(1)(c)}

(3) PERSONNEL — Discussions or hearings which might lead to the appointment,
discipline, or dismissal of an individual employee or member {KRS 61.810(1)(f)}

Voting Aye: All. Motion carried unanimously.

3

P. 7



Entering Executive Session were Mayor Dixon; Commissioners Powell, Bennett, Williams and
Stewart; City Manager Kenton Powell; City Attorney Scott Crabtree and Police Chief Roger
Solomon.

Chief Solomon exited Executive Session at 3:00 PM.

At 3:20 PM, motion was made by Commissioner Williams and seconded by Commissioner
Bennett to exit Executive Session and return to open session.

Voting Aye: All. Motion carried unanimously.

ADJOURNMENT

At 3:21 PM, motion was made by Commissioner Powell and seconded by Commissioner
Williams to adjourn the Special Called meeting of the Franklin City Commission.

Voting Aye: All. Motion carried unanimously.

Larry Dixon, Mayor Cathy Dillard, City Clerk
City of Franklin, Kentucky City of Franklin, Kentucky

P. 8



MINUTES
SPECIAL CALLED MEETING

CITY OF FRANKLIN CITY COMMISSION
and
SIMPSON COUNTY FISCAL COURT

Tuesday, February 4, 2020, at 12:00 Noon

City Hall Meeting Room
117 West Cedar Street
Franklin, Kentucky

The Franklin, Kentucky City Commission met in Special Called Session at 12:00 Noon on
Tuesday, February 4, 2020, in the City Hall meeting room located at 117 West Cedar Street,
Franklin, Kentucky. Mayor Larry Dixon called the City Commission to order and County Judge
Executive Mason Barnes called the Fiscal Court to order at 12:00 Noon, the member attendance
was as follows:

Franklin City Commission Simpson County Fiscal Court

Mayor Larry Dixon County Judge Executive Mason Barnes
Commissioner Brownie Bennett Magistrate Marty Chandler - Absent
Commissioner Jamie Powell Magistrate Myron Thurman
Commissioner Wendell Stewart Magistrate Nathaniel Downey
Commissioner Herbert Williams Magistrate Scott Poston

Others present included City Manager, Kenton Powell; City Attorney, Scott Crabtree; Fiscal Court
Clerk, Pam Rohrs; County Attorney, Sam Phillips; Dennis Griffin, Executive Director of Franklin-
Simpson Industrial Authority; and, Ashwana Sarvaria.

Mayor Larry Dixon offered an opening prayer and Judge Executive Mason Barnes asked everyone
in attendance to join in the Pledge of Allegiance.

REGULAR BUSINESS

The advance agenda included a discussion item regarding Tax Increment Financing (TIF) District.
This item was cancelled because the representative from the Governor’s office was unable to
attend.

EXECUTIVE SESSION

At 12:05 PM, motion was made by Commissioner Bennett and seconded by Commissioner
Williams to enter into Executive Session for the following purpose:

P.9



BUSINESS — Discussions between a public agency or a representative of a business
entity concerning a specific proposal, where open discussions would jeopardize the
siting, retention, expansion, or upgrading of the business {KRS 61.810(1)(g)}

Voting Aye: All. Motion carried unanimously.

Entering Executive Session were Mayor Dixon; Commissioners Powell, Bennett, Williams and
Stewart; City Manager Kenton Powell; City Attorney Scott Crabtree; all Simpson County Fiscal
Court members; County Attorney Sam Phillips; Dennis Griffin, Executive Director of Franklin-

Simpson Industrial Authority; and, Ashwana Sarvaria.

At 12:55 PM motion was made by Commissioner Bennett and seconded by Commissioner Stewart
to exit Executive Session.

Voting Aye: All. Motion carried unanimously.

ADJOURNMENT

At 12:56 PM, motion was made by Commissioner Powell and seconded by Commissioner Stewart
to adjourn the meeting.

Voting Aye: All. Motion carried unanimously.

Larry Dixon, Mayor Cathy Dillard, City Clerk
City of Franklin, Kentucky City of Franklin, Kentucky

P. 10



COMMUNITY
SERVICES

P. 11



S

i1

{ . IR:\NKUN Ni‘_;
MEMO
TO: Mayor and Commissioners
FROM: Tammie Carey, Community Development Director
DATE: February 5, 2020
RE: City Bicentennial Activities

The Kick-Off for the City’s Bicentennial Celebrations took place Thursday evening. I would like to share
information concerning upcoming activities with the commission and for public information purposes.

P.12



MEMO

TO: Mayor and Commissioners

FROM: Tammie Carey, Community Development Director

DATE: February 5, 2020

RE: Discussion and/or possible action concerning an alley revitalization project

The City’s first alley project took place in 2019. The response to the project has been tremendous. As
work began on the alley between the Brickyard Café and Donald’s Service Station, the project grew and
quickly became a community project with several organizations contributing to the beautification project.

With combined efforts, we would like to complete another alley revitalization project in 2020. Franklin
Simpson Renaissance Director, Amy Ellis will be at the meeting on Monday to present ideas and a plan
for the alley project.

The alley behind Main Street contains numerous water, sewer, gas, and electric lines buried in the alley.
Over the last two years, the alley has been “dug up” at least 3 times for work to take place. Once the
work is complete, the asphalt is patched and repaired but it has left the alley in a poor state and it is in
need of resurfacing. Due to the close proximity of the buildings and fence, new asphalt would have to be
installed by hand. Attached is a cost estimate that City Scheduler, Steve Akin put together for this
project.

Funding to mill and resurface the alley was included in this year’s budget. Steve had the idea and did a
cost analysis to use brick pavers in the alley in place of new asphalt. If work was needed underground,
the pavers could be removed, stacked and then put back down when the work was complete. The cost is
close to the same as installing asphalt. The pavers would also allow for better drainage and be
aesthetically pleasing for the revitalization project.

I would like to ask the commissions consideration to utilize funds in the 2019-2020 budget for the alley
asphalt repair to be used to mill the existing pavement and pavers be purchased and installed by city
employees and inmate labor.

Proposed Motion:
I make a motion that funding allocated in the 2019-2020 budget for the alley asphalt repair be used to
mill the existing pavement and pavers be purchased and installed.

P. 13



Fld

Alley Project

Clty does the labar Al Things Construckion Dewreese Milling & Paving Cost
Piverrs = Soericte Dol Just for laying pavers Pl i e =oviinng
Tlams Fawar: 1120 Lezarorly 15000 Hillng 3 inche:
Wil mg 2 inchos Jaon Favna by mand 1Can'tqes = uip i ailoy)
ezl Feigicz = Spilics 1800
Toriet Barnet + Polierier S 1000
Landacapira Rock L3co
Tatal Cost 204X Tatal Cost L0000 Tulal Coxt

Fal

1 eS0T

Y ]

e

Cuality Sealing & Striping
taaliag

traliqgz

Total Cosk

A200

ERLL



GENERAL
GOVERNMENT

P. 15



v

ety

— FRXN!E'L\N‘WC‘
MEMO
TO: Mayor and Commissioners
FROM: Tammie Carey, Community Development Director
DATE: February 5, 2020
RE: Discussion and/or Possible Action Concerning Kentucky Transportation Cabinet TAP
Grant Funding

In July we received notification that we had been awarded funding for a project through the Kentucky
Transportation Cabinet’s Office of Local Programs for TAP (Transportation Alternatives Program).

Funding in the amount of $96,000 for a project to construct a new sidewalk on the north side of Wildcat
Way, a crosswalk on Main Street, and a small refuge island in the center of Main Street was awarded.

A few weeks ago, I received an e-mail containing the grant agreement and a list of required
documentation to be submitted to the Kentucky Transportation Cabinet. The project is to be completed in
phases and the KTC requires a new agreement with each phase. A resolution authorizing the Mayor to
sign all the agreements is required.

Included for your review is a copy of the initial grant agreement and a resolution authorizing the Mayor to
sign the agreements and all documentation related to the project.

Proposed Motion: .
I make a motion that we approve Resolution A - 2020 authorizing the Mayor to sign any and all
documents related to the project.

P.16



RESOLUTION NO. A-2020
CITY OF FRANKLIN, KENTUCKY

RESOLUTION FOR AGREEMENT FOR
TRANSPORTATION ALTERNATIVES PROGRAM
KENTUCKY TRANSPORTATION CABINET PROJECT
AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO ENTER INTO AN
AGREEMENT WITH THE KENTUCKY TRANSPORTATION
CABINET TO EXECUTE ANY DOCUMENTS WHICH ARE
DEEMED NECESSARY BY KTC TO FACILITATE AND
ADMINISTER THE PROJECT AND TO ACT AS THE
AUTHORIZED CORRESPODENT FOR THIS PROJECT

WHEREAS, the federal-aid highway program state administered funding was
awarded in the amount of $96,000.00; and

WHEREAS this amount will be authorized in phases as federal requirements
are met for the Franklin-Simpson Wildcat Way Project; and

WHEREAS, the City of Franklin does hereby authorize Mayor Larry Dixon to
sign the above mentioned Agreement, as well as any other necessary documents relating
to the project.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Commissioners of
the City of Franklin, Kentucky, that the Mayor is hereby authorized to execute and
furnish all required documentation, including agreements, as may be required by KTC
of the FHWA for the furtherance of the above-referenced project and to act as the
authorized correspondent for said project.

Adopted by the unanimous vote of the Board of Commissioner of the City of
Franklin, Kentucky, at a meeting held on February 10, 2020.

LARRY DIXON, Mayor

ATTEST:

Cathy Dillard, City Clerk

P. 17



AGREEMENT BETWEEN
THE COMMONWEALTH OF KENTUCKY TRANSPORTATION CABINET
AND
CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY PROJECT
ITEM#: 03-03218/CONTRACT#: 20*619
FEDERAL PROJ#: 4000-143/STATE PROJ#: 10705
FEDERAL AWARD AMOUNT: $96,000
AUTHORIZED TO DATE: $96,000

This AGREEMENT is made and entered into by and between the Commonwealth of Kentucky,
Transportation Cabinet, hereinafter the "CABINET" and the City of Franklin, hereinafter the "RECIPIENT".

WITNESSETH:

WHEREAS, the Federal Highway Administration (FHWA), through the CABINET, has approved
$96,000 in federal funding for the Frankiin-Simpson Wildcat Way hereinafter the “PROJECT”, known as
Federal Project Number 4000-143 and the applicable Catalog of Federal Demestic Assistance number is
20.205-Highway Planning and Construction,

WHEREAS, the Federal-aid Highway Program is a State Administered Reimbursement Program
and the RECIPIENT shall carry out this PROJECT in accordance with applicable Federal and State laws
and regulations including all of Title 49 United States Code (USC), Title 23 United States Code (USC), 49
Code of Federal Regulations (CFR), 23 Code of Federal Regulations (CFR), and 2 CFR 200,

WHEREAS, the RECIPIENT must comply with applicable CABINET policies and procedures,

WHEREAS, Federal-aid projects are to serve a public purpose, the RECIPIENT is responsible for
maintaining any real property or facilities improved pursuant to the PROJECT on a non-profit basis,

WHEREAS, the RECIPIENT shall refer to the Federal-Aid Project Development Guide for Local
Public Agencies, hereinafter the "GUIDE”, and any future revisions for assistance in complying with this
AGREEMENT,

WHEREAS, the RECIPIENT shall outline, undertake, and complete the work as described in the
Scope of Work and Budget Summary (Attachment A) in accordance with the terms and conditions of this
AGREEMENT, and consistent with the FHWA Contract Administration Manual, the CABINET/FHWA
Stewardship Agreement, FHWA Form 1273 and all applicable State and Federal laws and regulations,

WHEREAS, the RECIPIENT shall demonstrate and shall maintain adequate staff, provide delivery
systems, and sufficient accounting control to complete the PROJECT in accordance with all Federal and
State laws and regulations addressed herein, and

WHEREAS, the RECIPIENT has agreed to provide a minimum of 20% matching funds and to
accept responsibility for all administration, staffing, maintenance and operation costs for the Project as
identified under this AGREEMENT;]

NOW THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual covenants and agreements herein set forth, the
CABINET and the RECIPIENT hereby agree as follows:

Section 1. Scope of Work & Budget Summary. |t is understood that the PROJECT will enhance
the transportation system as further described in the Scope of Work and Budget Summary (Attachment A,
attached hereto and made a part of this AGREEMENT). In the Scope of Work and Budget Summary, the
RECIPIENT is to include detailed expectations, individual activities, estimates, and a schedule with
milestones which the CABINET will use as checkpoints for the PROJECT. Further, the RECIPIENT is to

PaP§e1l %f 21



CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY
03-03218

$96,000/ TA

define the roles, responsibilities, and authorities of the various entities and/or organizational units with
regard to the project development and project delivery processes specific to this PROJECT in the Scope
of Work and Budget Summary.

The RECIPIENT shall identify and provide a point of contact, including adequate contact
information, for who shall be responsible to manage this PROJECT on the RECIPIENT’s behalf, submit the
Scope of Work and Budget Summary to the CABINET, and be responsible for ensuring that the RECIPIENT
adheres to all terms and conditions of this AGREEMENT. The RECIPIENT shall have final design plans,
specifications, and a total estimate prepared by a Professional Engineer licensed to practice in the
Commonwealth of Kentucky and approved by the CABINET prior to any construction. The Project
Development Checklist (LPA-PDC) (Appendix 1 of the GUIDE) shall be submitted by the RECIPIENT and
certified by the CABINET prior to construction.

Section 2. Effective Date of Agreement and Term of Eligible Reimbursement. It is understood the
effective date of this AGREEMENT is the date the AGREEMENT is signed by the Secretary of the
CABINET. After execution of the AGREEMENT, the CABINET will return a copy of the AGREEMENT to
the RECIPIENT and issue a Notice to Proceed to begin work on a particular Phase of the PROJECT.
Expendftures made prior to the effective date of the AGREEMENT and before the Notice to Proceed for the

particular Phase covering the expenditure shall not be eligible for reimbursement. The Term of Eligible
Reimbursement under this AGREEMENT shall end June 30, 2022 unless that Term is extended or
amended by written agreement in accordance with the provisions of KRS 45A and 2 CFR Part 200 as to
period of performance. Any and all funding obligated for any Phase of this PROJECT defined by the original
Scope of Work and authorized changes shall be available to reimburse the RECIPIENT for eligible work
activities completed and costs incurred after the effective date of this AGREEMENT and the Notice to
Proceed covering that Phase of the PROJECT. if the PROJECT cannot be completed during the Term of
Eligible Reimbursement under this AGREEMENT, the RECIPIENT must provide justification why the
PROJECT end date should be extended and identify the new Term of Eligible Reimbursement being
requested.

Section 3. Funding Out Provision. The CABINET may terminate this contract if funds are not

appropriated to the contracting agency or are not otherwise available for the purpose of making payments
without incurring any obligation for payment after the date of termination, regardiess of the terms of the
contract. The CABINET shall provide the RECIPIENT thirty (30) calendar days written notice of termination
of the contract.

This AGREEMENT is contingent upon the continued availability of appropriated Federal funding.
If the funding appropriated for any Phase of the PROJECT becomes unavailable for any reason including
the Kentucky General Assembly’s failure to appropriate the funding, by operation of law or as the result of
a reduction in Federal funding, further reimbursement of PROJECT expenditures may be denied, the -
PROJECT may be cancelled, the timeline extended or the scope amended by the CABINET either in whole
or in part without penalty. Denial of further reimbursement, PROJECT cancellation, extension or
amendment because of an interruption in the appropriated funding is not a default or breach of this

ng'e E gf 21



CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY
03-03218

$96,000/ TA

AGREEMENT by the CABINET nor may such denial, cancellation, extension or amendment give rise to
any claim against the CABINET.

Section 4. Duration of Project. Itis understood and agreed by the parties hereto that the Scope of
Work shall be completed within the period set forth herein under Section 2. In the event the RECIPIENT
fails to perform the Scope of Work within the time allotted, or at any time the RECIPIENT fails to maintain

adequate staff, project delivery systems, or sufficient accounting control, the CABINET reserves the right
to cancel further reimburéements related to the PROJECT under the AGREEMENT. In the event the
CABINET denies further reimbursement under this section, the RECIPIENT shall refund all reimbursements
made by the CABINET to the RECIPIENT under this AGREEMENT.

Section 5. Project Funding. It is expressly understood that Federai funding for this PROJECT is
being provided by the Federal Highway Administration (FHWA) through the CABINET, specifically through
the Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance program number 20.205, Highway Planning and Construction.
The Federal share of the total cost of this AGREEMENT shall not exceed $96,000 kthe amount indicated
on Attachment A unless otherwise approved in writing by the CABINET with the concurrence of FHWA. If
the RECIPIENT completes the PROJECT for less than this amount, the remaining funds may only be used
by the RECIPIENT upon written agreement of the CABINET and may only be used for eligible PROJECT
costs within the original PROJECT scope. Unless otherwise stated, the funding for the PROJECT shall be

authorized in Phases and no reimbursement shall be considered for expenditures made before a Notice to

Proceed for that Phase has been received. Reimbursement requests will be considered only for and up to
the funding amount and type of work described in the approved Scope of Work and Budget and authorized
by the Notice to Proceed for that Phase. The RECIPIENT has agreed to accept up to $96,000 in Federal
reimbursement funding available as authorized in Phases for eligible PROJECT costs. The RECIPIENT
shall be responsible for any ineligible costs, the required 20% local match funds ($24,000), and any costs
in excess of $96,000 necessary for completion of the approved Scope of Work and any authorized changes
to the PROJECT.

The RECIPIENT shall pay all PROJECT expenses and only upon meeting all terms and conditions
of this AGREEMENT will be eligible to receive Federal reimbursement funding. All charges to the
PROJECT shall be supported by properly executed invoices, contracts, vouchers, or monthly employment
data evidencing in proper detail the nature and propriety of the charge. The CABINET or FHWA méy
require additional documentation at their discretion.

Section 6. Allowable Costs. Funding may be used for restoration, repair, construction and other
activities eligible under the Surface Transportation Program (STP) as defined within 23 USC 133(b).
Funding may also be used for passenger and freight rail transportation and port infrastructure projects
eligible for assistance under subsection 23 USC 601(a)(8). The PROJECT costs referred to in this
AGREEMENT shall be those costs included in the Scope of Work (Attachment A) and submitted fo the
CABINET on the Reimbursement Request Form. The RECIPIENT shall follow 2 CFR 200.

The RECIPIENT is responsible for adhering to all Federal and State laws and regulations listed in
this AGREEMENT and all documents referred to herein. The CABINET shall reimburse the RECIPIENT

Pa%é ng 21



CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY
03-03218

$96,000/ TA

upon request by the RECIPIENT providing proof of payment through appropriate documentation, which
includes but is not limited to the following: work progress.completed to date, expenses, cancelled checks,
bank statements, verified affidavits, and employment reports. The RECIPIENT shall also certify the work
shown on the invoice has been performed in accordance with the terms of this AGREEMENT and approved
plans and specifications, the cost(s) shown are verified and are true and correct, and the request for
reimbursement in no way represents any degree of duplication of payments that have or will be received
from other funding sources. This formal letter must be signed by the designated project manager for the
RECIPIENT in responsible charge.

Reimbursement by the CABINET is also subject to the provisions of Sections 35 and 38 of this
Agreement hereof. The CABINET or FHWA reserves the right to require additional documentation.

Section 7. Reporting and Monitoring The RECIPIENT shall maintain and comply with all reporting
requirements outlined by the CABINET and FHWA.

This Federal-aid project is subject to the reporting requirements contained in the Federal Funding
Accountability and Transparency Act (Transparency Act) of 2006 Public Law No. 109-282 and/or 31 USC
6101 and its associated amendments. The Transparency Act requires entities receiving Federal awards

such as Federal contracts, sub-contracts, grants and sub-grants, to disclose certain information. This
Agreement is subject o 31 USC 6101, 2 CFR 170, and 2 CFR Subtitle A, Chapter | and Part 25. The
CABINET may require that the RECIPIENT provide a completed Federal Funding Accountability and
Transparency Act form prior to execution of this Agreement.

The making, recording and reporting of any purchases shall be undertaken in accordance with the
requirements of KRS 45A and applicable federal guidelines. All checks, invoices, contract records,
vouchers, orders, purchasing documents, and monthly employment data pertaining in whole or in part to
the PROJECT shall be clearly identified and readily accessible. The RECIPIENT shall permit the CABINET
and/or FHWA to conduct periodic site visits to aséertain compliance with Federal and State laws and
regulations. The RECIPIENT shail maintain financial records for three years after the latest of pfoject
completion, the execution of the Project Closure Form by KYTC, Final Acceptance and final reimbursement.

Section 8. Environmental Requirements. With the advice and assistance of the CABINET, the

RECIPIENT shall ensure that all applicable environmental requirements are met including the preparation
of appropriate environmental documentation prepared pursuant to the National Environmental Policy Act
(NEPA) of 1969 addressing the social and environmental effects of the proposed PROJECT. Adequate
resources must be devoted to ensuring that all applicable environmental reviews under NEPA are
completed on an expeditious basis and that the shortest existing applicable process under NEPA shall be
utilized. Compliance with NEPA 42 USC 4321 et seq, Section 4(f) of 49 USC 303, Section 106 of the
National Historic Preservation Act 54 USC 300101 et seq, Sections 401 and 404 of the Clean Water Act,
Section 7 of the Endangered Species Act, and any other applicable environmental laws and regulations
must be received to permit funding authorization by the FHWA. Specifically, Phase | design activities will
be allowed to proceed without a valid environmental document; however, the commencement of any Phase
Il design, right-of-way acquisition, utility relocation, or construction activities shall not be permitted prior to

Pagé 42c]f21



CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY
03-03218

$96,000/ TA

approval of the appropriate environmental document. Federal funds will be available for reimbursement of
construction costs upon successful completion of design activities.

Section 9. Land Acquisition. Should the PROJECT require the acquisition of any interest in real
property by the RECIPIENT; the RECIPIENT must comply with the Uniform Relocation Assistance and
Real Property Acquisition Policies Act of 1970 (49CFR part 24), State Law and KYTC Division of Right of
Way & Utilities Right of Way Guidance Manual and Relocation Assistance Manual. In the event

condemnation occurs, the CABINET shall require prior written approval prior to the institution of any
condemnation proceedings by the RECIPIENT.

The RECIPIENT shall ensure that all real property acquisition, relocation assistance, and property
management are completed in a fair, equitable and approved manner consistent with all State and Federal
laws and regulations governing the acquisition of real property for public use using State or Federal highway
funding. (1) The RECIPIENT shall either adopt in writing the CABINET's written Policies and Procedures
for Right of Way Acquisition and Relocation Assistance or present its own written Policies and Procedures
for approval by the CABINET's Division of Right of Way and Utilities and, if applicable, the FHWA. (2) The
RECIPIENT shall conduct all appraisals and appraisal reviews using personnel meeting the CABINET's
minimum qualifications and listed on the CABINET's pre-qualified appraiser and reviewer list. (3) The
- RECIPIENT must use an acquisition consultant, prequalified by the CABINET, on all or any portion of the
PROJECT, unless given prior approval by the CABINET to acquire property utilizing the RECIPIENT's
staff. The selection of the consultant shall be in accordance with the CABINET’s Division of Right of Way
Guidance Manual. (4) All appraisals must be reviewed and approved by the CABINET's Central Office
review appraisers, failure to do so will result in the PROJECT being ineligible for reimbursement. (5) The
RECIPIENT shall provide property management in accordance with approved procedures and be
responsible for the abatement of any asbestos containing materials and removal of contaminated soils
pursuant to applicable State and Federal laws and regulations. (6) The RECIPIENT shall provide the
CABINET and, when applicable, FHWA, necessary assurance that all real property has been acquired and
all displaced individuals, businesses, non-profit organizations and farms have been offered relocation
assistance according to applicable State and Federal laws and regulations. (7) The RECIPIENT shall
provide the CABINET, and when applicable, FHWA, necessary documentation for review and approval at
various stages of the acquisition process, as described in the CABINET’s Right of Way Relocation
Assistance Guidance Manual.

The CABINET shall: (1) Review all appraisal reports to ensure proper appraisal practice and
procedures as well as compliance with State and Federal laws and regulations, and (2) Approve the final
value conclusion through the Director, Division of Right of Way and Utilities.

The RECIPIENT shall provide to the CABINET the following information on each parcel of real
property to be acquired:

e Atitle opinion for the Property,

s An accurate legal description and plat delineating the shape and location of the Property to be

acquired, (In accordance to KYTC Division of Design Specifications)

Palgé Zc% 21



CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY
03-03218

$96,000/ TA

e The total area of the Property,

e The Property interest to be acquired

Should the acquisition of real property result in the displacement of a tenant-occupant, such
displacement shall be subject to the requirements of the URA,' as set out in implementing regulations 49
CFR Part 24. A displaced tenant shall be eligible for moving expenses and any other relocation expenses
for which they might qualify.

Section 10. Restrictive Easements. The RECIPIENT acknowledges that the CABINET will require

the placement of a restrictive easement approved by and in favor of the CABINET in the chain of title of

any real property acquired or improved pursuant to the PROJECT in favor of the CABINET. If the Owner
of any real property acquired or improved pursuant to the PROJECT is different from the RECIPIENT, then
the Owner shall sign and be made a party to this AGREEMENT and the Owner hereby acknowledges,
covenants and consents to the placement of a restrictive easement for perpetual maintenance of the
property acquired or improved pursuant to the PROJECT in the chain of title in favor of the CABINET prior
to final reimbursement by the CABINET.

Section 11. Reimbursable Utility Relocations. When conducting a utility relocation, KRS 177.035

ahd KRS 179.265 determine the necessity of payment on behalf of the utility company in question. When
law requires the reimbursement of the work, the cost of constructing the most economical type of facilities
that satisfactorily meet the service requirements of the former facilities is negotiated, and an agreement is
executed between the RECIPIENT and the utility company. Ultility relocations shall be designed by the
utility; company and shown on the PROJECT's survey and general plan sheets. The impacted utility
comp\ény, with its regular construction or maintenance personnel, and/or with an approved contractor or
subcontractor, will furnish all engineering, administration, labor, and materials to make and complete all
necessary adjustments of its facilities to accommodate the PROJECT. The RECIPIENT shall inspect the
relocation and document the proper installation of the facilities. If it is determined that the utility relocation
work is best conducted within the PROJECT’s construction contract, the RECIPIENT or the authority
designated by the RECIPIENT will negotiate, execute the agreement, and inspect the relocation work. Ifa
conflict of interest arises between the RECIPIENT and a utility company, the CABINET shall intercede to
provide the utility coordination.

Section 12. Non-Reimbursable Utility Relocations. When KRS 179.265 indicates the work is not
reimbursable, the utility company shall design their relocation plan on the PROJECT’s survey and general

plan sheets. The RECIPIENT shall perform a review and approval of the relocation per agency policy and
procedure. The RECIPIENT shall inspect the relocation and document the proper instaliation of the
facilities. If a conflict of interest arises between RECIPIENT and a utility company, the CABINET shall
intercede to provide the utility coordination.

Section 13. General Railroad Coordination. The RECIPIENT shall be charged with any railroad
coordination for the PROJECT, the execution of a contract with the impacted railroad and oversight of the
_execution. All work related to the PROJECT shall be done in accordance with the CABINET’s Standards,
Specifications, Standard Drawings, and the Utilities and Rail Manual. Correspondence pertaining to

Pa%é 2321




CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY
03-03218

$96,000/ TA

railroad coordination may impact both the project development and construction of the PROJECT.
Therefore any and all correspondence regarding railroad coordination activities must be provided to both
contracted parties. The CABINET's representative in such matter is the Central Office Rails Coordinator.

The RECIPIENT shall provide the following with the bid package for the PROJECT: a railroad
coordination note defining any and all special project terms and conditions due to the involvement of the
railroad company and an estimate of the PROJECT expenses for railroad coordination.

Section 14. General Utility Coordination. The RECIPIENT shall be charged with the identification
of utility facilities in conflict with the PROJECT, the execution of a remedy for said conflict, and oversight of

the execution. The CABINET encourages dutiful consideration of utility avoidance via design
considerations. When avoidance is impossible, uneccnomical or otherwise invalid, utility relocation is an
acceptable remedy for conflict. All work related to the PROJECT shall be done in accordance with the
CABINET's Standards, Specifications, Standard Drawings, and the Utilities and Rail Guidance Manual.
Correspondence pertaining to utility coordination may affect both the project development and construction
of the PROJECT. Therefore any and all correspondence regarding utility coordination activities must be
provided to both contracted parties. The CABINET's representative on these matters is the District Office
Utility Supervisor.

. The RECIPIENT shall provide the following upon full execution of the utility relocation for the
PROJECT: 3 sets of as-built plans for each utility company that completes faclility relocation on the project
prior to the construction letting, a utility and rail certification note defining the utilities and railroad identified
in the PROJECT scope, relocations that have been performed, incomplete relocations, and completion
schedules for the incomplete work. If no railroad is invdlved the note shall indicate as such.

Section 15. Permits and Licenses. The RECIPIENT is responsible for obtaining all permits and

licenses required to initiate, perform and complete all phases of the PROJECT in an appropriate and timely
manner. Per the CABINET/FHWA Stewardship Agreement, the PROJECT may require more involvement
from the FHWA. ,

Section 16. Design and Construction Standards, All Federal and State design and construction
criteria for the type of work shall be followed, including but not limited to 23 CFR 625, the CABINET's
Highway Design Manual, the CABINET’s Standard Drawings, the CABINET's Standard Specifications for
Road and Bridge Construction, the CABINET’s Drainage Manual, the CABINET’s Structural Design Manual,
the American Association of State Highway Transportation Officials’ (AASHTO) “Policy on Geometric
Design of Highways and Streets”, and the FHWA's Manual on Uniform Traffic Control Devices (MUTCD).
All work performed shall be in accordance with the most recent edition of the CABINET's Standard

Specifications for Road and Bridge Construction, as revised, and as provided in Subsection 105.01 of said
Specifications. All materials furnished shall be in accordance with Subsection 106 of said Specifications to
include all CABINET List of Approved Materials. These standards, specifications, and criteria are
incorporated in this AGREEMENT by this reference.

Section 17. Consultant Selection. The RECIPIENT shall be responsible for all PROJECT design
activities, which may be completed either by the RECIPIENT's staff or a consultant. If the RECIPIENT

pa'Sé ?é’f 21




CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY
03-03218

$96,000/ TA

selects to perform the design work with internal staff, these costs will be eligible for an in-kind match if pre-
approved by the CABINET Administering Office. If the RECIPIENT selects tc perform the work through a
consultant, the RECIPIENT, with the oversight and approval of the CABINET, shall be responsible for the
advertisement, selection, and contracting for consultant engineering and related services for the PROJECT
in compliance with the Federal requirements set forth in the Brooks Act USC 40 1101, Public Law 92-582,
the FHWA policy outlined in 23 CFR 172, CABINET policies and procedures, the CABINET procurement
policies, and the Kentucky Model Procurement Code as defined within KRS 45A.730-750. This requires
the use of a Qualifications Based Selection (QBS) process for the selection of all engineering and related
services. By complying with KRS 45A.730-750, the required Federal provisions of the Brooks Act will be
satisfied. All plans and specifications must be prepared by a professional engineer or architect licensed in
the Commonwealth of Kentucky and prequalified by the CABINET to practice the type of work to be done.
If no CABINET prequalification category exists, a consultant must receive approval by the CABINET prior
to working on the PROJECT. The RECIPIENT may choose to enter into a letter agreement with a
consultant that has a statewide contract with the CABINET instead of going through the procurement
process itself.

Section 18. Contractor Procurement. The RECIPIENT shall be responsible for all PROJECT
construction activities, which may be completed either by the RECIPIENT's staff or by a contractor. If the

RECIPIENT intends to use contractor services, the RECIPIENT shall be responsible for the advertisement,
opening of bids, selection, and contracting for contractor services for the PROJECT, with the concurrence
of the CABINET, in accordance with the Federal contract provisions listed in FHWA Form 1273 which take
precedence over the Kentucky Model Procurement Code provisions KRS 45A.343 and KRS 45A.345-460,
as well as KRS 424, 23 CFR 635, 23 USC 112. Bid proposals must be accepted for a minimum of 21 days
from the date of the first advertisement for award. Contractors and subcontractors must be pre-qualified by
the CABINET for the type of work prior to being awarded a contract. If no CABINET prequalification
category exists, a contractor or subcontractor must receive the approval of the CABINET prior to working
on the PROJECT.

The RECIPIENT shall prepare an independent engineer's estimate in accordance with 23 CFR
630, Subpart B to compare against the contractors’ bids for reasonableness. The RECIPIENT shall
thoroughly review all bids and obtain concurrence from the CABINET prior to the award or the rejection of
any contract of bids for work or materials to be used on this PROJECT. Factors that should be considered
and documented in reviewing submitted bids are: a comparison of the bids against the engineer’s estimate,
the number of bids submitted, the distribution or range of bids received, the geographic location of bidders,
any potential savings from readvertising the PROJECT, a comparison of bids against other recent bids for
the same item or service, the urgency of the PROJECT, the number of times previously advertised or
contracted for, the current market conditions, a comparison of unit bids versus engineer's estimate unit
bids, the funding available. Determining whether the bids received are adequate involves considering any
critical safety improvements, ‘emergency repair or replacement of damaged facilities, the opening of
otherwise completed facilities to traffic, furthering a phased construction schedule, or any other factors

PaFg);'e g§f21



CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY
03-03218

$96,000/ TA

deemed important by the CABINET or FHWA. Specific Federal requirements defined within 23 CFR 635
require that the award be made to the lowest responsive bidder meeting the criteria of responsibility
established by the CABINET.

Section 19. Contract Administration and Inspection It is understood that the RECIPIENT shall be

responsible for all aspects of administration, testing, and inspections to ensure the materials and
construction meet CABINET specifications and Federal quality assurance specifications referenced in 23
CFR 637 and 23 CFR 635.105 (a) or (b). This includes providing daily on-site inspection of contractor work
activities and prompt processing all of the paperwork associated with the construction contract, including
any change orders. The RECIPIENT must receive prior written CABINET approval for all change orders,
but such approval shall not increase the funding obligated to the RECIPIENT under this AGREEMENT or
otherwise.

The RECIPIENT shall use the most recent edition of the CABINET’S Regional Highway and Bridge
Construction Inspection advertisement for construction inspectors, or must receive CABINET approval to
submit an Alternative Construction Inspection Plan. If the RECIPIENT does not have adequate staff to
perform this work, the RECIPIENT may hire a consultant or enter into an agreement with another
governmental agency to provide these services. The CABINET must review and approve the Construction
Engineering and Inspection agreement and the agreement with the service provider and a copy of both in
the PROJECT file as required by FHWA. If the RECIPIENT elects to hire a consultant, the RECIPIENT
must ensure that the consultant staff is competent in construction inspection and performs all work under
the direct supervision of a registered professional engineer or architect licensed in the Commonwealth of
Kentucky. The use of a consultant does not relieve the RECIPIENT of ultimate responsibility for the proper
administration and inspection of the construction. If a consultant is used to provide inspection services, the
RECIPIENT must also provide an appropriately certified and licensed RECIPIENT employee'to be in
responsible charge of the PROJECT and oversee the inspections.

When an Alternative Construction Inspection Plan is submitted, the RECIPIENT must ensure
sufficient quantity and quality are delivered and that proper inspection documentation is maintained. The
Alternative Construction Inspection Plan must be performed under the supervision of a Professional
Engineer licensed in the State of Kentucky, include credentials and experience of inspectors, indicate
testing consistent with the CABINET's Sampling Manual, detail the frequency, who will be responsible, and
what will be included in reports, and coordinate with the CABINET’s construction inspector.

The CABINET and/or the FHWA may conduct an anncunced or unannounced field review of the
PROJECT at any time. This field review is intended to verify conformance with all laws, regulations, and
policies applicable to the Federal-aid Highway Program and provide assistance to the RECIPIENT where
necessary.

Section 20. Davis-Bacon and Related Acts. The 1931 Davis-Bacon Act (prevailing Federal wage)

requires the RECIPIENT of all Federal-aid construction projects to comply with contractor and subcontractor
payment rates and fringe benefits as determined by the Secretary of Labor for corresponding classes of

laborers and mechanics engaged on similar construction, alteration, and/or repair of public buildings or

Palgé g 06f 21



CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY
03-03218

$96,000/ TA

public works, painting, or decorating projects in the locality. Specific wage rates shall be included in the
construction contract between the RECIPIENT and the contractor, which must also include a contract
provision that overrides the general applicability provisions in Form FHWA-1273, Sections IV and V.
Section 21. The Contract Work Hours and Safety Standards Act. During the construction of the
PROJECT, the RECIPIENT shail comply with the Contract Work Hours and Safety Standards Act which
contains weekly (after 40 hours) overtime pay requirements and applies to most Federal contracts which

may require or involve the employment of laborers and mechanics, including watchmen and guards.
Section 107 of the Act provides health and safety standards on covered construction work which are
administered by the Occupational Safety and Health Administration (OSHA). The RECIPIENT shall refer
to the Contract Work Hours and Safety Standards Act for the requirements under this provision.

Section 22. The Copeland "Anti-Kickback" Act. The RECIPIENT shall comply with the "Anti-

Kickback" section of the Copeland Act, which makes it punishable to induce any person working on a

Federally funded or assisted construction project to "give up any part of the compensation to which he is
entitled under his contract of employment." The RECIPIENT shall refer to the Copeland Act for the
requirements under this provision.

Section 23. Title VI - Civil Rights Act of 1964. The RECIPIENT shall comply with all requirements
imposed by'TitIe VI of the Civil Rights Act of 1964 (78 Stat. 252), the Regulations of the United States
Department of Transportation issued thereunder (CFR Title 49, Subtitle A, Part 21), and the assurance by

the RECIPIENT pursuant thereto, including prohibition regarding discrimination.
Section 24. Equal Employment Opportunity (Equal Opportunity Act of 1972). In connection with
the execution of this AGREEMENT, the RECIPIENT shall take affirmative action and not discriminate

against any employee or applicant for employment to ensure that applicants are employed, and that

employees are fairly treated during their employment. Such actions shall include, but not be limited to the
following: employment, upgrading, demotion or transfer; recruitment or recruitment advertising; layoff or
termination; rates of pay or other forms of compensation; and selection of training including apprenticeship.
The RECIPIENT shall incorporate the foregoing requirements of this paragraph in all subcontracts for
services covered by this AGREEMENT.

Section 25. Non Discrimination (Executive Order 11246). Discrimination (because of race, religion,

color, national origin, sex, sexual orientation, gender identity) is prohibited. This section applies only to
contracts utilizing federal funds, in whole or in part. During the performance of this contract, the RECIPIENT
agrees as follows:

a. The RECIPIENT will not discriminate against any employee, applicant, contractor or
consultant for employment because of race, religion, color, national origin, sex, sexual
orientation, gender identity, or age. The RECIPIENT further agrees to comply with the
brovisions of the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) 42 USC 12101 et seq, Public Law
101-336, and applicable federal regulations relating thereto prohibiting discrimination
against otherwise qualified disabled individuals under any program or activity. The
RECIPIENT agrees to provide, upon request, needed reasonable accommodations. The

Pagé ?D7of 21



CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY
03-03218

$96,000/ TA

RECIPIENT will take affirmative action to ensure that applicants are employed and that
employees are treated during employment Withoutvregard to their race, religion, color,
national origin, sex, sexual orientation, gender identity, age or disability. Such action shall
include, but not be limited to the following; employment, upgrading, demotion or transfer;
recruitment or recruitment advertising; layoff or termination; rateé of pay or other forms of
compensations; and selection for training, including apprenticeship. The RECIPIENT
agrees to post in conspicuous places, available to employees and applicants for
employment, notices setting forth the provisions of this non-discrimination clause.

The RECIPIENT will, in all solicitations or advertisements for work placed by or on behalf
of the RECIPIENT:; state that all qualified applicants will receive consideration for
employment without regard to race, religion, color, national origin, sex, sexual orientation,
gender identity, age or disability.

The RECIPIENT will send to each labor union or representative of workers with which he
has a collective bargaining agreement or other contract or understanding, a notice advising
the said labor union or workers' representative of the RECIPIENT's commitments under
this section, and shall post copies of the notice in conspicuous places available to
employees and applicants for employment. The RECIPIENT will take such action with
respect to any contract, subcontract or purchase order as the CABINET or FHWA may
direct as a means of enforcing such provisions, including sanctions for noncompliance.
The RECIPIENT will comply with all provisions of Executive Order No. 11246 of September
24, 1965 as amended, and of the rules, regulations and relevant orders of the Secretary of
Labor.

The RECIPIENT will furnish all information and reports required by Executive Order No.
11246 of September 24, 1965, as amended, and by the rules, regulations and orders of
the Secretary of Labor, or pursuant thereto, and will permit access to the PROJECT books,
records and accounts by the CABINET or FHWA and the Secretary of Labor for purposes
of investigation to ascertain compliance with such rules, reguiations and orders.

In the event of the RECIPIENT's noncompliance with the nondiscrimination clauses of this
Agreement or with any of the said rules, regulations or orders, this Agreement may be
cancelled, terminated or suspended in whole or in part and the RECIPIENT may be
declared ineligible for further government contracts or federally-assisted construction
contracts in accordance with procedures authorized in Executive Order No. 11246 of
September 24, 1965, as amended, and such other sanctions may be imposed and
remedies invoked as provided in or as otherwise provided by faw.

The RECIPIENT will include the provisions of paragraphs (1) through (7) of section 202 of
Executive Order 11246 in every contract, subcontract or purchase order unless exempted
by rules, regulations or orders of the Secretary of Labor, issued pursuant to section 204 of .
Executive Order No.11246 of September 24, 1965, as amended, so that such provisions

Pagé 12180f21



CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY
03-03218

$96,000/ TA

will be binding upon each contractor, subcontractor, consultant or vendor. The RECIPIENT
will take such action with respect to any contract, subcontract or purchase order as the
CABINET or FHWA may direct as a means of enforcing such provisions including sanctions
for noncompliance; provided, however, that in the event a RECIPIENT becomes involved
in, or is threatened with, litigation with a contractor, subcontractor or vendor as a result of
such direction by the CABINET or FHWA, the RECIPIENT may request the United States
to enter into such litigation to protect the interests of the United States.

Section 26. Disadvantaged Business Enterprise (DBE) Requirements. An applicant DBE firm must
be given consideration for participation in the PROJECT and a DBE goal shall be set by the CABINET for
work on the PROJECT. The CABINET shall review and approve the DBE goal based on CABINET
processes and procedures. Any participating DBE firm must be certified as a DBE firm and be prequalified
with the CABINET. The RECIPIENT agrees fo comply with the DBE Requirements contained within 23
CFR 635 Subpart A, Section 1101(b) of Public Law 109-59 and 49 CFR Part 26 to ensure equal opportunity

to socially and economically disadvantaged small businesses.

Assurance. The contractor, subrecipient or subcontractor shall not discriminate in the performance
of this AGREEMENT. The contractor shall carry out applicable requirements of 48 CFR Part 26 in the
award and administration of contracts assisted by the United States Department of Transportation. Failure
by the contractor to carry out these requirements is a material breach of this contract, which may result in
the termination of this contract or such other allowable remedy the CABINET deems appropriate. Each
contract signed with a contractor (and each subcontract the prime contractor signs with a subcontractor)
must include this provision.

DBE Prompt Payment Requirement. The contract between the RECIPIENT and the contractor
shall include a contract provision that requires the contractor to comply with 49 CFR 26.29 and pay its
subcontractors within then (10) working days from receipt of each payment RECIPIENT makes to the
contractor. The RECIPIENT shall prohibit the contractor from withholding retainage on any subcontract on
this PROJECT to ensure prompt and full payment from the contractor to the subcontractor within 30 days
after the subcontractor's work is satisfactorily completed.

Section 27. Prohibited Interest. No member, officer, or employee of the CABINET or the

RECIPIENT during his tenure or for one (1) year thereafter shall have any financial interest, direct or
indirect, in this AGREEMENT or the proceeds thereof as identified in KRS 45A.340. The CABINET and
the RECIPIENT shall comply with the requirements of the Executive Branch Code of Ethics KRS Chapter
11A. No member, officer, or employee of the CABINET or RECIPIENT shall collude or lobby on behalf of
this PROJECT without penalty, inciuding but not limited to suspension or debarment.

Section 28. Covenant Against Contingent Fees. The RECIPIENT warrants that no person, selling

agency or other organization has been employed or retained to solicit or secure this AGREEMENT upon
an agreement or understanding for a commission, percentage, brokerage, or contingent fee. For breach
or violation of this warranty, the CABINET shall have the right to annul this AGREEMENT without liability

paﬁé 1%90f21



CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY
03-03218

$96,000/ TA

or, in its discretion, to deduct from the compensation, or otherwise recover, the full amount of such
commission, percentage, brokerage, or contingent fee.
Section 29. Interest of Members of or Delegates to Congress. No funding has been or will be paid

to a member or delegate to the Congress of the United States in connection with the awarding of this
Federal contract. Nor shall any member of or delegate to the Congress of the United States receive any
benefit'arising out of this Federal contract.

Section 30. Standards for the Treatment of Historic Properties. Projects including but not limited

to Historic preservation, impacting properties on or eligible for the Nation register of Historic Places shall
meet applicable Secretary of the Interior's Standards for the Treatment of Historic Properties, the Standards
and Guidelines for Archeology and Historic Preservation, and ali other applicable federal or state historic
property requirements prior to the payment of any monies under this AGREEMENT.

Section 31. Maintenance as Public Facilities. The RECIPIENT agrees to maintain the facilities in

an acceptable condition and for a public purpose in accordance with the Maintenance Plan. In addition,
any applicable landscaping in any project shall be maintained in an acceptable condition to include mowing,
trimming, or other maintenance. In the event that the property is not maintained as a public facility; the
RECIPIENT shall reimburse the FHWA for all proceeds provided for in this PROJECT including any
applicable interest, unless such change in use is approved in writing by the CABINET and FHWA, if
applicable.

Section 32. Americans with Disabilities Act. 42 USC 1201 et seq. The RECIPIENT agrees to
comply with the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990 (ADA) and Section 504 of the

Rehabilitation Act of 1973, P.L. 93-112, and other applicable Federal regulations relating hereto, issued by
the U.S. Department of Transportation. ADA prohibits discrimination against otherwise qualified individuals
under any program or activity receiving Federal financial assistance covered by this AGREEMENT and
imposes requirements that affect the design, construction, and maintenance of all transportation projects,
to provide access to all facilities.

Section 33. Applicable Laws. This AGREEMENT shall be in accordance with the laws of the
United States Department of Transportation, Federal Highway Administration, the United States of America,

and the Commonwealth of Kentucky.
Section 34. Hold Harmless Clause. To the extent permitted by law, the RECIPIENT shall indemnify

and hold harmless the FHWA and the CABINET and all of its officers, agents, and employees from all suits,

actions, or claims of any character arising from any injuries, payments or damages received or claimed by
any person, persons, or property resulting from implementation of any phase of the PROJECT or occurring
on or near the PROJECT site.

Section 35. Confract Completion. The RECIPIENT is responsible for ensuring that all PROJECT

construction activities have been completed and is responsible for providing all of the necessary paperwork

as required by the construction contract. This involves conducting a pre-audit of all contract items and
associated paperwork. When complete, the RECIPIENT'’s project engineer in responsible charge of the
PROJECT shall notify the CABINET the PROJECT is ready for final inspection. The RECIPIENT will

Pagé 1% %f 21



CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY
03-03218

$96,000/ TA

conduct, document and submit to the CABINET a field inspection to verify completion of the work in
substantial conformance with the AGREEMENT. The RECIPENT's project manager shall certify the
PROJECT was constructed in accordance with the plans and specificaticns and that the contractor has
paid all suppliers and subcontractors in full.

In accordance with 2 CFR 200, the RECIPIENT shall maintain all PROJECT records for three (3)
years after final payment.

Section 36. Audit and Inspection. The RECIPIENT, contracter and any subcontractors shall permit
the CABINET, the Comptroller General of the United States and the Secretary of the United States
Department of Transportation, or their authorized representatives, to inspect and approve all phases of the
PROJECT and all relevant PROJECT data and records, including any audit(s) of the RECIPIENT pertaining
to the PROJECT.

The RECIPIENT hereby acknowledges its duty to the CABINET to determine whether it is subject
to the Single Audit Act of 1984, P.L. 98-502, and the Single Audit Act Amendments of 1996, P.L. 104—156.
The RECIPIENT shall follow 2 CFR 200. In Accordance with 2 CFR Subpart F, If the RECIPIENT has
expended more than $750,000 in Federal funding from all sources in the RECIPIENTs fiscal year, the
RECIPIENT shall provide the CABINET copies of their 2 CFR 200 Subpart F audit reports within 9 months
of their fiscal year end. '

The RECIPIENT hereby acknowledges it is responsible to inform any entity it intends to hire or use
as a contractor, as defined in KRS 45A.030(9), that the contracting agency, the Finance and Administration
Cabinet, the Auditor of Public Accounts, and the Legislative Research Commission, or their duly authorized
representatives, shall have access to any of the contractor's books, documents, papers, records, or other
evidence, which are directly pertinent to this AGREEMENT for the purpose of financial audit or program
review. Furthermore, any of the contractor’s books, documents, papers, records or other evidence provided
to the contracting agency, the Finance and Administration Cabinet, the Auditor of Public Accounts, or the
Legislative Research Commission which are directly pertinent to the AGREEMENT shall be subject to
public disclosure regardless of the proprietary nature of the information, unless specific information is
identified and exempted and agreed to by the Secretary of the Finance and Administration Cabinet as
meeting the provisions of KRS 61.878(1)(c) prior to the execution of the AGREEMENT. The Secretary of
the Finance and Administration Cabinet shall not restrict the public release of any information, which would
otherwise be subject to public release if a State government agency were providing the service.

Section 37. Campaign Finance. The RECIPIENT shall certify that the contractor swears under the

penalty of perjury, as provided by KRS 523.020, that neither he/she nor the entity which he/she represents
has knowingly violated any provisions of the campaign finance laws of the Commonwealth, and that the
award of a contract to him/her or the entity which he/she represents will not violate any provisions of the
campaign finance laws of the Commonwealth.

. Section 38. Violations. Pursuantto KRS 45A.485, the RECIPIENT shall certify that all contractors
shall reveal to the CABINET any final determination of a violation within the previous five (5) year period
pursuant to KRS Chapter 139, 136, 141, 337, 338, 341 and 342. These statutes relate to the State sales

Page' 1% E)f 21



CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY
03-03218

$96,000/ TA

and use tax, corporate and utility tax, income tax, wages and hours laws, occupational safety and heaith
law, unemployment compensation law, and workers compensation insurance law, respectively.

The RECIPIENT shall certify that all contractors agree to be in continuous compliance with the
provisions of KRS Chapters 136, 139, 141, 337, 338, 341 and 342 for the duration of this AGREEMENT.
Failure to reveal a final determination of a violation of the referenced statutes or to comply with these
statutes for the duration of this AGREEMENT shall be groundé for the cancellation of the contract or
subcontract and disqualification of the contractor from eligibility for future State contracts for a period of two
(2) years.

Section 39. Personal Service Contracts and Memoranda of Agreement. If this AGREEMENT

comes under the purview of KRS 45A.690 - 45A.725, payments on personal service contracts and
memoranda of agreement shall not be authorized for services rendered after disapproval of the Government
Contract Review Committee unless the decision of the committee is overridden by the Secretary of Finance
and Administration Cabinet or agency head, if the agency has been granted delegation authority.

Section 40. Disputes. Any dispute concerning a question of fact in connection with the work, not
disposed of by agreement between the RECIPIENT and the CABINET, shall be referred to the Secretary
of .the Transportation Cabinet of the Commonwealth of Kentucky, or his duly authorized representative,
whose decision shall be final. Regulations concerning any claims to be filed by a contractor are referenced
in 23 CFR 635.124. A

Section 41. Agreement Change. Any proposed change to the Scope of Work or time extension to
this AGREEMENT shall comply with 23 CFR 635.120 and 635.121 and shall be evidenced in writing at the
mutual consent of the RECIPIENT and the CABINET.

Section 42. Termination. The CABINET may cancel all reimbursements under this AGREEMENT
at any time deemed to be in the best interest of the CABINET by giving thirty (30) calendar days written
notice of such cancellation to the RECIPIENT. If reimbursement under this AGREEMENT is canceled
under this section by reason other than violation of this AGREEMENT or a>ny applicable law by the
RECIPIENT, its agents, employees and contractors, the CABINET shall reimburse the RECIPIENT

according to the terms hereof for all expenses incurred under this AGREEMENT to the date of such

cancellation of reimbursement. The RECIPIENT may seek to cancel its obligations under this
AGREEMENT at any time deemed to be in the best interest of the RECIPIENT by giving thirty (30) calendar
days written notice of such request to the CABINET. If the CABINET agrees to allow the RECIPIENT to
cancel the PROJECT or cancel its obligations under this AGREEMENT, the RECIPIENT shall reimburse
the CABINET for all Federal funding reimbursements made under this AGREEMENT.

| Section 43. Resolution. The RECIPIENT shall pass a resolution authorizing the Mayor to sign this
AGREEMENT on behalf of the RECIPIENT. An acceptable Resoluﬂon shall contain the Project name,
description, amount of funds being provided and an acknowledgement that the RECIPIENT agrees to ratify
and adopt all statements, representations, warranties, covenants, and agreements contained in the
AGREEMENT. Furthermore, by accepting the funds the RECIPIENT agrees to all terms and conditions

Pagé %zof 21



CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY
03-03218

$96,000/ TA

stated in the AGREEMENT. A copy of the resolution shall be attached to the AGREEMENT (Attachment
B) and returned to the CABINET prior to full execution of this PROJECT.

Section 44. Responsible Charge. The RECIPIENT shall designate a Person in Responsible
Charge of this PROJECT according to the terms outlined in Attachment C. The RECIPIENT will provide
the name and contact information for the Person in Responsible Charge prior to full execution of this
PROJECT. The Attachment C information must be current for the RECIPIENT to be in compliance with the
federal regulations and an eligible recipient of federal funds. Should a change occur, the RECIPIENT must

submit a revised Attachment C within 7 days. Failure to comply can result in cancellation of the PROJECT.

Palgé %30f21



CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY
. 03-03218

$96,000/ TA

IN TESTIMONY WHEREOF, the parties have hereto caused this AGREEMENT to be executed upon

signature by their proper officers and representatives.

COMMONWEALTH OF KENTUCKY TRANSPORTATION CABINET:

Approved as to form and legality:

Attorney Jim Gray, Secretary

Date: Date:

City of Franklin:
Approved as to form and legality:

Attorney Mayor

Date: Date:

. 34
Page 1% of 21



CITY OF FRANKLIN
FRANKLIN-SIMPSON WILDCAT WAY
03-03218

$96,000/ TA

ATTACHMENT A
SCOPE OF WORK AND BUDGET SUMMARY

Recipient DUNS#:
Project FAIN#: 693JJ21930000Z300KY4000144

Scope of Work:
New 4.5' sidewalk on the N side of Wildcat Way and includes a new crosswalk and an island refuge to safeguard

pedestrians and students who travel this route

All federally-funded projects are set up in phases (design, ROW, utilities, construction). No work can begin on any phase of a project until the CABINET provides a written notice
to proceed for that phase. Funding for this project will be programmed with FHWA as each phase is approved. Effective December 26, 2014, FHWA requires a project end date
for each federal project phase programmed. As each phase of the project is programmed with FHWA a supplemental agreement will be sent to the project sponsor to add the
funding and adjust the project end date. Any expenditure incurred by the project sponsor after the end date will not be eligible for reimbursement. If the project sponsor requires
an extension, they must notify the Administering Office thirty (30) days before the project end date.

Budget:
Phase of Work Federal Funds Match Total ifg::te per
Design (incl Arch,
programmed w/ FHWA) $96’OOO 324‘000 $1 20,000

Future Phase Estimates

Phase of Work Federal Funds Match Total Estimate per
phase
Right-of-Way (Estimated) $0 $0 30
Utilities (Estimated) $0 30 $0
Construction (Estimated) $0 $0 $0
Est Total Future Phases ' $0 $0 $0
ij:a‘;“’mp’eted Project $96,000 $24,000 $120,000

Pag%'1§(§f21



AN

YICHYIORANDUM
T Franklin ity Carrmisaion
Le: Lipcate of Damalivien of ¥em Madizor Sireel Properly

Thatis: February fi, 2020

Sleve Aking the Ciy’s Public Works Schedoler will provice an updars to the Commmssion
reparling ihe ongeing demmolition ol the swarshouse located on West Madisor Streel,

P. 3B






i e L e n i

it i

i B !
S HT

B

R

= o =

S

a0y

e

i







MEMORANDUM

TO: Mayor and City Commissioners
FROM: Kenton Powell

DATE: February 6t 2020

SUBJECT: Budget Plan FY2020/21 Activities

Budget Planning activities are in the near future, how exciting! On the next page is a
Project Plan outlining each step from meeting with the Department Heads, Work
Sessions with Commission, including the first and second reading of the FY2020/21
Budget. » '

Highlighted in yellow on the Budget Plan (next page) are two proposed dates
concerning Commission Work Sessions. The first Work Session date is Monday, May
11 from 9am to 11:00am and the second is Monday, June 1st from 9am to 11:00am.

Please let me know on Monday, during our regular scheduled Commission meeting if
you have any questions.

Thank You,

Kenton Powell

P. 40



E B 7 H Lo
12 A 14 15

1
1w B o

Z6 2F 38 o sip 3

20 21 22 23 24 35 36
£7 28 2t 3o

Soile Snars Mzelings

.r!I:T.t -\_i. ¥ Ih::ur 1'_'-'Ir15.'"!| |-.|F:_
Lzdsed Winspaic sy
IIaiaey

i
-l

Hgm arbles ing Ty ‘

B 10 i1 42 i3 14 1%
1 17 15 15 20 z1 9
26 24 23 25 27 2 2p

I . S ¢ T
B : 2 5 5
¢ MY B a0 i 12 13

12 13 15 17 ig
21 B R R TR

A M7 oW oy e 3

1. 2 B
4 E 5 7 % 9 19
31 12 a3 14 15 43 gy
16 2% 20 21 22 23
25 26 27 2% 23 30 W

City Commission Meeting Dateg

2 9 10
1% 16 17 1&
2% 23 24
26 30 31

5 nd T .:.'.I.r

T bo: ik

1 Z &
&. B 7 B i 11

12 18 14 15 15 17 4n
i3 26 21 22 a2z 25 =
£5 27 o2& A5 3¢ 31

189 26 21
Ah 26 27 i=m

=

=
=
-
1

| B
e

"% TA

0 a2
8}
=
Lr
o

0 S = 1

if 13 19 20 Z1
20 25 [

15
F 3

it
48

a M T W ¥ F 3

.l
E B 7 8 g 1L
B iz ca 15 I.IS.!.E
1% 20 21 22 33 24 2%
26 27 28 20 &y
E [ Yoo.uw oo F 2
;
2.5 R @ o g
2 3 11 12 i3 14o1n
16 17 18 13 20 21 31
2T 24 25 25 27 25 =9
831

5 ke T I T F £

1 2 3 5
E 7 85 & 13 11 i3
1% 14 15 16 17 18 19
20 23 22 73 2B
I¥ 2 29 30 2




(NE] "
Conp el

T o
y s
A
a0
5 |06E

TH |
R R
R
LU (h
10 et
1103
17 |oes
3|
11 0%
LR i
1 0%
17 0%,
18 (%

TR
20 0%

il
rr:ﬂ_ra%

o

e -.__:“{_:

-
- "‘r_: '\.l.il.-I ¥

Capital Kick-CHt mtg - review fiming 1day
Capilal regquuesy Tormes compleled Locdays
Budget Expenditures Work Session with 9 days
Dopartment Hoads
Create Department FY2010,/20 Budaat 2 days
Planning Ferms
Departrnent Hesdys cormplele 5cdays
EYADS0 udget Farms
Review Completed Budgiet Formes with G days
e partment Heads
Commurily Services reguosl - confivmed 13 days
Hewene | arecast 17 days
Budget Consclidation 41 3 duys
Commission Weark Sessioh #1 O-days
Reviswing: Capital, Expenditures,
Community Services & Reyenue forecast
Revize Budgel based upon Commissicn 4 days
It
Heallh Insuranoe assurmplicon 7odays
G assumptinn T days
Bucget Comsobidalion #2 2 dlays
Commission Work Session #2 Reviewing: 0 days
All Budget e rms
Revize Budpet basad upen Commissian d days
It
Regular Scheduled Commission Meeting 0 days
15t Budget Reading
Regular Scheduled Commission Meeting 0 days

2nd Budget Reading

Wed 4/8/20
Wkt 8514520
Wed 4722720

Wed 1/E20
P 451,020
Mon 5/4,/20

Fri /17720 Muon A/20/20

P AF 20520 Fr 27249520

PAcn 42720 Mon 579,20
e 020
Thu &/9720
Tuw 5520
Mon 5711720

Fri /24720
FrA 5120
Thu 5720
Mon 511720

Tue 5F125200 Fi 5715020
Tue 571220
Tue 5,/12/20
Thit 542170
Mon B/1/20

Wed 00500
Wed 5/20/20
Fri Sfa0 0

Won Bf1720

Tue 6/2/20  Fri Gf5,20

Mon 5/8/20 Mon 6/Bf20

Mon 6/22/20 Mon 6/22/20

: 1mie,Shaunna.Ehris.Hentun,lnrr'l.r,ﬂumr,l]\tn
.Chris Jesry Kenlon,Shaunna Roger, T

Ry

Eglﬁhau nna

g Chrisderry, Kenton,Shawnna, Tamm

wm Chriv, lesrmy, Kemtoon Shaun mi, T2

E sy Kertom, Rita, Cathy
Coamnaaana-kenton, Shaunna, Daniel {01)

-] Shaunni
11

Kenten Shaun na

kgl Hentunrﬁitarﬁhaunlg'la

B shaunna
- 61

:E /8

ask: Marrn: Duralizn f‘;:.r.il‘r. E-'II'I =h aril 1 Py 1 | I 1
izt A a5 | epn 5ps | sp7 s | ene
FYZ020-21 Budget Planning Schedule 56 days Mon 4067/ 20 Mon 6/ 22 2 P P —
Capital Flanning with Department Heads 1 day Wed /820 Wed af8/20 X

 Henten, Rita Shaunna

gl}‘ Hc‘ntun..‘.-'n-lﬂ ay

i

i

Fape |




MEMO

TO: Franklin City Commission

FROM: Scott Crabtree

DATE: February 6, 2020

SUBJECT: Ordinance regarding Planning and Zoning and Building Inspector Duties

Attached is an ordinance to make revisions to the existing ordinances as required by the Kentucky
Revised Statutes and some additions that are required for the Level III Building Inspector program. If
it meets the Commission’s approval, we will need two sponsors for the ordinance, and we can have
first reading during the ordinance portion of the meeting.

Proposed action: Need 2 sponsors for the attached ordinance.

P. 42



Sponsors:

Second Reading:
Publication Date:

ORDINANCE NO. 2020 - 002

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF FRANKLIN, KENTUCKY
RELATING TO THE CITY/COUNTY BUILDING INSPECTOR PROGRAM
AND AMENDING SECTIONS 151.15, 151.16, 151.18, 152.01, AND 153.02
OF THE CITY OF FRANKLIN CODE OF ORDINANCES AND ADDING SECTION 11.5
TO THE FRANKLIN-SIMPSON PLANNING AND ZONING REGULATIONS

WHEREAS, there have been changes to the Kentucky Revised Statutes that require certain changes to the
existing ordinances; and

WHEREAS, it has come to the Board of Commissioner’s attention, upon recommendation from certain
staff members, that there is a need for an appeals process from decisions made by the City/County building
inspector; and

WHEREAS, the Board. of City Commissioners has recognized a need to identify the types of structures that
will be inspected if and when Franklin and Simpson County is granted expanded jurisdiction to review and inspect
commercial buildings, and the Board wishes to implement and adopt this ordinance setting these parameters; and

WHEREAS, it is the opinion and judgment of the Board of Commissioners of the City of Franklin that it is
necessary to amend the existing ordinances and/or regulations to reflect the changes as set forth herein; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the City of Franklin, Kentucky, acting by and through its
Board of Commissioners as follows:

Section 151.15 is hereby amended as follows:
§ 151.15 BUILDING CODE ADOPTED.

(A) The 2015 International Building Code, as promulgated in 815 KAR 7:120 by the Board of Housing,
Buildings and Construction of the Commonwealth, is hereby adopted as the mandatory building code for all
buildings constructed in the City, except that the Kentucky amendments in the 2018 Kentucky Building Code shall
supersede any conflicting provision in the 2015 International Building Code. These codes are incorporated herein
by reference and adopted in full as an ordinance of the city as if set out at length herein. The City further adopts and
incorporates herein by reference any and all changes and amendments made, from time to time, by the Board of
Housing, Buildings, and Construction to the mandatory building code(s) for the Commonwealth (hereinafter referred
to collectively as the “State Building Code”) whether set forth in 815 KAR 7:120 or otherwise.

(B) A copy of current State Building Code together with a copy of all other regulations or NFPA Pamphlets
adopted or referred to thereunder, shall be kept in the Franklin-Simpson Planning and Zoning Office, and that office
shall at all times keep and maintain a current copy of said building code for public reference.

(C) An attested copy of this subchapter shall be transmitted to the Department Housing, Buildings and
Construction of the Commonwealth to the extent necessary or required.

Section 151.16 is hereby amended as follows:
§ 151.16 ENFORCEMENT.

The Franklin-Simpson Planning and Zoning Commission, by and through the local City/County Building
Inspector shall be designated local enforcement agent/agency for the State Building Code and State Residential
Code. The local City/County building inspector shall serve as the inspector and/or on-site inspector for all
applicable structure plan reviews and/or inspections made in accordance with any and all state and/or local
ordinances, resolutions, rules or regulations, and the City/County Building Inspector’s duties shall include, but not
be limited to plan review and inspections of all commercial and residential structures to the extent permitted or
allowed by the Commonwealth of Kentucky and this ordinance. Provided, however, that the local City/County
Building Inspector shall not conduct plan reviews and inspections on the following: all buildings, structures, or

P. 43



property classified as High-Hazard Group H under all applicable sections of the State Building Code including, but
not limited to Section 307 of said code; and all buildings, structures, and property classified as Institutional Group I-
1, I-2, and I-3 under all applicable sections of the State Building Code including, but not limited to Section 308 and
408 of said code.

Section 151.18 shall be deleted in its entirety as follows:
Section 152.01 shall be amended as follows:
§ 152.01 RESIDENTIAL CODE AND INSPECTIONS.

(A) The 2015 International Residential Code for One (1) and Two (2) Family Dwellings (IRC) shall be the
mandatory city residential building code for all single-family dwellings, two (2) family dwellings, and townhouses
constructed in the city, except that the Kentucky amendments in the 2018 Residential Code shall supersede any
conflicting provision in the 2015 IRC (hereinafter referred to collectively as the “Residential Code™). The
Residential Code is incorporated herein by reference and adopted in full as an ordinance of the city as if set out in
length herein. Further, any subsequent changes or amendments to the Residential Code made by the Board of
Housing, Buildings, and Construction or other duly authorized agency or body is hereby adopted for regulating the
design, construction, quality of materials, erection, installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement,
addition to, use or maintenance of one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses not more than three stories in
height in the city, and each and all of the regulations, provisions, conditions and terms of such Residential Code,
and/or subsequent revisions thereto, shall be kept on file in the Franklin-Simpson Planning and Zoning Office, and
that office shall at all times keep and maintain a current copy of said Residential Code for public reference.

(B) In accordance with KRS 198B.060(1), permits, inspections, and certificates of occupancy shall be required for a
single-family residence or dwelling, with the costs of said permits, inspections, and certificates of occupancy being
set forth in Ordinance 2019-24 and/or by and through other ordinances, resolutions, or regulations.

(C) All residential occupancies that are not single-family dwellings, two-family dwellings, or townhouses shall
comply with the provisions of Section 151.15 of this Code of Ordinances.

153.02 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE ADOPTED.

There is hereby adopted pursuant to the applicable sections of the Kentucky Revised Statutes and the State
Building Code, for the purpose of establishing rules and regulations for the installation, maintenance and repair of
electrical wiring, apparatus or equipment for light, heat or power inside or attached to buildings within the
jurisdiction of the city, or attached to the service company’s lines, a certain code known as the National Electric
Code NFPA 70, the edition of which is adopted by and through the State Building Code, a copy of which shall be
kept on file in the Planning and Zoning Office for public review. In the event that this edition of the National
Electrical Code is revised subsequent to the adoption of this chapter, the city hereby adopts the most recent
publication or edition of the National Electrical Code. Further, all structures shall be inspected by the local Electrical
Inspector using the edition of the National Electrical Code that was in existence as of the date the permit for the
structure to be inspected was obtained.

There shall be added a new Article 11.15 to the Franklin-Simpson Planning and Zoning Regulations which
shall read as follows:

11.15 Appeals from Decisions of Local Building Inspector:

(A) Establishment of the Building Inspector Appeals Board: Pursuant to KRS 198B.070(3), any party to a
decision by the local building inspector may appeal that decision to the local appeals board which shall be known as
the “Building Inspector Appeals Board.” This Board shall consist of five (5) members who are technically qualified
and have professional experience related to the building industry.

(B) Membership on the Appeals Board, How Appointed, and Miscellaneous Provisions: The Building Inspector
Appeals Board members shall be chosen as follows:

1. Three (3) members shall be chosen by the County Judge Executive with approval from the Simpson
Fiscal Court; and,

P. 44



2. Two (2) members shall be chosen by the Mayor of the City of Franklin with approval from the City of
Franklin Board of City Commissioners.

3. Term of Office: The initial members appointed by the County Judge Executive shall serve a term of one
(1), two (2), or three (3) years at the discretion of the County Judge Executive with the approval of the Simpson
Fiscal Court. Likewise, the initial members appointed by the Mayor shall serve a term of one (1) or two (2) years at
the discretion of the Mayor with the approval of the Board of City Commissioners. After the initial term, all
members shall serve for a term of three (3) years. Further, any member may be reappointed subject to the approval
of the respective legislative body.

4. Removal from Office: A board member may be removed from office by the legislative authority for
misconduct, inefficiency, or willful neglect of duty. The legislative authority shall submit a written statement to the
member and the legislative body setting forth the reasons for removal. The member so removed shall have the right
of appeal to the Circuit Court.

5. Oath of Office: Members of the board shall, before entering upon the duties of their office, take the oath
of office as prescribed by Section 228 of the Kentucky Constitution.

C. Time for Appeal and Hearing: Upon receipt of an appeal from a qualified party, the Building Inspector
Appeals Board shall convene a hearing to consider the appeal within fifteen (15) days of receipt. All parties to the
appeal shall be notified of the time and place of the hearing by letter mailed certified mail no later than ten (10) days
prior to the date of the hearing. The Building Inspector Appeals Board shall render a decision within five %)
working days after the hearing.

D. Results of Building Inspector Appeals Board Decisions and Appeals from the Board: The Building Inspector
Appeals Board may uphold, amend, or reverse the decision of the City/County building inspector. There is no
appeal from the Building Inspector Appeals Board other than by appeal to the Commonwealth of Kentucky Board of
Housing, Buildings, and Construction pursuant to KRS 198B.070.

If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion of this Ordinance is for any reason held
invalid or unconstitutional by any court of competent jurisdiction, such portion shall be deemed a separate, distinct,
and independent provision, and such holding shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions hereof. All
ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are, to the extent of such conflict, hereby repealed.

FIRST READING

SECOND READING

At a meeting of the City Commission of the City of Franklin, Kentucky, held on ,
on motion made by and seconded by ,
the foregoing ordinance was adopted, after full discussion, by the following vote:

BROWNIE BENNETT
JAMIE POWELL
HERBERT WILLIAMS
WENDELL STEWART
LARRY DIXON, MAYOR

APPROVED BY:

" Larry Dixon, Mayor
ATTEST:

Cathy Dillard, City Clerk

Page 3 of 3
P. 45



ORDINANCES

P. 46



Sponsors:

Second Reading:
Publication Date:

ORDINANCE NO. 2020 - 002

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF FRANKLIN, KENTUCKY
RELATING TO THE CITY/COUNTY BUILDING INSPECTOR PROGRAM
AND AMENDING SECTIONS 151.15, 151.16, 151.18, 152.01, AND 153.02
OF THE CITY OF FRANKLIN CODE OF ORDINANCES AND ADDING SECTION 11.5
TO THE FRANKLIN-SIMPSON PLANNING AND ZONING REGULATIONS

WHEREAS, there have been changes to the Kentucky Revised Statutes that require certain changes to the
existing ordinances; and

WHEREAS, it has come to the Board of Commissioner’s attention, upon recommendation from certain
staff members, that there is a need for an appeals process from decisions made by the City/County building
inspector; and

WHEREAS, the Board of City Commissioners has recognized a need to identify the types of structures that
will be inspected if and when Franklin and Simpson County is granted expanded jurisdiction to review and inspect
commercial buildings, and the Board wishes to implement and adopt this ordinance setting these parameters; and

WHEREAS, it is the opinion and judgment of the Board of Commissioners of the City of Franklin that it is
necessary to amend the existing ordinances and/or regulations to reflect the changes as set forth herein; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the City of Franklin, Kentucky, acting by and through its
Board of Commissioners as follows:

Section 151.15 is hereby amended as follows:
§ 151.15 BUILDING CODE ADOPTED.

(A) The 2015 International Building Code, as promulgated in 815 KAR 7:120 by the Board of Housing,
Buildings and Construction of the Commonwealth, is hereby adopted as the mandatory building code for all
buildings constructed in the City, except that the Kentucky amendments in the 2018 Kentucky Building Code shall
supersede any conflicting provision in the 2015 International Building Code. These codes are incorporated herein
by reference and adopted in full as an ordinance of the city as if set out at length herein. The City further adopts and
incorporates herein by reference any and all changes and amendments made, from time to time, by the Board of
Housing, Buildings, and Construction to the mandatory building code(s) for the Commonwealth (hereinafter referred
to collectively as the “State Building Code”) whether set forth in 815 KAR 7:120 or otherwise.

(B) A copy of current State Building Code together with a copy of all other regulations or NFPA Pamphlets
adopted or referred to thereunder, shall be kept in the Franklin-Simpson Planning and Zoning Office, and that office
shall at all times keep and maintain a current copy of said building code for public reference.

(C) Anattested copy of this subchapter shall be transmitted to the Department Housing, Buildings and
Construction of the Commonwealth to the extent necessary or required.

Section 151.16 is hereby amended as follows:
§ 151.16 ENFORCEMENT.

The Franklin-Simpson Planning and Zoning Commission, by and through the local City/County Building
Inspector shall be designated local enforcement agent/agency for the State Building Code and State Residential
Code. The local City/County building inspector shall serve as the inspector and/or on-site inspector for all
applicable structure plan reviews and/or inspections made in accordance with any and all state and/or local
ordinances, resolutions, rules or regulations, and the City/County Building Inspector’s duties shall include, but not
be limited to plan review and inspections of all commercial and residential structures to the extent permitted or
allowed by the Commonwealth of Kentucky and this ordinance. Provided, however, that the local City/County
Building Inspector shall not conduct plan reviews and inspections on the following: all buildings, structures, or

P. 47




property classified as High-Hazard Group H under all applicable sections of the State Building Code including, but

not limited to Section 307 of said code; and all buildings, structures, and property classified as Institutional Group I-
1, 1I-2, and I-3 under all applicable sections of the State Building Code including, but not limited to Section 308 and

408 of said code.

Section 151.18 shall be deleted in its entirety as follows:
Section 152.01 shall be amended as follows:
§ 152.01 RESIDENTIAL CODE AND INSPECTIONS.

(A) The 2015 International Residential Code for One (1) and Two (2) Family Dwellings (IRC) shall be the
mandatory city residential building code for all single-family dwellings, two (2) family dwellings, and townhouses
constructed in the city, except that the Kentucky amendments in the 2018 Residential Code shall supersede any
conflicting provision in the 2015 IRC (hereinafter referred to collectively as the “Residential Code™). The
Residential Code is incorporated herein by reference and adopted in full as an ordinance of the city as if set out in
length herein. Further, any subsequent changes or amendments to the Residential Code made by the Board of
Housing, Buildings, and Construction or other duly authorized agency or body is hereby adopted for regulating the
design, construction, quality of materials, erection, installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement,
addition to, use or maintenance of one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses not more than three stories in
height in the city, and each and all of the regulations, provisions, conditions and terms of such Residential Code,
and/or subsequent revisions thereto, shall be kept on file in the Franklin-Simpson Planning and Zoning Office, and
that office shall at all times keep and maintain a current copy of said Residential Code for public reference.

(B) In accordance with KRS 198B.060(1), permits, inspections, and certificates of occupancy shall be required for a
single-family residence or dwelling, with the costs of said permits, inspections, and certificates of occupancy being
set forth in Ordinance 2019-24 and/or by and through other ordinances, resolutions, or regulations.

(C) All residential occupancies that are not single-family dwellings, two-family dwellings, or townhouses shall
comply with the provisions of Section 151.15 of this Code of Ordinances.

153.02 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE ADOPTED.

There is hereby adopted pursuant to the applicable sections of the Kentucky Revised Statutes and the State
Building Code, for the purpose of establishing rules and regulations for the installation, maintenance and repair of
electrical wiring, apparatus or equipment for light, heat or power inside or attached to buildings within the
jurisdiction of the city, or attached to the service company’s lines, a certain code known as the National Electric
Code NFPA 70, the edition of which is adopted by and through the State Building Code, a copy of which shall be
kept on file in the Planning and Zoning Office for public review. In the event that this edition of the National
Electrical Code is revised subsequent to the adoption of this chapter, the city hereby adopts the most recent
publication or edition of the National Electrical Code. Further, all structures shall be inspected by the local Electrical
Inspector using the edition of the National Electrical Code that was in existence as of the date the permit for the
structure to be inspected was obtained.

There shall be added a new Article 11.15 to the Franklin-Simpson Planning and Zoning Regulations which
shall read as follows:

11.15 Appeals from Decisions of Local Building Inspector:

(A) Establishment of the Building Inspector Appeals Board: Pursuant to KRS 198B.070(3), any party to a
decision by the local building inspector may appeal that decision to the local appeals board which shall be known as
the “Building Inspector Appeals Board.” This Board shall consist of five (5) members who are technically qualified
and have professional experience related to the building industry.

(B) Membership on the Appeals Board, How Appointed, and Miscellaneous Provisions: The Building Inspector
Appeals Board members shall be chosen as follows:

1. Three (3) members shall be chosen by the County Judge Executive with approval from the Simpson
Fiscal Court; and,

P. 48



2. Two (2) members shall be chosen by the Mayor of the City of Franklin with approval from the City of
Franklin Board of City Commissioners.

3. Term of Office: The initial members appointed by the County Judge Executive shall serve a term of one
(1), two (2), or three (3) years at the discretion of the County Judge Executive with the approval of the Simpson
Fiscal Court. Likewise, the initial members appointed by the Mayor shall serve a term of one (1) or two (2) years at
the discretion of the Mayor with the approval of the Board of City Commissioners. After the initial term, all
members shall serve for a term of three (3) years. Further, any member may be reappointed subject to the approval
of the respective legislative body. .

4. Removal from Office: A board member may be removed from office by the legislative authority for
misconduct, inefficiency, or willful neglect of duty. The legislative authority shall submit a written statement to the
member and the legislative body setting forth the reasons for removal. The member so removed shall have the right
of appeal to the Circuit Court.

5. Oath of Office: Members of the board shall, before entering upon the duties of their office, take the oath
of office as prescribed by Section 228 of the Kentucky Constitution.

C. Time for Appeal and Hearing: Upon receipt of an appeal from a qualified party, the Building Inspector
Appeals Board shall convene a hearing to consider the appeal within fifteen (15) days of receipt. All parties to the
appeal shall be notified of the time and place of the hearing by letter mailed certified mail no later than ten (10) days
prior to the date of the hearing. The Building Inspector Appeals Board shall render a decision within five (%)
working days after the hearing.

D. Results of Building Inspector Appeals Board Decisions and Appeals from the Board: The Building Inspector
Appeals Board may uphold, amend, or reverse the decision of the City/County building inspector. There is no
appeal from the Building Inspector Appeals Board other than by appeal to the Commonwealth of Kentucky Board of
Housing, Buildings, and Construction pursuant to KRS 198B.070.

If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion of this Ordinance is for any reason held
invalid or unconstitutional by any court of competent jurisdiction, such portion shall be deemed a separate, distinct,
and independent provision, and such holding shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions hereof. All
ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are, to the extent of such conflict, hereby repealed.

FIRST READING

SECOND READING

At a meeting of the City Commission of the City of Franklin, Kentucky, held on ,
on motion made by and seconded by ,
the foregoing ordinance was adopted, after full discussion, by the following vote:

BROWNIE BENNETT
JAMIE POWELL
HERBERT WILLIAMS
WENDELL STEWART

LARRY DIXON, MAYOR

APPROVED BY:
Larry Dixon, Mayor
ATTEST:
Cathy Dillard, City Clerk
Page 3 of 3

P. 49



