

BID EVALUATION - CITY OF SAGINAW PURCHASING

P1897-23, CEMETERIES GROUNDS MAINTENANCE
 OPENING: 10/18/22
 CE PAGE 1 OF 3

REQ: #

ACCOUNT: #

			APARTMENT SERVICES COMPANY, INC. LIVONIA, MI MILES KORTE MKORTE@APARTMENTSERVICESCOMPANY.NET	BELL LANDSCAPING SAGINAW, MI PARKER MORLEY PARKER@BELLMICHIGAN.COM	
		UOM EA			
	YEAR 1				
1	FOREST LAWN CEMETERY SPRING CLEAN-UP	1	TOTAL \$19,800.00	TOTAL \$20,900.00	TOTAL \$
2	FOREST LAWN CEMETERY FALL LEAF REMOVAL	1	TOTAL \$29,700.00	TOTAL \$25,850.00	TOTAL \$
3	FOREST LAWN CEMETERY MOWING & TRIMMING	21	UNIT \$9,900.00 TOTAL \$207,900.00	UNIT \$8,580.00 TOTAL \$180,180.00	UNIT \$ TOTAL \$
4	OAKWOOD CEMETERY SPRING CLEAN-UP	1	TOTAL \$9,900.00	TOTAL \$9,500.00	TOTAL \$
5	OAKWOOD CEMETERY FALL LEAF REMOVAL	1	TOTAL \$14,850.00	TOTAL \$11,750.00	TOTAL \$
6	OAKWOOD CEMETERY MOWING & TRIMMING	21	UNIT \$4,950.00 TOTAL \$103,950.00	UNIT \$3,900.00 TOTAL \$81,900.00	UNIT \$ TOTAL \$
7	BRADY HILL CEMETERY SPRING CLEAN-UP	1	TOTAL \$3,300.00	TOTAL \$3,040.00	TOTAL \$
8	BRADY HILL CEMETERY FALL LEAF REMOVAL	1	TOTAL \$3,300.00	TOTAL \$3,760.00	TOTAL \$
9	BRADY HILL CEMETERY MOWING & TRIMMING	21	UNIT \$1,650.00 TOTAL \$34,650.00	UNIT \$1,248.00 TOTAL \$26,208.00	UNIT \$ TOTAL \$
	TOTAL COST FOR YEAR 1		\$427,350.00	\$363,088.00	

BID EVALUATION - CITY OF SAGINAW PURCHASING

P1897-23, CEMETERIES GROUNDS MAINTENANCE
 OPENING: 10/18/22
 CE PAGE 2 OF 3

REQ: #

ACCOUNT: #

			APARTMENT SERVICES COMPANY, INC. LIVONIA, MI MILES KORTE MKORTE@APARTMENTSERVICESCOMPANY.NET	BELL LANDSCAPING SAGINAW, MI PARKER MORLEY PARKER@BELLMICHIGAN.COM	
		UOM EA			
	YEAR 2				
1	FOREST LAWN CEMETERY SPRING CLEAN-UP	1	TOTAL \$21,780.00	TOTAL \$ NO BID	TOTAL \$
2	FOREST LAWN CEMETERY FALL LEAF REMOVAL	1	TOTAL \$32,670.00	TOTAL \$ NO BID	TOTAL \$
3	FOREST LAWN CEMETERY MOWING & TRIMMING	21	UNIT \$10,890.00 TOTAL \$228,690.00	UNIT \$ NO BID TOTAL \$	UNIT \$ TOTAL \$
4	OAKWOOD CEMETERY SPRING CLEAN-UP	1	TOTAL \$10,890.00	TOTAL \$ NO BID	TOTAL \$
5	OAKWOOD CEMETERY FALL LEAF REMOVAL	1	TOTAL \$16,335.00	TOTAL \$ NO BID	TOTAL \$
6	OAKWOOD CEMETERY MOWING & TRIMMING	21	UNIT \$5,445.00 TOTAL \$114,345.00	UNIT \$ NO BID TOTAL \$	UNIT \$ TOTAL \$
7	BRADY HILL CEMETERY SPRING CLEAN-UP	1	TOTAL \$3,630.00	TOTAL \$ NO BID	TOTAL \$
8	BRADY HILL CEMETERY FALL LEAF REMOVAL	1	TOTAL \$3,630.00	TOTAL \$ NO BID	TOTAL \$
9	BRADY HILL CEMETERY MOWING & TRIMMING	21	UNIT \$1,815.00 TOTAL \$38,115.00	UNIT \$ NO BID TOTAL \$	UNIT \$ TOTAL \$
	TOTAL COST FOR YEAR 2		\$470,085.00	\$0	

BID EVALUATION - CITY OF SAGINAW PURCHASING

P1897-23, CEMETERIES GROUNDS MAINTENANCE
 OPENING: 10/18/22
 CE PAGE 3 OF 3

REQ: #

ACCOUNT: #

			APARTMENT SERVICES COMPANY, INC. LIVONIA, MI MILES KORTE MKORTE@APARTMENTSERVICESCOMPANY.NET	BELL LANDSCAPING SAGINAW, MI PARKER MORLEY PARKER@BELLMICHIGAN.COM	
		UOM EA			
	YEAR 3				
1	FOREST LAWN CEMETERY SPRING CLEAN-UP	1	TOTAL \$23,958.00	TOTAL \$ NO BID	TOTAL \$
2	FOREST LAWN CEMETERY FALL LEAF REMOVAL	1	TOTAL \$35,937.00	TOTAL \$ NO BID	TOTAL \$
3	FOREST LAWN CEMETERY MOWING & TRIMMING	21	UNIT \$11,979.00 TOTAL \$251,559.00	UNIT \$ NO BID TOTAL \$	UNIT \$ TOTAL \$
4	OAKWOOD CEMETERY SPRING CLEAN-UP	1	TOTAL \$11,979.00	TOTAL \$ NO BID	TOTAL \$
5	OAKWOOD CEMETERY FALL LEAF REMOVAL	1	TOTAL \$17,969.00	TOTAL \$ NO BID	TOTAL \$
6	OAKWOOD CEMETERY MOWING & TRIMMING	21	UNIT \$5,990.00 TOTAL \$125,790.00	UNIT \$ NO BID TOTAL \$	UNIT \$ TOTAL \$
7	BRADY HILL CEMETERY SPRING CLEAN-UP	1	TOTAL \$3,993.00	TOTAL \$ NO BID	TOTAL \$
8	BRADY HILL CEMETERY FALL LEAF REMOVAL	1	TOTAL \$3,993.00	TOTAL \$ NO BID	TOTAL \$
9	BRADY HILL CEMETERY MOWING & TRIMMING	21	UNIT \$1,997.00 TOTAL \$41,937.00	UNIT \$ NO BID TOTAL \$	UNIT \$ TOTAL \$
	TOTAL COST FOR YEAR 3		\$ 517,115.00	\$0	
	ADDENDUM INCLUDED:		YES	YES	
	BID BOND INCLUDED:		YES	YES	
	PAYMENT TERMS:		NET 30	NET 30	
	DELIVERY LEAD TIME:		DEC. 1 ST 2022	N/A	